EACE LR WWW.govtpressmp.nic.in
T oft TRA dre fRar S Tk .

wHH 8] A, g¥ar, feqis 7 SHadt 2015—1 17, 96 1936

fafyr ofir faurh = faum
Wrare, feqis 7 SHeR) 2015

. 153-6-FFRIH~31- (W, ) -3, — ey faum gar &1 frofafaa sfufee g w foiw 6 st 2015
1 T HEIGT I STA W 81 G §, TASE, HATHn ht SFH & o wepitna fear wman 2.

ey yT St

FAE 3 T 034

LYY & TSI & AW ¥ qUT TRUEER,

ey gur foardt, squfes.

eyl 9 (fgdia doirem ) afufEm, Ro0e%

Gt T SR g
YR ¥-%F H G,
R ¥ T TN,
YRT Q¢ H HIMEA.
HRT 0 T TN,
YRI Ro-%F o HIMEM.
I ¥ FHT HINEA.
YN 3%-F HT 3 TAH.
TR 39 1 HIMA.
YR Yo T TN,
YR ¥E T HOEH,
R 4e T HIMEH.
Y €3 1 HINE,
STIE-2 1 TN,
STIE-] F HIMEA,
T aen s,

PN G MW

-
[

A0 NN N N0 0
PE R D



YRS NI, fedier 7 sedt 2015

wiw A i

HRT ¥-&F &T

HegayT Afufram

FHH 3 T 034
qeEmeyr 9 (g denem) sifufam, Roex

[feriien & S, joqy 1 TSI Y TG W g; orHia ¢ neamew wstas (srgremen) ' H fadi o SHel, R0y &
FUFS YT o T8, ],

neAuayr a2 Afufad, 007 @ R Hyhfu Wt ¥q aifufEm
IR TR % Toad ad # neryRy faum-ted gri Frefafed v # o8 eifufrafia € —
R (R) 39 efufem o1 dfere s/ weayey 92 (Heied) erfufrem, 02
(R) () 38 &RMgA Afafam &t o/ 3 % @ve () & ey g o1d, oot ¥ AW BN,

(@) 39 Heied Afufm = 9w 3 % wve () F STEY R oTE, Ro0g HY AT ITF ITEI
TRY BN Al HeEfyEt wany g, |

(1) T HHA AfuFEE i uW 3 F wWos (AH), 2R SR 23 ¥ SUSY ALAwy IS H THH
YERH TG UG g

(%) 39 goned sifufem % 99 Sy gg fEamsR, R09¥ ¥ YgW §U wHY SIE

R. WA F2 SAUFRM, 003 (3HHE R0 T ReoR) (S 3uH TWh Gve qul syt &
T ¥ ffde ) & g/ v-w H, SR (3) ¥, W o W, Frefaied wwge st e S,
i —
't st TEt el w1 faer s emew # faffde T Y Saa wemafy & ot @
fenan S B, =6l e oS, =it gW sw ffiw v R T emeed W SR uw
HYE B W W fE o & foer § faeie st % wror w6l gen ¥, =
B AT B HeISL WY AT IHH 9FT B FHreary & v ¥ gig % forg, wow endie
H ey WA §F % IvEg AR ¥ Fel iR 29 F e yiea % GHged WA
F YEE W TF o) § ey 87 Heiel AW H Femay & fog e §
grgm‘77

3. o SUfE| & A gy H,—

(TH) 399W (%) ¥, @vs (F) ¥, fgda wgs & v, fFrefafeg s it
feran S, ererf
" oredteRter ¢ el feRelt fafmior @Y wfRar @ ST { % We-Wig STEEN ) R A W
BT &, I8l o X R w GOA], S H O S 2 IR ST ] F
W ffHa At % qou & U § fauem w9 F uvEe, St s,
() SN (3) & M W, Frfafea svam wenfig &t o, el —

“(3) W AR % A fre WeEiea R g e e @t e udt dfa | S
for forfea &l wm, 59 stfufem & om0 =i fagra o tfufam, ejue (2]uE
1% % AT IHF G <F forelt Y, sarer IR wnfed & Tgg Ao i Sa,
AR sfey, afg w1 7Y, 1 TeEwEd od § geEE g em sgE s g
R afe e Tt s ST € @ geT fad ad & e frulkor % e hem
% w9 § weH foran Smam.

(7)) 3w (8) #, @ve (At) #, qoi fawm & wum W ergfavm wenfya fepan o el
sue yver frerfafea gve o< wenfaa e s, sl —

"(29) 39 A % wey H, e faw, e @ vl | faga REea =l g1
IEH FuEitia S USRS o1 T GaO-u5 1 R STl q




[y e, fedis 7 Sadt 2015

16 (1)

¥, WA efutrm wouw g B —

(TH)  Swum (%) H g (9) ¥, v U9 e9R T % oifuehdy % e wd gy
HihH & Y% G & faw 7o w0 ) i’ & wr W, v rer g9R e
% Afoeran & T WU g, T dy foew & safaw & fae werg v i
Wt R AT 39F TN T Th g WA s afer’’ wenfm e wig;

(q) 3uEW (&) H U TE weR ¥ WH W IR T R i R o

zﬁqw e afufer sl urr 30 H, IUEW (R) % yvenE, frefafed suum e #t s,
3 —

“(R) (%) 39 uW A 3w afufm & et o swsly o Rt gfasget s % ofafdw €l
B o, 30 srfufem & ool foredl wrfanfell % <R, aft sge &1 womem |
ST & TR R 1 eTueem o T ® 1 o STveEE @ Sve § A R e wel-
HEl Yohe T fwn T ¥ W wa O faww & el o GoyawRr # omeg T %
1 TTed Th W GG FE Tl wiemafiEl @ sty & g6y § el =
B Sy A X e &1 g fman wan €, o e el e e ads 9 fEe
TR, @ AYE T AR B G 3R G T Yl SR 3 % R,
TY 9FRR a1 T6 & oy § U8 Ui & & &1 9Rer w9

(@) 39 3TN & o fruie Weifya ad & deiy & fafia fafor & sifafea €

(m) 34 IUYRT o A Tauifg o defug od & Tt frafta fufon & afafem =21
STE. .

& A AUFEE ® R 0% H, IUNRT () H, WK, FIGH SN 37F 4R R0 H SUHN ()
F TgH H iR Wied =l @ ) & wE W, TR, $IeF iR S CUR R0 # SUEN
(2) & gF | fifde FEiea =l aean am o %) S9an (3) & o9 o e o % i
1 T H G Wi =R @ fa="! sty e S

o, o AffEE H Um ¥ H, ITEW (W) H, WU (W) H, @S, i o wee (%) qu
(W' & WE W, FSF, 3 R I= (), (¥) T (W) " Tl g S

¢. A AfufEm # g 3 % gvEn, efate g st enfaa s e, erefq —

“3%-m () BT ¥R R0 & TN (¥) & @ (&) H Ffide fadt = 1 et Fematy
% foau o fraitor & ) wraE) 3, St faga ot afufem, Qjus (R]us &
%) % AL HIEOT-TF WA T FA h RO AU & F okl I @ @ i faeh
ITSW BRI Tohan < €, Y S0 Sweh Tl ¥ S1fuehr o1 TR & iR 39% saat
H, T8 IR &) e & IR 9 @9 o & sy, fafor wiivert =7 39 seon
I YA F TG SR T, S e welel T § aifuew et B, Ko wm &
faq smaes A & faeew B

(R) S9N (2) & 37¢fA iR ¥9g fEu oM ¥ o1¥ed &« aF Ueu &1 fhar Som s«
T foh 3T WY AR} g WHHR &l TE WY F W-T1Y 6T Ty v sk qHy
% YT BT Feled A A1 Ik 9N % o ke st % 9w wfive % wuge
T & TR F FHIEEYS Fe[ Gord | e w8

(3) U (R) F YT 9 U B W, fuRe wiftsit 38 qusmeten ofk wew &
#R U TU g % SRH, 99 WA @ agel wi |/

W AR, 38 fRU T I @ e B9 % qd ok wm, S gl et S et
HE W ek TET B0, AU S ¥, STHR (R) Y STET S STuTer 3 v Sae
T TR

gHT ¢ &7

YT o &T

YRT Ro0-Th T

T ¥ @7

HyireA.

oI IY-TFH HT
I TOITO,

el afiftaft
¥ Frafor wemor
qa: e &l
vife.



16 (2) qeyRy USvs, feAim 7 e 2015

(¥)  3UEN (3) ¥ i feu T wma F <R, e fufor w99 siwon-
TS % W, IHH IR AR ¥ G SIRY H ¥ SMART HX TR, W
HIE IR Tl St % SR had T ar € w0 T S,

(&)  ULR (¥) & e S9on-vsi % WY e ww g W, Frefor witert samad
BRI 316 ek WA 9 SEO-Te W faeR s F diftg weiee 5 A e 3=
NN AN AR 3T day §, SYUR (¥) F A0 3N Wi ht G F i helet
o i FHenafy & i, wfed TRy Wia wam,

(8) =i fruifa a5 oyel 39 4 % o1 Tt Wt § o Suem (u) F orefiw
fafreey w30 yohR Tufig @ qoid: @ 9mm: gereq e S €, dr st a
WA R IV a0E § S o ga w faion § oy % uve O e 3 |
¢ off, SUF YA F1 GG T 1 wIeaty F A emn 2 w5t syu () § oty

W AN gHA & ST g
gRT 39 wT R. & AYFEH w ¥R 39 H, IuYN (R) H v A F W, v s o s
gTTT Yo T go. W fUfTTd &t 9 Yo H, SUHR () H ¥ V'ww @' & WH W, v i | wenfya
gRT %% T 2. o sfufram w4 ve #,—
HoNEr.

(TH)  39ar (W) ¥, o8 eriter =1 fafeera 39 9 & fo’ & v W, oss ' 9% st
HIE ) FAEY & fow, iR SHh Tear = g 99 @ & T gfaee % wHged
AT WA & I T SAHHTH BT Heied 7 & wemafy & fog, wom ¥ gy
H Hhm," Tefid fou W,

(]) 39NN (&) H, QiR o T R Hiem wfyd e s, ok 5o ovem, fFrefafaa
TR St R S, Stutq —

Mg e IR g Ut i e % e ufae % omged WH 6 YR e fem
S 8, @ oTde 9 SR WY R Sgel MR ¥-% % ISl % STER wifi

FHT ..
qRT 4¢ &T . qa AfufEm & o we H, IUER (2) H, I A W 9 & 9t 9 IR WS oy
oiver. = (ST 39H 58 uvEr IResTEal & AW ¥ ffdE ¥) v F o yaw & ueen yud S et

At | T Ifvess 1w (Zifse ) fafea wwu qen OfF § erfyam wom”’ & wH W, e a
TH M 1 AT A RAEE ST A (S 59 5% gver uREsswdal & AW 9 Fly ¥) T
T 1o Yo % qeEq S1ae 8 At 3 ok, fod 91 9o A1 i o graas oIk ol fafed steeA-
N el UREETeRd g S e, f9eE @ @i o Twes STa Wi W@ |l TF H T yawm
% TR YW SIS G % S i ARl ¥ s eifiae uw (gifse ww) fafed wea qn dfa
o sifayme om’! wenfya feg S,

ORI &3 T 3. o AfUEg W) U e} H,—

HIEA,
() ud i 8 g ¢ SR T o ufiass o 9t TR sl & wE W, v e
w1 URERd w3 9 foed) safe o At &1 9ueRu W g fed safe ! onfa
fer W



YRR v, feaie 7 SHedt 2015

16 (3)

([ IR () H, v et aREeT e o e st ¥ wE W, veg Al ufteed
FH AT HIE fF A A H YUSKY W SAT hig oFfe ! wia fRu S,

(dF) vt §, woe () quiferm % T W srgfo wenfua fhan Sy ofR SEes v
frefafea @ wve srawenfia fen s, el —

() e T qUeRY e aten wfaa’’ H ferdt iR, wvemr, mem W@ fed o
TR o, STgt R = wfawhet % for wrer srvetia femen st ®, % ot a1 vgeremd
% Afafier, geiueh, WRHEE Afd qitafed €.

%, o Afufm =t sgE-g ®,—

(TH) ATHAF ¢ F & 9van, FAfafed omwdis iR so9 defug wfafgal siq:zenf
® WY, el —

‘2@ (7)) 9
(R) wEw
(3) ®W
(¥) FHREX
(W) ==
(8) W9 I
(W) TR @R
(¢) =S @R
(R) U2 fom
(20) TR fgR
(2?) drs fga
(2R) Hle R
(23) WAESR HRX
(%) =
(%) PR FA FHR
(R®) TH F1 @R
(RY9) Ure-ga fem
(2¢) &
(33) ¥ wER
(Ro) W
() &9 =
(RR) T =R

sgeE-¢ w7
wyirer.



16 (4)

Teqyey qos, feqis 7 skt 2015

(=N

(@) H HX

(R¥) Tl feer

(W) Hig A= wd Hie det WA
(R8) BERX

(R9) Tt iowiex

(R¢) BFR

(RR) B&X

(30) Hie SifeHhX
(3?) welESR sifeamet
(33) forrem

(33) g g
(3%) @er'’;

FATHHH ¢ F wRER, Frfafe stwdies ok 388 defya yfafeat ofqwenfaa =t
S, Steiq i—

“ xR, e, Sfeae, TiE, i, R, wHved au 3o damett # 9 (w
= SR o o wged § i B siew)

-3 WY R4, W Sfufrm Ay ey H, wm-dr 6,—

HYTeF.
(%)

(M

()

(=)

(=)

(%)

SFAIE ¢ F TG, FieW R H, v 'y v 9 wEiftod w1 e W m e
1 ugell BN AR W WH s’ w6 ol R g

ATHH® & T % IR= FrAfarea sTgwaie iR S8 Heifd o ofa et &t
mawfq:-—

‘Y e 8R q'

FATFAR R F & WA FEfafed s ok sug defua gfafy siawenfa =t
S, e —

3R @ At o fegimRe TEed Y
ST 3% iR SEd defug wiafsdl @1 @ e sy

FIHHF wo F TN F=fafea orwais ot sud deifya wfafsai siaenfoa =t
\_TITQ', 33{?ﬁ?L:—~
“yo . SirENfiE AW F ®Y F ST R o A K

SIIHATR 4 % W, HaF () #, 78 (¥) #H, 39 9 (IN) F TvE Fefate
IY HE SFq UMY 1 S, AU :—

“(ur) EEgHE TR




TEeY TSI, f§Aiw 7 SHed 2015 16 (5)

() STIRARR WY & @, Fad () d, I8 i Sras da (qen) ! % wE W,
vIeg 3R wiweE war (qEn), geeA 't i feu S,

(3M3)  AHATR W & THE, Hiem () ¥, v ' Fafepeda suoya o sraem’’ &
WH R, I fafeaa suords, s o wee-Y fren ! wifia faee S

(M) ATFWIF 9§ F WY FaT () H, v oo @ AR weiR & wE @, v
e ) g, foerd wd g weiA venfom e S

(Z9)  SATHHF Qo o THE, Fie (1) H, 755 dfer foer, 99, graiet’’ &1 &g f&an s,
RE. (%) HEAYRW 92 (TRIEH) TR, 0% (FHHIF ¥ T j0%¥) Tigghl FRAdd fohen <l &, P wen

(R) 3% ey & frfaa 1 gu off, Soa ety & onfig &1 W 1 W W W
FE FHAR 3@ AT & aar Svysdl F 1w w W s W Y T
Ut SE.

e, feqis 7 S 2015

. 154-6-FFRIE-31- (W) -3 —9Ra & dfaum & =T 348 & @WUg (3) ¥ (WU H, HeAwRy a2
(Tgdta wene) sifufrem, 2014 (AR 3 T 2015) 1 AUSH AR T & WIUHR ¥ TaggR T o
S %

TEIYRY F TSI F AT 9 G SIRTER,
e FaR faart, soafaa.

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 3 or 2015

THE MADHYA PRADESH VAT ( SECOND AMENDMENT) ACT, 2014
TABLE OF CONTENTS.

Sections:

Short title and commencement.
Amendment of Section 4-A.
Amendment of Section 14,
Amendment of Section 18.
Amendment of Section 20.
Amendment of Section 20-A.
Amendment of Section 24.
Insertion of Section 34-A.

R e S R

Amendment of Section 37.
Amendment of Section 40.

—
- O

Amendment of Section 46.

,_.
[

Amendment of Section 58.

—
W

Amendment of Section 62.
Amendment of Schedule 1.

Amendment of Schedule II.
Repeal and Savings.

—_
&

et —
o> &



16 (6) TEIYRy! quras, fgqiss 7 SHe 2015

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 3 or 2015

THE MADHYA PRADESH VAT (SECOND AMENDMENT) ACT, 2014

[Received the assent of the Governor on the 6th January, 2015; assent first published in the “Madhya Pradesh
Gazette (Extra-ordinary)”, dated the 7th January, 2015.]

An Act further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Vat Act, 2002.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the Sixty-fifth year of the Republic of India as
follows 1—

Short title, and 1. (1) This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Vat (Second Amendment) Act, 2014.
commencement.

2. (a) The provision of clause (i) of Section 3 of this Amendment Act shall be applicable
from 1st April, 2006;

(b) The provision of clause (ii) of Section 3 of this Amendment Act shall be applicable to
the periods commencing on or after Ist April, 2014;

(¢) The provisions of clause (iii) of Section 3, 12 and 13 of this Amendment Act shall
come into force from the date of its publication in the Madhya Pradesh Gazette;

(d) The remaining provisions of this Amendment Act shall be deemed to have come into
force from the 16th September, 2014.

Amgndment of 2. In Section 4-A of the Madhya Pradesh Vat Act, 2002 (No. 20 of 2002) (hereinafter referred
Section 4-A. to as the principal Act), in sub-section (3), for the proviso, the following proviso shall be
substituted, namely :—

“Provided that where such appeal is not so disposed of within the said period of stay as
specified in the order of stay, the Appellate Board shall, on an application made
in this behalf by the dealer and on being satisfied that the delay in disposing of
the appeal is not attributable to the dealer, extend the stay for a maximum period
of six calendar months at a time, on payment by the dealer of an amount equal
to five percent of the total balance due from the dealer after the order passed in
first appeal, for every extension of period of stay by six calendar months or
part thereof.”.

Amendment of 3. In Section 14 of the principal Act,—
Section 14.

(1) in sub-section (1), in clause (a), after the second proviso, the following explanation
shall be inserted, namely :—

“Explanation—Where a manufacturing process results in manufacture of Schedule-I
as well as Schedule-II goods, input tax rebate shall be computed after
apportioning the input tax in proportion to the value of Schedule-1 and
Schedule-II goods so manufactured.”;

(i) for sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely :—

“(3) The input tax rebate by a registered dealer under this Section shall be adjusted
in such manner as may be prescribed towards the tax, interest and penalty
payable by him under this Act or under the Central Sales Tax Act, 1956 (No.
74 of 1956). The balance, if any, may be carried over for adjustment in the
subsequent year and if not carried over, shall be granted by way of refund
after assessment of the relevant financial year.”;



HeqyRey NS, feqie 7 SHedt 2015

16 (1

(iii)

in sub-section (6), in clause (ix), for full stop, the semi-colon shall be substituted
and thereafter the following clause shall be inserted, namely :—

in respect of goods, the bill, invoice or cash memorandum of which does not
indicate registration certificate number of the purchasing registered dealer as
mentioned therein by the selling registered dealer.”.

4. In Section 18 of the principal Act,—

®

(i)

in sub-section (4), in clause (d), for the words “a sum of rupees fifty per day of

default subject to a maximum of rupees five thousand”, the words “a sum of
rupees fifty per day for first thirty days of default and thereafter a sum of rupees
one thousand per day, subject to a maximum of rupees fifty thousand” shall be
substituted;

in sub-section (4A), for the words “ten thousand”, the words “fifty thousand” shall

be substituted.

5. In Section 20 of the principal Act, after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall
be inserted, namely -—

“(2) (a) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in this Section or any other

(b)

©

provision of this Act, during the course of any proceedings under this Act, if
the Commissioner is satisfied that the tax has been evaded or sought to be evaded
or the tax liability has not been disclosed correctly or excess input tax rebate
has been claimed by any dealer in respect of any period or periods by not
recording or recording in incorrect manner, any transaction of sale or purchase,
or that any claim has been incorrectly made, then the Commissioner may, after
giving such dealer a notice and a reasonable opportunity of being heard, assess
the dealer to tax in respect of such transaction or claim.

The assessment under this sub-section shall be in addition to the regular
assessment in respect of the relevant year.

The tax assessed under this sub-section shall not be included in any regular
assessment of the relevant year.".

6. In section 20-A of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the words, bracket and figures
"other than the registered dealer referred to in the proviso to sub-section (1) of section 20 ", the
words, brackets and figures "other than the registered dealer referred to in the proviso to
sub- section (1) of Section 20 and the registered dealer claiming refund of input tax rebate under
sub-section (3) of Section 14”, shall be substituted.

7. In section 24 of the principal Act, in sub-section {5), in clause (b), for the brackets, figures
and word "(4) and (5)", the brackets, figures and word "(2), (4) and (5)" shall be substituted.

8. After section 34 of the principal Act, the following section shall be inserted, namely:—

“34-A. (1) Where in a proceeding for assessment of any dealer referred to in clause (a)

@)

of sub-section (4) of Section 20 for any period, the dealer has been assessed, by
an order, to tax at a higher rate on account of non-furnishing of declaration forms
under the Central Sales Tax Act, 1956 (No. 74 of 1956), he shall have the option
to forego his right to appeal and in lieu thereof, to apply, within thirty days from
the date of service of such order, to the assessing authority to grant him further

-time, not exceeding twenty four calendar months, to furnish remaining declaration

forms.

No application for granting further time under sub-section (1) shall be entertained
unless it is accompanied by satisfactory proof of payment of the amount admitted
by the dealer along with an amount equal to ten percent of the disputed balance
for every six calendar months or part thereof, of the further time applied for.

Amendment of
Section 18.

Amendment of
Section 20.

Amendment of
section 20-A.

Amendment of
section 24.

Insertion section
34-A.

Power to reopen
assessment case
in certain
circumstances.



16 (8) TeyRy UNTas, feais 7 Sad 2015

3) On receipt of the application under sub-section (1), the assessing authority shall
grant him further time as applied for and during the time granted, the recovery
of the balance amount shall remain stayed :

Provided that the dealer may, before expiry of the time granted, apply to the assessing
authority to grant him further time, not beyond twenty four calendar months in
total, after complying with the requirement of sub-section (2).

)] During the time so granted under sub-section (3), the dealer may apply, along
with the remaining declaration forms, to the assessing authority to get his case
reopened for reassessment. Such an application shall be entertained only once in
the course of such proceeding.

%) On receipt of an application along with the declaration forms under sub-section
(4), the assessing authority shall reopen the case for the limited purpose of
considering the remaining declaration forms since furnished by the dealer and
pass an appropriate order in respect thereof, within a period of three calendar
months from the date of receipt of the application under sub-section (4).

(6) Where the recovery of an amount assessed remains stayed under this section and
on a decision under sub-section (5) the amount so stayed has been maintained
in whole or in part, the dealer shall be liable to pay interest on such amount at
the rate specified in sub-section (6) of Section 24 for the period from the date
on which such amount was due to be paid after the original order of assessment
to the date of its payment.

Amendmnet of

Section 37 9. In section 37 of the principal Act, In sub-section (2), for the word “dealer”, the words;

“dealer or person” shall be substituted.

Amendmnet of

Section 40 10. In Section 40 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), for the words “one hundred”, the

words “five hundred” shall be substituted.

Amendmnet of

Section 46. 11. In Section 46 of the principal Act,—

€] in sub-section (5), for the words “till the decision of appeal”, the words “for a
period of six calendar months and thereafter, extend the stay for a maximum
period of six calendar months on payment, by the dealer, of an additional amount
equal to five percent of the remaining amount” shall be substituted;

(ii) in sub-section (6), for full stop, the colon shall be substituted and thereafter the
following proviso shall be inserted, namely:

“Provided that if an amount equal to thirty percent of such balance is paid by a dealer,
the Appellate Board shall stay the recovery of the balance amount in accordance
with the provisions of section 4-A.”.

Amendmnet of

Section 58. 12. In Section 58 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the words " the driver or other

person in-charge of such vehicle (hereinafter referred to as transporter) shall obtain in the prescribed
form and manner, a transit pass from the check post officer of the first check post after his entry
into the State", the words" the driver or other person in-charge of such vehicle (hereinafter referred
to as transporter) shall, after his entry into the State, carry with him an invoice, bill or challan or
any other document, completed prescribed application form of the goods in movement and challan,
bilties or any other document issued by the transporter, and obtain in the prescribed form and
manner, a transit pass from the check post officer of the first check post after his entry in to the
State" shall be substituted.

amendmnet of 13. In Section 62 of the Principal Act,—
1) in the marginal heading, for the words “and any person transporting goods”, the
words “any person transporting goods or any person storing goods” shall be

substituted.



TGS TSI, femied 7 SHadt 2015 16 (9)

1"

(ii) in sub-section (1), for the words "a person transporting goods", the words " a
person transporting goods or a person storing goods" shall be substituted;

(iai) in the Explanation, in clause (ii), for full stop, the semi-colon shall be substituted
and thereafter the following new clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(ii))  “Person storing goods™ shall, besides the owner or lessee, include manager, a
person in-charge of a cold storage, warehouse, godown or any other such place,
where goods are stored for hire or reward.”.

14. In Schedule I to the principal Act,— Amendment of
Schedule L

@) after serial number 1A, the following serial number and entries relating thereto
shall be inserted, namely:—

“IB. (1)  Thresher,
(2) Leveler
(3)  Scraper
4)  Cultivator
(5) Plough
(6)  Maize Sheller
(7)  Potato Planter
(8) Maize Planter
(9)  Potato Digger
(10) Groundnut Digger
(11)  Seed Dirills
(12) Seed Caster
(13) Fertilizer Caster
(14) Reaper
(15) Sugarcane Cutter
(16) Sugarcane Planter
(17) Post Hole Digger
(18) Harrow
(19) Bund Former
(20) Ridger
(21) Cage Wheel
(22) Paddy Puddler
(23) Chaff Cutter
(24) Power Tiller
(25) Seed Grader and Seed Grader Machine
(26) Harvester
(27) Paddy Transplanter
(28) Sprayer
(29) Duster
(30) Seed Broadcaster
(31) Fertilizer Broadcaster
(32) Winnower
(33) Pruning Equipment
(34) Bailer”;

(i) after serial number 88, the following serial number and entries relating thereto
shall be inserted, namely:—
“89. Ghungharu, Ghanta, Ghadiyal,
Jhanjh, Manjira, Trishul,
Kamandal and Idols of God and
Goddess (other than those made
of gold, silver and other noble
metals)”.



16 (10) TSR T§0E, feAis 7 sHadt 2015
Amendment of 15. In Schedule II to the principal Act, in Part-II,-
Schedule 1II.

@) against serial number 1, in column (2), the words, not operated manually or not
driven by animals" shall be omitted;

(i1) after serial number 5C, the following serial number and entries relating thereto
shall be inserted, namely:—

"SD. Flush door 5"

(iii) after serial number 22A, the following serial number and entries relating thereto
shall be inserted, namely :—

"22B. Ceramic and vitrified tiles 5"

@iv) serial number 39 and entries relating thereto shall be omitted;

) after serial number 50, the following serial number and entries relating thereto
shall be inserted, namely:—

"S0A. Thermal insulators for use as industrial input  5";

(vi) against serial number 51, in column (2), in item (4), after sub-item (iv), the
following sub-item shall be inserted, namely :—
"(v) Document scanner”;

(vii) against serial number 54, in column (2), for the words and bracket “Khoa
(Mawa)”, the words and bracket “Khoa (Mawa), butter” shall be substituted;

(viil)  against serial number 57, in column (2), for the words “Medical equipments /
devices and implants”, the words “Medical equipments / devices, implants and
X-ray films” shall be substituted;

(ix) against serial number 76, in column (2), for the words “Sewing and kniiting
machines”, the words “Sewing Needles, Sewing and Knitting Machines" shall be
substituted;

x) against serial number 90, in column (2), the words “power tillers, threshers,
harvesters,” shall be omitted.

Repeal and i6. (1) The Madhya Pradesh Vat (Amendment) Ordinance, 2014 (No.4 of 2014) is hereby
savings.

repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding the repeal of the said Ordinance, anything done or any action taken
under the said Ordinance shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the corresponding
provision of this Act.

e, T R0 a9l e W, HETeY G WREh g TRener, e § g qen veefie—2015.



