T JEES www.govtpressmp.nic.in
Q +ft s e forar s W B

FHiE 150] frore, war, s 1 eid 2016—3A7 12, WH 1938

fafy it faurt & favm
m,ﬁﬂiimaﬁazme

%, 5370- 9737%”!1131(m)—w%ﬁﬁm%aﬁas&%m(s)%mﬁ Heryey faum @
e A9, W a1 YA (Seen) fagEes, 2016 (msmzme) m\w)ﬁﬁaﬂaﬁwm%mmﬂ@
TAeEN, YR R S .

TEYRY % TSI & A ¥ T ARG,
T g, SR wiaa.

MADHYA PRADESH BILL
No. 8 or 2016

" THE MADHYA PRADESH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA TATHA PENSION
(SANSHODHAN) VIDHEYAK, 2016

TABLE OF CONTENTS
Clauses :

Short title.

. Amendment of Section 3.
Amendment of Section 4.
Substitution of Section 4-C.
Deletion of Section 5.
Amendment of Section 5-A.

 Amendment of Section 6-A.
Amendment of Section 6-B.
Amendment of Section 6-C.
Amendment of Section 7.

© PN oY AW N

e
- O

Insertion of Section 7-A.
) 299



300 ey Uev, feie 1 atdier 2016
MADHYA PRADESH BILL
No. 8 orF 2016
THE MADHYA PRADESH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA TATHA
PENSION (SANSHODHAN) VIDHEYAK, 2016
A Bill further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha
Pension Adhiniyam, 1972.
Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the sixty-seveﬁth year of the Republic of
India as follows:—
Short title. 1. This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha

Amendment of
Section 3.

Amendment of.
Section 4.

Substitution of
Section 4-C.

Computer
Operator /
Orderly

allowance.
Deletion of
Section 5.
Amendment of
Section 5-A.

Amendment of
Section 6-A.

Amendment of
Section 6-B.

Pension (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2016.

2. In Section 3 of the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension
Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), for the words “ten
thousand”, the words “thirty thousand” shall be substituted.

3. In Section 4 of the principal Act, for the words “twenty five thousand”, the words “thirty
five thousand” shall be substituted.

4. For Section 4-C

of the principal Act, the following Section shall be Substituted,
namely :— :

“ 4-C. There shall be paid to every member a Computer Operator / Orderly allowance of
fifteen thousand rupees per mensem.".

'5. Section 5 of the principal Act, shall be deleted.

6. In Section 5-A of the Principal Act :—

@) in sub-section (1), for the figure and word "6,000 kilometers", the ﬁguré and word
"10,000 kilometers" shall be substituted;
(ii) in sub Section (3), for the words "three thousand”, the words "four thousand"

shall be substituted.".

7. In Section 6-A of the principal Act, in sub-section (1),—

@) in the first paragraph, for the words “fifteen thousand”, the words “twenty
thousand” shall be substituted;
(>ii) in first proviso, for full stop, the colon shall be substituted and thereafter the

following proviso shall be inserted namely :—
“Provided furthor that eight hundred rupees per month shall be added per year

in pension.”.

8. In Section 6-B of the principal Act, for the words “ten thousand”, the words “eighteen
thousand” shall be substituted and for ful stop, the colon shall be substituted and thereafter the
following proviso shall be addec, namely —

“Provided that five hundred rupees per month shall be added per year in family pension.”.



TRy T, feiw 1 el 2016 300 (1)

9. In Section 6-C of the principal Act, for the words “ten thousand”, the words “fifteen Amendment of
» . Section 6-C. N
thousand” shall be substituted.

10. In Section 7 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the words “five thousand”, the ~Amendment of

words “ten thousand” shall be substituted. Section 7.
11. After Section 7 of the principal Act, the following Section shall be inserted, namely :—  insertion  of
Section 7-A.

“I_A. “There shall be paid ex-gratia of rupees five lakh to the dependant of deceased Ex-gratia.
member.”. ' '

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

Due to inflation in recent years, it has become necessary to enhance the salary, allowances, pension and other
facilities given to members and ex-members of the Madhya Pradesh Legislative Assembly.

2. Hence this Bill.

Bhopal : : DR. NAROTTAM MISHRA
Dated the 30" March 2016. Member-in-charge.

iR, WO TET AT S W, TSN GRI AR Hed RO, et F gfka o0 FHRIREa—2016.



