ER K LS IEEA WWW.govipressmp.nic.in ¥
ff TR e R ST wea R

[

HH® 362 ] N, wfER, fadis 24 STTE 2019—9% 2, WF 1941

fafy ik faurht =0 fawm
iiare, feAie 24 svTE 2019

%, 14051-233-3FhIE-31(W. ) -3y, —aeayey faym aw &1 fafafea eifafem g | feaiw 22 svma
2019 =1 TSI FEIGT Y STTAR WG & G B, TGN, WAWHNO H AHRR % T3 wemifv fepam i .

TEIYeY & TIU & 9 § a7 SRIER,
AT AT, e e,

723



724 Jegyey N9, faqis 24 s 2019

[qeyeyl AfufEm

T ] T R0

HeAYRYT A e (Hyveq ) afufm, 021

[feith 3 0T, R02% HT TITA HI AN WA g3, 7w ' weayew Tooa (ernyrw)’’ & feAir 3¢ avra, R08%
H oY AR Y@ ]

WeAYSY Hiewar wuar i, e3¢ @i T denfia & 3 erfufrem.
WA TR % A o weme faum-visw g Frfafen w9 d T sifufafa @
iforw WM. . 39 fufg o1 dfa T dJeauRy We@E SUUE (SeeA) sifufem, R08R ©.
U R0 W R. WEAYRW HIEWH hUYH AUFEE, 232 (. R T 2%%2) (S T TWE W W

wofrer. afufrm ¥ T ¥ fide §) 1 4/ R0 & wogw A, s ' IgUE A SR arfudfa wife w5 w6
F WA R, T IR W IR ARRifGa wika & wH o gew gfea’ st fea S,

wom sgEl, W '3.qgaaxfuﬁaqﬁumemﬁ”rﬁ,—
Hirert.
(TF) € IR H &I Qe qM,—

(%) 39-1 () ¥, @vs (W) # wed () ¥, aq’mammé “uo wfadte ufa
TR’ & TR W), 3% a9 I ¢ Quo Wfade e’ Tenfug few smd;

(@) 3I9-Hg () H, wiem () H, 3 ‘2o’ & WM W, 3l ‘00" TqfUm
feran g;

(1) Iu-me (3) H @wvE (F) H wem () H, IF o’ F WH W, 3w
Q00" oIy fepan g

() W€ 4= u a= H,—

(F) SU-TE () H 3iF '‘QRooco” T WM W, 3iF qM ‘o000’ Tfym fHm
S

(@) SU-mE (R) ¥ @M R, Frafafed su-w- wofea &6t s, stafq—

“() T HRER W, W L I, 0¥ W Y4 HEARRW U A Uefiga € o
ST dsfi M AR R¢ooo Fhcdmm A afus ¥, #X FregER €rm—

(&) Y¢ooo TR A 31f¥e fohrg o000 ¥YY Rooo Hfa fam
fereum @ eifys & R .

(@) TITET] TH Looo TRaU™ a1 6 FYC 3yo Ul fomeh
M ¥ fag,



neggey Uy, i 24 3FRE 2019 724 (1)

TR —F T faEl/Sia-ord qeauey e wUuH (SmeF) sifufm,
0% F IR T F T¥EN AP fel & wem g7 € e .

@Gn IY-TE (3) 91 STY Heifeq wfafedl & @ |, ﬁmﬁr@aw-maw
3T Heifya gfafteat oy =t wd, stafq—

“(3) o= T A USHipd AieE et deE R—
(F) Yooo frcium I 1fym == . FIQ Yoo Tfa N

(@) yooo TRam™m A Nfk febeg Gooo fecime 9T goo Wfa WM
q sfuer T R,

(M TR T&® ooo fohaimm - SGH T goo Hid W'';
% fer,

(F) 7 o7 F WM R, frefafead 7 wnfi # S, stefq—

“PE. Wz 41 9H

(F) A3F gHar R+ 9 3Ny &) W?oouﬁfﬁ\?ﬁﬁﬁm.

(@) Afe f<i 9ar 9@ 1 Aew@F 39 U (&) # g9 Sfeoifad =X &
Afufm, ’¢e (2R¢e FT UR) Afafiaa vuq g0 gfq die wfd f&ga.'";

TN 9 H IYEN (2) F
GUg (%) & IEY F AR
3T W & B

(9R) TR §W ¥ @R R, Frefatad oe @i F S, steig—

Yo, erfoer deen 59 ;

() . Yo smal g3+¢ QA AU @ wqq 23 ufa die ufa a9

@) Seftrer den 99 (986 §EA 39 1g (&) ¥ qu1 Sfeaifaa = &
eR+2 U fuep) 3 diegm afufem,  sifafled 9w g0 ufd die ufa fea.';
2R¢C (]¢¢ T YR) Tl UNT €9 i

IGUNT () & TS (&) & IER
ST W Y . ’



724 (2) Heageyl TS9H, e 24 3T 2019

(99) U o8 = AW H,—
(F) -5 (1) ¥, @€ (%) ¥ WA W, Freffed wvs wifia fra s, s —

Y(®) T, QAW A % Afafie
I I W AEHIF G-I
I SRR SIS eI
€ ol fowe aem Wea wR
yooo fhellum ¥ afte T 2.

¥TAQ Eoo Yfd H'";

(@) 39-7 (R) ﬁ,m(m)qﬁ(@)%wﬁ%ﬁwﬁf@awwﬁam

WG, stiq —
“(_3’7) @WWWT&HW Wzooo‘qﬁfqﬂq
3000 fhelUm | sifte =& R :
€:)) mm Roo00 EIpIL '{TQ'Q Qoo yfd A,

T 3IFH 9 & faQ
ﬁmzwm%aﬂaﬁm,mvvﬁaﬁ@iwqﬁﬁam, IR R &
A H. o 3¢er (T), TR §-¢-R0%¢ H Wohal 99 R & o
I SEUa & SOl '
(o) we A SR &= H—
(%) 3992 (TH) @@ () ¥ ©F R, frafafen Su-a¢ wifa # o, srefq :—

“ () Taftee = YSftE % WA WeW FA S

I HL H o Ffawm.

()

qfieRT a[

(3) WIIEERRS qur 3R+ 9%
3% &1 9 AN

(R) A3F AT 3+ T IW
& gt Ot Im

(3) HreEH

(¥) @ 9 S 39 S F
fordt ol & 3feafea =1 &

YT & 99T Hed Fd S
A F H o Hfaww. :

M I GSfichd &HAT W FIC Roo
gfa die.

I F THTH WK F UM Rooo
foreom a1 39% WM & o

T Yoo,

I F AGH Ygd IR & I Qooo
T a1 39 9 & fad
TYY Yoo,



TRy TSI, TGAih 24 T/ 2019 724 (3)

WEROT. — A H g % BRU IF %k ST H W H A1 Hiew@H Afufm,
2%¢¢ (RR¢¢ HT YR) Tt UNT Yo I IUUN (R) & IS & oA Al
Hoardt & Tem § WHR g ST A T AW ST U 2R T R F
SyEdl & onfiH W ¥ g2 W ¥, W gy 9 ¥ Sfefaa afifie W
T I & ford <o el ern.

(9[) A <9 Bfa = H,—

(%) s “‘efm W'’ F wE W), s ézﬂgmarmmﬁfwaﬁwzﬁa
FU'' Tfya fman S

(@) S-mE () # @ug (W) H FHq (R) H, I q 3iF ‘ITYW yoo!' F
WM W, T q1 3 ' TAC 000" TG FFY SME 7o @O (@) H, Hiew
) ‘E’f’ =g 3R o "y goo00”’ % WM R, Y qAT. 3% ' HIC Yooo!
wifya feu S,

(M 3T (R) U, @vs (W) H Hiem (R) H, WS 1 3w TUY yoo!' F TN
R, AR qAT 31% ' TIC Rooo0’’ Tt foF wME iR @Wus (W) #, =faw ()
H, W A I 'TUC o000’ F TAM W, Weg A 3 'TUY Ro00”’ T

fer G,
¥. o afufem R sy §— foefi s,
(Th) w8 ¥ & H—
(F) W= "'TUC R0 W@ TF' F WH W, =K 7T Lo W@ W wH"’ Wil fry
S
(@) wvg (&), (@), (M) 7 (V) & @A R), Frafataa @ve wnfrg fey s
31?ﬁ?[:— '
“(%) I gW At A % H AHE G H L0 WV,
(@) WarEest @ sy qH F FA HAEF oA H ¢ G
T St gI Sferd.
(M A gw afea AM % F AAE Ged H ¥ Wi,
@) ¥ @EH—

(F) T @O 3iF ‘TAT Qo T W AR’ F WM W, WK a1 3iF 'TUY %o
M@ 9 9 TUY Ro G IR’ Tifud fHw Sg;

(@ @E (%), (@), (N & (9) & W¥E R, e gue wifia e s,

31917?[:—
“(w) o gR Afed mﬁ:wmi@wz?uﬁmﬁ.
(m) Rt w oSy I F FA ANF eF F Lo v
T St g et

(n 9 gE At TR % T AR e ¥ e,



724 (4) Heyey o9, feis 24 smra 2019

(@) 7 ¥ @ ¥ T, s e st ® S, ek —

Y@ . HITTEERT a1 QR+2 9 3% &Wdl 9 R-yRag/aftegd am foeht ame
T Ro A A Afyw ¥—

(%) i@ gr afea IM F FA TS eI H1 L& Yfave.

(@) YgramEieA T sy I F FA TS G H Q¥ Ui,
T St g et

(M 90 g At IA F FA AFF qed H ¥ qiaw.

THRIOT. — Al et § TR gR 99 ¢ I W T F AT, 92 ¥, ¥@ a9
¥@®H & ITEY & AR Sad HA w & fod 39 aF@ R g |
TWEHR A 9T @S o, Ht S,

(IN) W ¥ * wyen Frefafan 78 o onfi@ &1 9, steiq —

‘g, TeEE sifufrm, 2’ec (R’¢c 4 S & T IR I FA w A
W 4R) H NI ¥R ok IeoisA W Qo Wiawd Sifafiw, s fa 9-k-R02%
TA @RI ama st s & @ goreda €',

(F) SU-HE (F) H, Hew () H, 3iF 90 IR IH F R T w1 ¥%' H
WM W, I qA7 3% ''Thel IH YR FH Fod 4R F YIF ooo fHelium =
3Tk 9FT & fed T9C 3uoo’’ wnifi@ fohw <imd;

(@) IU-Wg (@) ¥, HaA () #H, 3fF M IR AN F AR YT H 3% F
WM W, YT A1 3F HUHA 99 WK F FA YR H YAb Looo THaUM A
IF 9 & fod $9C uoo’’ wefya fapw <@, ',

m 311—11?:.(@) ¥ wvan, Frafafea feau szt fea e, stafq :—
“feumtt: W T T R AR IR R¢ooo TR ¥ afyw B, AW F w@rd

F U WO TG H TR UiE HI IU-7 () # g fafidy = F Prm
* T fasew gm.";



HeAyey TNyd, fid 24 SFa 2019 724 (5)

(W)mw%wﬁnﬁwﬁ«@ammﬁaﬁm ardfq :—

‘o, W A AE S S TS W SR TH O WG HA kG HeAdew T
# dofiem ¥ faw ome e &, 99 9@ ¥ foe Sfe w e w0 FreEeR g o—

(+) ST TS ST € W afE 9 % Wk 9 9K % 3R Rooo
F Gsfted ) aE ¥ Q@ g aw RS W IWS AM F fae g
é?grﬁm §ooo,

(@) et YO SR OEE HakE A % THA TH TR F W Q000
HI TS Y aE | [ a6 | ferelum =1 38F W ¥ fag T
af‘wgrﬁam ¥o000.'";
(WW) € ¢ % ©F R, Frafafaa 93 wonfm i Se, s1gfq —

e, A AM—
A AF R SHterehd T e Ted H1 ¢ favm.

WHEL.—TAE IF F AFF Jed ¥ fada 8—

(t) Fmia g fifda &€t 3o aemm 1 =9/ g7 9ga fFn @ qFE 9o @
i favym g Fifvea feen ™ 79 gem, S = sl

() R N AT F FH AE 9 9w W, =WER gW A fnan @
Wgwaﬂtqﬁaﬁﬁmﬁwa@ﬁﬁmmﬁﬁha@m
A% T, I I F1 Fd 996 99 T

(3M3) WE R B, Ha™ () H, 31F “&%' & WH W i+ ''2o%’’ wnfi@ fFam U,

#) W o ¥ wWH W, Frefaad 7 wfE w1, ek —

“20. W IFl & forw Sl =X W 39 oy & fonelt off o # & o ofit S

AW T H 3 TR, 0¥ ¥ qd WSfiga 9, Frargen &m —

(F) 2 AR, 0¥ W A a0 aH M Wa R F R Q000 Tereium
AT A 7N IGF O F @ T ¢R000,

(@) % SR, Ro%¥ I a¥ @ A Wed IR & A ooo fopeium
s QAT IM I 3IF 9 F @ TAQ Rooo.



724 (8) HeAYRW W9, &I 24 ST 2019

(W) W 20 ¥ W, Frafafed wg swawonfua &t Sg, stefq —

“Rom, TY M ¥ Sarehrel W, ST 39 S & fret o o & Y em
3R S rmafy YHIUES | WA F IR o T ¥ HEIR
T~ H Ui F o 9 W, frenger e oe—

(F)  IFNE YO 99 S0 T A AeH Wed W & wfa
ARG T OSE A d 9000 TaHelum =1
Y 98 TF F T AA ITF W F o wug
Roooo,

(@)  3FmEfa YO X SR OB i agH Wea wR & fa

qE & GeiEd & e | 000 TREIT a1 ‘
oo A eifee A AE IG% 9T ¥ fod T
QL\ooé,",

Ao, T 24 3P 2019

. 14051-233-TFRIG-ST( . ) -3 — WG & WEAUH F TS 348 F WIS (3) F T § HeAYRY HEWH
YA (ERieF) afufrm, 2019 (FEIw 19 | 2019) H ST AR TS F WiUHR ¥ TaggRl i fohan
ST R

TEAYREl % TR & AH § a1 SRAIHR,
T Tred, Sfafie afee.

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
NO. 19 OF 2019

"THE MADHYA PRADESH MOTORYAN KARADHAN (SANSHODHAN)
ADHINIYAM, 2019

[Received the assent of the Governor on the 22" August, 2019; assent first published in the “Madhya Pradesh Gazette
(Extra-ordinary)’’, dated the 24™ August, 2019]

An Act further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Motoryan Karadhan Adhiniyam, 1991.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the Seventieth year of the Republic of
India as follows:—

Short title 1. This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Motoryan Karadhan (Sanshodhan)
Adhiniyam, 2019. '

Amendment of 2. In the proviso to section 20 of the Madhya Pradesh Motoryan Karadhan Adhiniyam, 1991

section 20. (No. 25 of 1991) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), for the words "the amount of tax
and penalty levied", the words "fifty percent of the amount of tax and penalty levied" shall be .
substituted.

Amendment of 3. In First Schedule to the principal Act,—
First Schedule.

(i) in item IV PUBLIC SERVICE VEHICLE,—

(a) in sub-item (1), in clause (b), in column (2), for the figure and words "150
per seat per quarter”, the figure and words "150 per seat per month” shall be
substituted; ’



HeAYSH TS, & 24 7 2019

724 (7)

(b) in sub-item (2), in column (2), for the figure "180", the figure "200" shall be
substituted; _ :

(©) in sub-item (3), in clause (a), in column (2), for the figure "180" the figure
"200" shall be substituted;

(ii) in item V GOODS CARRIAGE,—
(a) in sub-item (1) for the figure "12000" the figure "28000" shall be substituted;
(b) for sub-item (2), the following sub-item shall be substituted, namely :—
"(2) Tax on such goods carriage which are registered in the State of Madhya
Pradesh before 1st October, 2014, and which are having a capacity of more

than 28000 kilogram shall be as follows :—

(a) more than 28000 kilogram, but not Rs. 9000 per quarter
exceeding 29000 kilogram.

(b) thereafter on every 1000 kilogram Rs. 350 per quarter
or part thereof.

Explanation.—The tax per quarter/lifetime shall be payable from the first day of the
forthcoming quarter after the commencement of the Madhya Pradesh Motoryan
Karadhan (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2019.";

() for sub-item (3) and entries relating thereto, the following sub-item and entries
relating thereto, shall be substituted, namely :—

"(3) Goods carriage registered in other States whose laden weight is.—
(a) not exceeding 5000 kilogram Rs. 500 per month
(b) exceeding 5000 kilogram, but not Rs. 600 per month

exceeding 6000 kilogram. .

(c) thereafter for every 1000 kilogram Rs. 100 per month".;
or part thereof.

(iii) for item VI, the following item shall be substitute, namely :—
"VL PRIVATE SERVICE VEHICLE:

(a) Having seating capacity exceeding 12+1 Rs. 200 per seat per month

b) If, Private Service Vehicle has obtained Rs. 60 per seat per day in
the permit as per the provision of addition to tax as mentioned
clause (a) of sub-section (1) of Section in sub-item (a).";
87 of the Motor Vehicles Act, 1988
(No. 59 of 1988).



724 (8) TEWeW T9s, fei® 24 7a 2019

(iv) for item VII, the following item shall be substitute namely :—

"VII. EDUCATIONAL INSTITUTE BUS :

(€:))
®

seating capacity is more than 12+1

Bus of educational institute (seating
capacity more than 12+1) has obtained
a permit as per clause (a) of sub-

Rs. 12 per seat per annum.

Rs. 60 per seat per day in
addition to tax as mentioned
in sub-item (a).";

section (1) of Section 87 of the
Motor Vehicles Act, 1988
(No. 59 of 1988).

(v) in item VII OTHER VEHICLES,—

(a) in sub-item (1), for clause (a), the following clause shall be substituted,
namely :—

"(a) the vehciles excluding items
I, II and III and covered under
Trade certificate or temporary
registration and having unladen
weight which does not exceed
5000 kilogram.

Rs. 600 per month™.;

(b) in sub-item (2), for clauses (a) and (b), the following clasues shall be substituted,
namely :(—

"(a) vehicles which have unladen
weight which does not exceed
3000 kilogram.

Rs. 1000 per month

) thereafter for every 1000 kg and
part thereof.

Rs. 200 per month

Note.—The calculation of tax of goods carriage shall be done as determined for Gross
Vehicle Weight in the Notification No. S. O. 3881(A), dated 6-8-2018 of the
Ministry of Road Transport and Highways, Government of India.";
(vi) in item IX TRANSFER TAX,—

(a) for sub-items (i) and (ii), the following sub-items shall be substituted, namely :—

"(1) Non-transport vehicle 20 percent of the total
Lifetime Tax paid at the
time of registration.

(ii) Transport Vehicle—

(1) Motorcycle and vehicle
having seating capacity
upto 12+1

10 percent of the total
Lifetime Tax paid at the
time of registration.



Hegey U9, T 24 3 2019

724 (9)

(2) All passenger vehicles having Rs. 200 per seat on
seating capacity of 13+1 and the registered capacity
above. of the vehicle.

(3) Goods carriage Rs. 500 for gross

vehicle weight of
vehicle per 1000 kgs
or part thereof.

(4) Such vehicles which are Rs. 1500 for unladen
not mentioned in any of weight of vehicle
the category of this per 1000 kilograms or
Schedule part thereof.

Explanation.—In case of transfer of vehicle because of the death of owner or transfer

by Government through public auction under the provisions of sub-section (2)
of Section 50 of the Motor Vehicles Act, 1988 (No. 59 of 1988) or the vehicles
which are exempted from tax under the provisions of Section 11 and 21, the
additional tax as mentioned in this Schedule shall not be payable for such
vehicles.";

(vii) in item X GREEN TAX,—

(a)

(b)

(©)

for the heading "Green Tax", the heading "GREEN TAX on the vehicles apart
from the vehicles run by battery" shall be substituted;

in sub-item (1), in clause (a), in column (2), for the word and figure
"Rs. 500", the word and figure, "Rs. 2000" shall be substituted and in clause
(b), in column (2), for the word and figure "Rs. 1000", the word and figure
"Rs. 500" shall be substituted;

in sub-item (2), in clause (a), in column (2), for the word and figure
"Rs. 500", the word and figure, "Rs. 1000" shall be substituted and in clause
(b), in column (2), for the word and figure "Rs. 1000", the word and figure
"Rs. 2000" shall be substituted.

4. In the Second Schedule to the principal Act,—

(i) in item 4A,—

(a)

(b)

for the words "up to Rs. 10 Lakh", the words "less than Rs. 10 Lakh" shall
be substituted; :

for clauses (a), (b), (c) and (d), the following clauses shall be substituted,
namely :—

"(a) Driven by diesel 10 percent of the total
standard price of the
vehicle.

(b) Dirven by petrol/ 8 percent of the total

Hybrid/CNG/LPG standard price of the
vehicle.

(¢) Driven by battery 4 percent of the total
: standard price of the
vehicle.";

Amendment of
Second Schedule.



724 (10) HEAYQY TSI, i 24 3vr 2019

(i) in item 4B,—

(a) for the words and figure "exceeding Rs. 10 Lakh", the words and figure "from
Rs. 10 Lakh and upto Rs. 20 Lakh" shall be substituted;

(b) for clauses (a), (b), (c) and (d), the followiﬂg clauses shall be substituted,
namely :—

"(a) Driven by diesel 12 percent of the total
standard price of the
vehicle.

(b) Dirven by petrol/ 10 percent of the total

Hybrid/CNG/LPG standard price of the
' vehicle.

(c) Driven by Battery 4 percent of the total
standard price of the

vehicle.”;

(iii) after item 4B, the following item shall be inserted, namely :—

"4BA. Motorcycle and non-transport/transport vehicle having seating capacity upto 12+1
whose standard cost is exceeding 20 Lakh.—

(a) Driven by diesel 16 percent of the total
standard price of the
vehicle.

(b) Dirven by petrol/ 14 percent of the total
Hybrid/CNG/LPG standard price of the
vehicle.

(c) Driven by Battery 4 percent of the total
standard price of the
vehicle.

Explanation.—The vehicles sold by the Government in public auction, the tax shall
be calculated for lifetime tax as per the provisions of item 4A, 4B and 4BA
on the cost on which the Government had bought the vehicle.";

(iv) after item 4C, the following item shall be inserted, namely :—

"4D.  In case of non-transport Lifetime tax payable
vehicles flying in : plus 20 percent extra of
contravention of section 49 the total tax payable,
of the Motor Vehicles Act, which shall be effective -
1988 (No. 59 of 1988). from 01-09-2019.";

(v) in item 7,—

(a) in sub-item (a), in column (2), for the figure and words "4% of the standard
price of vehicle”, the words and figure "Total load of Gross Vehicle Weight
for every 1000 kgs or part thereof Rs. 3500" shall be substituted;



HEAYRY T, el 24 svra 2019

724 (11)

(b) in sub-item (b), in column (2), for the figure and words "3% of the standard
price of vehicle", the words and figure "Total load of Gross Vehicle Weight
for every 1000 kilograms or part thereof Rs. 2500";

() after sub-item (b), the following note shall be inserted, namely :—
""Note.—Such goods carriages whose laden weight is more than 28000 kilograms, the
owner of the vehicle shall have an option for payment of tax as specified in
sub-item (2) of item V of First Schedule.”;
(vi) for item 7A, the following item shall be substituted, namely :—
"TA. Such goods carriages after receiving no objection certificate from other States

has been brought for registration in the State of Madhya Pradesh, the lifetime
tax for vehicles shall be as follows :— ,

(a) Upto two years old vehicles The Gross Vehicle Weight
from the date of registration for every 1000 kilogram or
to the date of issue of no part thereof Rs. 6000.

objection certificate.

(b) more than two years old vehicles The Gross Vehicle Weight
from the date of registration to for every 1000 kilogram or
the date of issue of no objection part thereof Rs. 4000.";
certificate.

(vii) for item 8, the following item shall be substituted, namely :(—
"8. Goods Carriage—

Lifetime tax of goods carriage 8 percent of the standard
price.

Explanation.—The standard price of the goods carriage means—

3d) Such goods carriages with a body made by the manufacturer, the standard price
recovered by the dealer or the standard price determined by the Transport
Department, whichever is higher.

(i) In case the dealer has sold vehicle in the form of chassis, the standard price
recovered by the dealer plus the standard price of the body made by the body
builder authorised by the Transport Department, shall be the total standard price
of said vehicle.";

(viii) in item 9, in column (2), for the figure "6%" the figure "10%" shall be substituted;
(ix) for item 10, the following item shall be substituted, namely :(—
"10. The lifetime tax for the vehicles which do not fall in any of the category of this
Schedule and which were registered before 1% October, 2014 in the State of
Madhya Pradesh shall be as follows :—
(a) Upto three years old vehicles The unladen weight for every

on Ist October, 2014. 1000 kilogram or part thereof
Rs. 12000.



724 (12) TS USTH, & 24 30T 2019

(b) More than three years old vehicles The unladen weight for every

on 1% October, 2014. 1000 kilogram or part thereof
: Rs. 9000.";
x) after item 10, the following item shall be inserted, namely :—

"10A. The lifetime tax for such vehicles which do not fall in any of the category of
this Schedule and are brought from other States in the State of Madhya
Pradesh for registration after obtaining no objection certificate shall be as

follows :—

(a) Upto two years old vehicles The unladen weight for every
from the date of registration 1000 kilogram or part thereof
to the date of issue of no Rs. 20000.
objection certificate.

b) More than two years old vehicles The unladen weight for every
from the date of registration to 1000 kilogram or part thereof
the date of issue of no objection Rs. 15000.
certificate.

W,'Wwamﬁ@am, AEANRY §RI TR 4 YRomerd, siiared & qfia aon yeifm—2019.



