T JTEES www.govtpressmp.nic.in q
off 287 el fhar s g 2.

[

AR 590 ] ofiutet, yeRaR, i 30 femwarR 2011—1W 9, Wk 1933

fafy ot faurt wrd faam

are, T 30 faasr 2011

F. 5436-451-3FRIG-31- (1. ). — TRy faum @ o Frefafaa sifufeag fog ) foaie 27 feawr, 2011 &6t
TR TSITE 1 STAN WE g gE €, TaggRl Seune H SHe % o g feen s g

TRy F USAU & 9 W qel STRINIER,
AT AT, R G,

HqeAyeyT Afufem

HE ¥R T 3022

TeAYRYT Y-Tore dfgar (Hyned ) afufam, 2088

forrf
%IT{IT\'? :

2. wieg .

2. ¥R R T HEIEA

3. g1 30 T HUEH,

. R 3% I T

4. g 34, TGN,

1179



1180 TEAYS qSu, ik 30 fegwt 2011
&R

& YN 3§ W WA

W, YR ¥E HT HIMEA

c. g ¥9 BT TN,

. YR ¥} 1 HYNEH,
Ro. U Yo T T

22. R 4] 1 G,
2. g 4R 1 GG,
23. HRT 43 1 HENEA.
¥, YN WY <hl Y-,

2. R W T GNE.
€. HRI 4T T TR T,
Q. R 4R T HINE.
¢,  URI \9o¢ HT BT WML
2R, HRT ¢} T WM.
Ro. U R TH FIAT WML
R U R T WA

AR ¥R RR W BIET WAL
R YW oo TH T
Q. ¥R {] T WM.
Ry, MW ¢ H ERMEA
RE. g 230 T HIMEH.
Q0. YR 3R I WIMYA.
R¢. HRI 233 HI WA
2R, g %3 1 WML
3o. YN QW3 Rl I,
32 Y 00 1 HIMEA.
3. T e THT TN
33. YRT 3% T HINE.
3%. YT 3 hi HIEA.
ELY YR ¥ ST HIMEH.
3%, H 3% B TN,
3. g %< HT TINEA.
3¢. N o T TN,
3% R 43 T HREA.
%o, R U9 T HITE,



HeguRy Y, e 30 faumR 2011 1180 (1)

TegeyT At
THE ¥R T R0%2
LAWY Y- Higar (Heier ) ifufam, 2092

[feier 27 fogmer, 2011 =1 ToauRt w1 orqufd ue gE, oTEfa * meryRe TN (sTnuren) ' H feAis 30 fowEr,
2011 &1 YUH IR FHIE i . ]

TEAYRYT -TeTed |igar, Q’uR N R wylfm & ¥ st
YRA ST & Srad ad § neryRy faum-ved gu frefafen w9 o ag sifufmafia g —

2. 39 Irfufam w1 dferw m Heggey y-UewE diedr (deied) sifufim, R0 % Hfgre .

R. WETIRY -Terd wHfed, L]0’ (AR R0 T 2RuR) (ST 3HH T YR Hel AfUFEE ka4 2 o Heire.

9§ iy §) *F am R ® IUEW () W, @WUE (W) F UvEN, FEfarEd @us ofd i
feran S, svafq—

(o) IR goa!! @ stfila § und i wr sfufiem, 0e’] (R¢R% I R) W HH S
MY HEAYRY SR Jod Arieeieh fagial o1 s S aen 39! e 98, Rooo
F 31l TolaR g SIKY TR TTu wrieyier faghal o srqan faifa vy = 9e;".

3. A SAfufRm F: U/ 30 H TN (2) H, ¥R ' HeE, STEUS AfHEN, I dEElaer’,  anr o 3o
F WA W, VR FERT A SwEve AR’ T R S, e

¥, ot AFEm &t um 3% §, Wus (1) H, veg Cuum R W, UK UE geR i SUUEL

. I Afufan o 9 3y w1 STENT (3) B, TR e T WM W, VR U IMY-TH . amr 3y
& g e’ wefua fey S, e

&, T AfUFT ® 9RT 38 @t IUERT (R) H, I foRM & wUH W, Hied wiyd fehar S wd amr 3w
eavar Frefafed woge S S|, stufq:— wyirer,

g elieh YeTeRR B, Wbl okl GEgul Gratd % SR i @ erfien v faw S weh SRy

T had @ o |1 M fhar S

v, It sTfafEm # a/ s F T@UE (F) § ue, o 3R FgE s fafem TR, 2%0¢  gmr v
(2Ro¢ & E. R) & TN W, Vee, 3k AR wiger uftdim orfuffaw, 9963 (QR&3 &1 38) Wiftd  dviem.
ferw wmd.

c.q@aﬁuﬁmaﬂmmﬁ,— gRT %9

(tF) e (%) ¥, e ' Yareirg faq'! & o |, vise e feq '’ wenfia feea <img;
(@)  wvE (@) ¥ v Ee e & wr W, vse ¢ Yaret fem ! wenfud feew s
()  @ue (1) v e B % M W, v e fea ! wnfua fRe S
(FR) 98 R & M R, Frfafeas wge wenfa fan s, stefq—

“qig @8 Rw, fak T faeg erdie o S W R, HeAUSw f-Teed died (FRieE)
arfufras, 098 & 99 81 % I foran T 71, ael U ume # et sek stfufad
% gd &I dfegar § sydfya woa-dm & offw 789 &1 S

wT

&T

T

T

ol



1180 (2) Teryeyl Tod, feates 30 faamr 2011

RUUIR A Q. g erfufm @t um ¥q H, SuMm (3) & wW R, frafafe sgur w@ifud el 9w,
woire, sttt —

“(3) TeTRRT B A % v, St Witk w9 ey o, foaes fo fawg orfa &1 e €, gfy
T, S TR FT TR 1 Y ST Wh A1 U SAfafie qied o TR S
ey Uifld & & fou 98 STevgs 9HeE:

e e Top e wiftrRl, U ety el Toma aiferet g1 AR W, Fued & ferg
Fiefta & .

g e AR FF HeAudy y-UsTe hkar (Fene) siftfm, jo22 % U9E 6 g9 %, THE
U W, S s a1 gAderr wiftreRRal R stefiee Tora sifteRiEl 1 giaufid
fpu o ¥, W0 use stfusrt g g aun fafafie feg sma. .

SITRT Yo ST TSI, Ro. @ SAMFTH F € yo F TM W, FrAffEd U T wt S, tufd—

e, “uo (1) Tued fRE off T wRen ¥ A1 fRe vaeR g fRU T STaRA WX AT et Al
e SRR ferdt ot T ween | fordt T8 ArTe o ST fafive feman S e
21 o el Ut wlare o oy sqes atefies ot Trome eifusrt g1 & 1E IS T
fopan 1 g Y, iR g e ardier 7 gt @), it afs = weltd gian € fop srefiey
T SRR —

() 7 U arfmiar & v fE & S ogw dfea g sed fifed |1 W g,
(@) 39 R Fifga &) 7 i & 7Er 0§ oHwd @R, a

(M) X AT i 1 W w # erfafergel a1 wrem eifrafiaa w6 g,

q HUSE A1 wedl 1 Sl SUHRI A W UET 3T R FR Sl I8 S HHg:

T HUSH A e A Sied ATURR, 39 6 % Tefi foru M feredt st # = el o
ST B ot ferameres o1 fafreaa Ty et forelt oTeer SRR T O A 39 e
et faam sl foh,—

(%) U TRy, afe 98 HUSH o YRR I ST w1 Al UEEHR % uel | TR
TN B, wEaElEE @ sifad w9 @ et s gl @

(@) U &y, AfE 9% Ygd @l €, = & fawadr 7 39 vaeR w5, e faeg
g A o o, el &fd Sid S

(R) qUEH A1 el A1 Sere U 38 o & 1, fordt U9 enew 8, Sreeh fawg =
qr qued F1 A1 STF e TR T 1R bt oYl B 81, IS bR el
HUT I 3 TE IS

(3)  Uera sifuel % gue feeh gaderor 1 yurd wEfaret @ wfTa e Al el g,
foama st fi Tt wrfare genfiafy guee a1 setaed a1 siera TRl g S
TS 8.

(¥) A % fou FE e —
(F) =@ dfzq ¥ onefiv oo fwel sew & fassg;
(W) a0 R0 & HH S nge & fRd oy & faes;




gegest Toid, feaie 30 fegmr 2011

1180 (3)

(M) V9 9% 5 9% uved w W6 o % i) we@ A femn mn g, e TRl
e e

TR STel UEn o, frwes foeg qrdiero o evdes wgd R S w@T €, Teaudy o-Used
dfgar (dened) erfufem, 022 % Yo" €1 % g9 fear T F, 98l W@ AW
H gThev, SR & IR | e fgq & oft@ wgv e s

(W) fFE o s 1 qRderor a9 I hwiid gl fohan STam = 3eret AT S e qoh
Toh federg TeTRR TR AT B! AT 7 R S E B SR 3 AT ol ST A < feen
&l

(&)  3Suym (R) ¥, srafds freh s & B g fi—

(TR) S8 39LR (Q) ¥ o1 frel wet & dely § wrdanfeai qued gR YR i TE
B, a8l SuF dey H wolgel 91 sk fusi) gRI g hNaE el ol ST

() el U () F enfi frdl ame & dey o FEafedt waeRl A1 SR
fyerr) gR1 IRY Y TS €, 8 39 UR F TN U¥ Wl % Heay § "ued,
Jefeafd, wereRy A see S g Ame F oifaw fgeR 9% W ar faw
W 1 UE) wrfanfeal orqd of g 91 TE STRY ik #R T, S f 9%
sfea 999,

TR, — 39 U & TAISH & fou goe Ueres il qued & eTdiaey gag S

9%, ol AfuFEW F 4R w2 H IUEW () F WGP F, @g () #, v T @
M W, e W " wenfu few Sd qen qoi foRm % uverd e i feen STe e sees
g, Frafafed wge siaeanfua fen S, steiq —

T et U 21y, fSreeh o foeg qrfdeion=T ol ST Tga fohan ST @1 §, ey - Teres
dfear (Feitem) erfufad, 022 % 999 BW % 4@ R T §, aEl U8 Ao °
yAfdeiie, endw &) aitg 9 A g7 3 «fiaw gs o fran s,

R, 7o Afufam & o wR °,—
(Th) 39N (R) H ol faum & T W, wiem g fear st sk 9 aee ettt
T 3T wenfua foa S, etefd:—

YR SR W feare, U 9R H, N T @ eifye % faw A ovelt goer @ aiig
e, St ot qE@ g1, el et S

() I9YR (3) ¥ Yol fom & T W, Hic wnfua o s ik 3w ween fFefated
T 3T Tenfa fepan S, etefq:—

‘T eTRw w1 Freuied, we oR H, i A 9 eifud % fam el gEaE s aikie

3. e fulEm & 9 w3 H, v, 3% Ul ®geE ' sive fdfidym Tae, eRo¢ (Rol &I

ara R

gRT 4R

T &3

T Q)" ¥ TIM W Y, o7 aul FuE ufdim sfufTg, 9]e3 (2983 W 38) ' wuifiq few R

STd iR v gafdeen ! & M W, wee ¢ qafderea qen gAdaer’’ wenfig fee S,

Ea)

T

T



1180 (4) Heayeyl YA, faie 30 feam 2017

&I 4% EhT TTOH. ¥, Afufm &t o) wy & wE W, frefafte g sl @ e, steiq—

itegor st e “yy, 38 1 SiafdE fendlt o1 % B3 gU o U T swrfarfeat S Aeasy - Usted digan
& (e sTufRm, 2022 % Y9 € o Sieh qd ferdlt Trored tfrhi & T Tt

URT 49 wHT

ART 4¢-@ T
KRR RN

fruifta y-usrea
TRT 3T H-TRT

TN g T
ferelt ufdereT &
eSS
IUEET H AT T
T & fag @
T3 T

YT 4R W
Hgirer,

T wiferd g, T Tore Afaepl gru et wepr gt et qen fafafyea =it Sl AE R
75wy sifufran wim @3 gen el

. & fafam &t 9| we H,—

(TF)  IUUW (R) #, v ‘su@vs afyst & TH |, I TS wer erd
e ST,
(A1) IuEw (3) qur (%) o g T S
2. o Afufem & ar we-% & wven, Frefafea o e w5 Sy, sfq—

“yc-m. (1) 39 dfgar A srafdy fedt T F g gu o, fuiRa y-us w5 e s -
TSTEd SIS0 Geu a1 o7 I2 et afeis & weier o fau swiim 4 e g
T BIT 6 % ©Id & IR H T gL

() SUERT (%) ¥ WS & fory, et fedeg safaaal & gaar & s ot <5 &
T e T S, S o o STavae gud, w1 & qeeEr fartEa S o gefi
W1 G&H 1 oF] ITH H IR 5 L.

FEERTOT, — 39 ¥ % YIS % Ty, ged SEd aun oY STH o gt otd g ST Yged, o qe
T SUH o SRR, Q008 (008 T W) T HNT\e Y TTHN () % @UE (F)
F ITEUE (TF) q41 (])) § 7 fau fer mw €. 7.

Q. ot AfafTom &) ¥R u] & 39U (R) H, W (F) ¥ (¥) & WA W, e @

wifyq fory S, Stfq:—

) T UR T T (W BeE) % A % T STET S UE The 0 iU % @
T from §;

(@) fram-TEl % fou el & w9 8 37,
(M  Saifores yEeE % fag swEm;

(=) frenfirer wareH & for s,

(¥  enforfers gaeH & fae saa;

(@  wE AR Ete (ot sk fawm) afufrem, 2ue (2348 1 EY) & 31 & i
TG 922 o AHH B & YASH & o

(8) SWe wE (F) ¥ (7) # fafies fou o wasH 9 fa= gdisHl & fag sgan. '




Heayey TevE, feair 30 fegwa 20m

1180 (5)

R¢. A I &l g we w1 g fRa S

eR. A Iy &+t um ¢ H,—

(TH)

SN (%) & T W, Fefated suum wenfia & s, stei—

“s) TRl e % forg swEm it R gft W 3fad frafton g/ u] % et sE e

(=

el & ergEr foa fehan s,

IUURT (&) 1 oy fopam s,

0. T Ifufrm &t ¥ Qu # @ e S,

2. Tt sifufer &t ol /¢ H M W, Frefafed v wnfia # S, sefd—

“oe. FTH YA & TAy SwIm Y = Y it @ std o e ¢q # fu T fagial it

frefert 3 STTER Hfor e frad fean e @ik it iy v & fon swim &t s
it o7, Sfea fafeor art u) & e1efA aATe e fradl o STgew, T fohan s,

R A Afufm ) a /] &1 A fRE S

3. U AU # U 200 ¥ WM W, FreAfata g wenfaa & S, stuld—

“200,

37 yftEdl st g H, fom W o Traftor foredt U@ v % fo frn s e @1 fme 6
ey # 37eR! Fraitor e & Sk qd foman s g o, g el S 6 39 whR
ot feem o €1, St il = <o §, 9 -ToRa A1 I %, S TS0 6 2o Io
9 81, €8 T 9 Afes g €1 aun o fie Y <9 H, 39 - TS A A 6, S
gdteror % ek gd 3 B, 9% A W e1ferss g g, o frufter S v w6t g, @ -
TSTEd =1 & % 2% A % fedrs @ qen o= yft =t gon 8, T 9-TSd A1 I &
B8 T & fewe ¥ fora foran smom:

TR 5781 T % FESH % fory oifiia ferdlt @i H SUF U §RI A1 36 N o o7g W et

off o 1S Gur faen T 8, el U8 @ 1 fruiRor 39 weeR free faman smom A e
% GuR foran € &t o'

%, gal afufem &) ar g9% i SuMm (2) H, v 7=y’ % wE W, R uw geR

wnfig fu S,

GRT 94 <Rl BT
ST

T HT

e,

A

T %9 <Rl EeTH
&IT ¢ <hl WITUH,

sfem Frerteot.

gT ]R <Rl BT

gRT oo <hT

g WA
Sfea et =
T feram s

T 'R T

ylrem,

Y. o Afufrad @l u 2R¢ W IUER () H, T TH v 6 WM W, UK UH TR g gre T
T enfe fepw S, '

HyiTer.

€. Td Afufm &) U 3o H, Wk Ywu®’ F WH W, WK 'UTH g Wfd amr g30 @

fep =me,

Hyler.



1180 (6) HeAyey qedH, T 30 feams 2011

USRI R, o aAfufEm F uR 23R H, IR TH TR F WH W, Uk S TR e

R, fer i,

T R3% @I ¢, ya SfufEm W um 233 ¥ wr W, frefafea g el w5, st

T,

qTAT HT gETAT “q33. 9 forelt deEieier i g8 wdid B o IS smen fordt o ot farelt A g S, Uy

S 11wt i 3 srery S H arge grerdt § A fored ferelt Tel weeh = et Tl
91 e T H, ST URT 233 % a7efiA ot fafresra o fawe @ R, sTgeA ued €, Al 9%
X =1 F foru SRl =af 1 S8 geM 1 SR € TR SR, A% GH =l 39
STRYT T STAAE 7 L A1 I8 IH SN B A1 TR 3R IWF T4 S 1 @ T
AR QSRS T R d U Ao, dReieer % W fafed s % oref, fored
TR ¥ qedt oii uffeufd = wem foren e g1, WE wnfi o SRR S ST W BN
T I i B G

gTT %3 @7 Q. Ha afufteEm w5 uR ¥y §, g e’ % owm W, v CE wenfyd fee

RS

T g% T 30, & sifufam &t o/ e’ H,—

wolrer,

(TF)  IUuRI (%) B, g S TR B98O T W, Ve ' Ut Srvafda fH % SR qed
() SuEW (4) #, v D eR T % T W, v UE srmEfdd fH o STei qed 6

S wfrer’ der veg, ¢ ue | TR & T W, YeE ¢ U TR T T feR S,

gl Roo @I 32, qol SIUFRE F U 00 H, Teg U T FH WH W, ¥ S SR et fRe S

e,

T RR9 T 33, 4w fufaw =t o/ R0 #, v W 6 TH W, e CUH TR

Teite.

gRT R3¥  &HT 3% HA Afyfm Ft U 3% ff,-—

e,

(TF)  S9EE () & o W, Frefafiaa soum wonfua =t s, stafq:—

“(R) TR T 1 UTET U A TR fohan ST S T | T gesre! &l sy
FW F T9ENR SH ITETE et g oifqw wu fen S

(B)  SUER (3) % T W, frefafed saum wfia ot S, steid—
“(3) W oiftm fraR T 9 U ufa UM UeEd % wEed # o S

(dF)  Suum (3) % e, Efafed sgam wenfud st Sy, s9id:—

“(¥) T | g ST% UMk T HAgH i 9l A ¥ %1 91 fRE wewl & "gha
¥ RG Heed W, ITEUS YN, hefaed HI d STIAN § qen UH Tt s
% Ty o fm T sfea T, —

() TR wer o) gfafy o afedT s g,

(@) umErEE % stfafaa far o & afysrl w1 0 w0 & fog fEr
o &1 et wfafy & erdi erfaften gaa feq vfa sfefan = e




Teqyeel eTad, fedie 30 fegrwer 201 1180 (7)
3¥. 4o gt w5 9| k3w H,— ORI %38 W
(TH) 3R (R) 1 &M famar §g; e
() 3UEW (3) & A R Frafafea am wenfed st s, stafq:—
“(3) 39 gfed & el wMw U freml % stemeld @A gU, sy, IUEW (R)
gvg (@) ¥ aftfa ft =1 39 7 & $a Ffvw Jff & FAad @ gfdwd 96
G T % uvEm, Suuw () H affa U swe fEw ufF o everd ws,
T, T, arersn, sredaren, foramerdl, weifarEner, Mremensti & fraior @ o=
et 57 Syar ufEisme & fag, S # Tew SR g STEdiia sl S,
ZUafdd TR
W 3TH () H afola g % fag o w@it w8yt feel off st 5 i v
¥ fou =gafda o eneifeq 71 = smod. s
() 39N (3) & uvem, Freafafes g siawenfia =t s, suiq:—
) @ IR (R) W Seaifad wasHl & faw gus @ w18 9fH o, Ul o
3R ereirEceT qfEsme St U9 TR % @i @ § @ ergEifed €, e
IUUW (3) F ol e omdht ¥, =uadd oufter €1 S ¥, @ weley, SuasH
farehedl TR STOHT THIEM T o & v SR Hete el § 3 frear stfuerr
1 gfd 0 % oI gaged 8wt 4fy iy o W off 39 ST @l e
3w WE X g, T8 wEeE & fau gft smafda s s
3y, T SHMIH T 911 %2 Y ITHW (¥) H, T U FIR h WM W, ¥ ' TEE geRT O UWT ¥R T
3. 79 Ifufm F 9w ve H,— aRT R¥e WT
(T&w) 3UEW (©) ¥, g T F WE W, U SR T wenfia fey Si; e
() STER () F IGH B« R g,
39, o Sfufm 1 ¥/ ¥¢ H,— IRT R¥e T
(T&) 379N () ¥, oesg ' v goR o0 & T W, v8 U stfussfid i o sem ge e
1 st gidera’ qen vieg o 70 S TE W, wss TR A &t e | vl #iR
TR &3 H S goIR T9d " wenfud fehu S
(R IUEN () FH A S
() Zoum (R-1) #, vk T I % A W, v ey 7™ wenfud feey =i,
3¢. 7o AAfufm & 9/ jue H,— ORI o T
(Th) 39U (&) H, s ' | vEE " & o W, vsg < wer ! wenfi feRe S '
() STEN (R) H ¥R Ui EOR T F T W, vRE CUE ff 3 ISR e 6 e
g’ wenfi fer
(dF)  3UHW (R) % WgH H @ foran s,
3. 7o AUl ot a1 ju3 H, e uiE g’ % W W, v gE R wfa Ry O 3w @ T
%o, Gl AAFUTTAH I U s B, WUE () H WIS (F-2) & ® H [Hhwifhd fral 0 R arr s w1
T9 YRR THhAIfRd @UE (F-2) & g4 Tefafead 791 wue ofa:wnfaa fem, s, steaid— Helrer.

Y U SRR 3T o) safar & | T W 1 SUE () % o1eit TR sifuer & dey
4 &1g fafre=a; "



1180 (8) Tergey T, feaie 30 femmr 2011

aare, feqie 30 fegsa 2011

. 5437-458-FHHTH-31 (WI.).— URd & GIAHM & T3 348 F WUE (3) & T H, ALY Y-Tsied Higan
(deheA) srfufem, 2011 (FHF 42, §9 2011) 1 SIS A ToaUl % WHMER F TaegN YRR fHan Sl €.

T & TSI & A F qe SASIER,
YT I1Ed, TR gfe.

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 42 or 2011.

THE MADHYA PRADESH LAND REVENUE CODE
(AMENDMENT) ACT, 2011

TABLE OF CONTENTS
Sections :

1. Short title.

2 Amendment of Section 2

3 Amendment of Section 30
4, Amendment of Section 34
5. Amendment of Section 35
6 Amendment of Section 36
7 Amendment of Section 46
8. Amendment of Section 47
9. Amendment of Section 49
10.  Substitution of Section 50
11.  Amendment of Section 51
12.  Amendment of Section 52
13.  Amendment of Section 53
14. Substitution of Section 54
15.  Amendment of Section 57
16. Insertion of Section 58-B
17. Amendment of Section 59
18. Deletion of Section 78

19.  Amendment of Section 81
20. Deletion of Section 97

21. Substitution of Section 98
22. Deletion of Section 99

23.  Substitution of Section 100
24.  Amendment of Section 119
25.  Amendment of Section 128
26.  Amendment of Section 130
27. Amendment of Section 132
28.  Substitution of Section 133
29.  Amendment of Section 143
30. Amendment of Section 172
31.  Amendment of Section 200
32.  Amendment of Section 227
33. Amendment of Section 234
34.  Amendment of Section 237
35.  Amendment of Section 241
36.  Amendment of Section 247
37.  Amendment of Section 248
38.  Amendment of Section 250
39.  Amendment of Section 253
40.  Amendment of Section 257



Hegqyey Uy, {30 fegwr 2011

1180 (9)

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 42 or 2011.

THE MADHYA PRADESH LAND REVENUE CODE
(AMENDMENT)ACT, 2011

{Received the assent of the Governor on the 27th December, 2011; assent first published in the "Madhya Pradesh
Gazette (Extra-ordinary)”, dated the 30th December, 2011.]

An Act further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Land Revenue Code, 1959.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the Sixty-second year of the Republic
of India-as follows :—

1. This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Land Revenue Code (Amendment) Act,
2011.

2. In sub-section (1) of Section 2 of the Madhya Pradesh Land Revenue Code, 1959
(No. 20 of 1959) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), after clause (0), the following clause
shall be inserted, namely :— "

“(0a) “Market Value” means the value of land assessed according to guidelines issued by
the Collector under the Madhya Pradesh Bajar Mulya Margdarshak Siddhanton ka
Banaya Jana Tatha Unka Punrikshan Niyam, 2000 made under the Indian Stamp
Act, 1899 (No. 2 of 1899);”.

3. In sub-section (1) of Section 30 of the Principal Act, for the words “A Collector, a Sub-
Divisional Officer, or a Tahsildar”, the words “A Collector or a Sub-Divisional Officer” shall be
substituted.

4. In section 34 of the Principal Act, in clause (c), for the word “fifty”, the words “one
thousand” shall be substituted.

5. In sub-section (3) of Section 35 of the Principal Act, for the- word “apply”, the words
“apply along with his affidavit” shall be substituted.

6. In sub-section (1) of Section 36 of the Principal Act, for full stop, the colon shall be
substituted and thereafter the following proviso shall be added, namely —

“Provided that each party may be granted not more than three adjournments during the entire
hearing of the case and each such adjournment should be granted only with cost.”.

7. In clause (a) of Section 46 of the Principal Act, for the words, figures and bracket “the
Indian Limitation Act, 1908 (IX of 1908)”, the words, figures and bracket “the Limitation Act,
1963 (36 of 1963)” shall be substituted.

8. In Section 47 of the Principal Act,—

(i) in clause (a), for the words “forty-five days”, the words “thirty days” shall be
substituted,;

(i1) in clause (b), for the words “sixty days”, the words “forty-five days™ shall be
substituted;

(i13) in clause (c), for the words “ninety days”, the words “sixty days” shall be

substituted;

Short title.

Amendment
Section 2.

Amendment
Section 30.

Amendment
Section 34.

Amendment
Section 35.

Amendment
Section 36.

Amendment
Section 46.

Amendment
Section 47.

of

of

of

of

of



1180 (10) qeqyeyl UoTas, feare 30 fewws 2011

(iv) for the first proviso, the following proviso shall be substituted, namely :—

“Provided that where the order, against which the appeal is being preferred, made before the
coming into force of the Madhya Pradesh Land Revenue Code (Amendment) Act,
2011, in such case appeal shall be entertained within the time limit provided in the
Code prior to this said Amendment Act.”.

Amf}“dme“t of 9. In Section 49 of the Principal Act, for sub-section (3), the following sub-section shail be
Section 49. substituted, namely :—

“(3) After hearing the parties, the appellate authority may confirm, vary or reverse the order
appealed against, or may take such additional evidence as it may consider necessary
for passing its order :

Provided that the appellate authority shall not remand the case for disposal by any Revenue
Officer subordinate to it:

Provided further that all such cases which have been remanded to the sub-ordinate Revenue
Officers by the Appellate or Revisional Authorities before the commencement of the
Madhya Pradesh Land Revenue Code (Amendment) Act, 2011 shall be heard and
decided by such Revenue Officer.”.

Substitution of 10. For section 50 of the Principal Act, the following section shall be substituted,
Section 50. namely —

Revision. “50. (1) The Board may, at any time on its motion or on the application made by any party or
the Collector or the Settlement Officer may, at any time on his motion, call for the record of any case
which has been decided or proceeding in which an order has been passed by any Revenue Officer
subordinate to it or him and in which no appeal lies thereto, and if it appears that such subordinate
Revenue Officer—

(a) has exercised a jurisdiction not vested in him by this Code, or
(b) has failed to exercise a jurisdiction so vested, or
(c) has acted in the exercise of his jurisdiction illegally or with material irregularity,

the Board or the Collector or the Settlement Officer may make such order in the case as it
or him thinks fit:

Provided that the Board or the Collector or the Settlement Officer shall not, under this
section, vary or reverse any order made, or any order deciding an issue, in the
course of the proceeding, except where,—

(a) the order, if it had been made in favour of the party applying for revision to the
Board, would have finally disposed of the proceedings, or

(b) the order, if allowed to stand, would occasion a failure of justice or cause irreparable
injury to the party against whom it was made.

(2) The Board or Collector or the Settlement Officer shall not, under this section vary or reverse
any order against which an appeal lies either to the Board or to any Revenue Officer subordinate
thereto.



Hegey Tove, fedie 30 fewmw 2011

1180 (11)

(3) A revision shall not operate as a stay of proceeding before the Revenue Officer except where
such proceeding is stayed by the Board or the Collector or the Settlement Officer, as the case may
be.

(4) No application for revision shall be entertained.-—
(a) against an order appealable under this Code;
(b) against an order to the Settlement Commissioner under section 210;
(c) unless presented within sixty days to the Board:

Provided that where the order, against which the application for revision is being presented,
made before the coming into force of the Madhya Pradesh Land Revenue Code
(Amendment) Act, 2011, in such case revision shall be entertained within ninety
days from the date of order.

(5) No order shall be varied or reversed in revision unless notice has been served on the parties
interested and opportunity given to them of being heard.

(6) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1),—

(i) where proceedings in respect of any case have been commenced by the Board under sub-
section (1), no action shall be taken by the Collector or the Settlement Officer in
respect thereof;

(ii) where proceeding in respect of any such case have been commenced by the Collector
or the Settlement Officer under sub-section (1), the Board may either rafrain from
taking any action under this section in respect of such case until the final disposal
of such proceedings by the Collector or the Settlement Officer, as the case may be,
or may withdraw such proceedings and pass such order as it may deem fit.

Explanation.—For the purpose of this section all Revenue Officers shall be deemed to be
subordinate to the Board.”.

11. In clause (iii) of the proviso to sub-section (1) of Section 51 of the principal Act, for
the words “ninety days”, the words “sixty days” shall be substituted and for full stop, the colon
shall be substituted and thereafter the following proviso shall be inserted, namely :—

“Provided that where the order, against which the application for review is being presented,
made before the coming into force of the Madhya Pradesh Land Revenue Code
(Amendment) Act, 2011, in such case review shall be entertained within ninety days
from the date of order.

12. In Section 52 of the Principal Act,—
(1) in sub-section (2), for full stop, the colon shall be substituted and thereafter the following
proviso shall be inserted, namely :—

“Provided that the execution of arder shall not be stayed for more than three months at a
time or until the date of next hearing, whichever is earlier.”;

Amendment of
Section 51.

Amendment of
Section 52.



1180 (12)

Heqyee TN, faie 30 femrar 2011

Amendment of
Section 53.

Substitution of
Section 54.

Pending revisions

Amendment of
Section 57.

Insertion of
Section 58-B.

Half of the
assessed land
revenue shall be
payable for
holding used
exclusively for
the purpese of a
project of micro
and small
enterprise.

Amendment of
Section 59.

Deletion of
Section 78.

(i1) in sub-section (3), for full stop, the colon shall be substituted and thereafter the following
proviso shall be inserted, namely :—

“Provided that the execution of order shall not be stayed for more than three months at a
time or until the date of next hearing, whichever is earlier.”.

13. In Section 53 of the principal Act for the words, figures and bracket “Indian Limitation
Act, 1908 (IX of 1908)”, the words, figures and bracket “ Limitation Act, 1963 (36 of 1963)”
shall be substituted and for the word “review”, the words “review and revision” shall be substituted.

14. For Section 54 of the principal Act, the following section shall be substituted,
namely :—

“54, Notwithstanding anything contained in this chapter, all proceedings pending in revision
before any Revenue Officer immediately before the coming into force of the Madhya Pradesh Land
Revenue Code (Amendment) Act, 2011 shall be heard and decided by such Revenue Officer as if this
amendment Act had not been passed.”.

15. In Section 57 of the principal Act,—

(i) in sub-section (2), for the words “Sub-divisional Officer” the words “State Government”
shall be substituted;
(i1) sub-sections (3) and (4) shall be deleted.

16. After Section 58-A of the principal Act, the following section shall be inserted,
namely :—

“58-B. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Code, only half of the assessed land
revenue shall be payable in respect of a holding upto two hectares used exclusively for the purpose
of a project of micro and small enterprise.

(2) For the purpose of sub-section (1), the Collector shall, after affording reasonable
opportunity of being heard to the persons interested and after making such enquiry as he may
deem necessary, decide that the concerning holding is of project of micro and small enterprise.

Explanation.—For the purpose of this Section, the micro enterprise and small enterprise shall
have the same meaning as assigned to them in sub-clause (i) and (ii) of clause (a) of sub-section
(1) of Section 7 of the Micro, Small and Medium Enterprises Development Act, 2006 (No. 27 of
2006).”.

17. In sub-section (1) of Section 59 of the principal Act, for clause (a) to (e}, the following
clauses shall be substituted, namely :—

“(a) for the purpose of agriculture of such farm house which is situated on holding of
one acre or more;

(b) as sites for dwelling houses;

(©) for educational purpose;

(d) for industrial purpose;

(e) for commercial purpose

(f) for the purpose of mining under a mining lease within the meaning of the Mines
and Minerals (Regulation and Development) Act, 1957 (No. 67 of 1959);

(2) for purpose other than those specified in items (a) to (f) above.”.

18. Section 78 of the principal Act shall be deleted.



Heggey Usa, fadi 30 fegrs 2011

19. In Section 81 of the principal Act,—
(1) for sub-section (4), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely :—

“(4) the fair assessment on land used for non-agricuitural purpose shall be fixed in
accordance with the rules made under section 59.”;

(i) sub-section (6) shall be deleted.
20. Section 97 of the principal Act shall be deleted.
21. For Section 98 of the principal Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely :—

“98. The fair assessment of lands used for agricultural purpose shall be calculated and fixed
in accordance with the principles and restrictions set forth in Section 81 and lands used for non-
agricultural purpose shall be fixed in accordance with the rules made under section 59.”.

22. Section 99 of the principal Act shall be deleted.
23. For Section 100 of the principal Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“100. In the case of lands which are being assessed for a purpose with reference to which
they were assessed immediately before the revision, the assessment so arrived at exceeds, in the
case of agricultural land one and a half times the land revenue or rent and in the case of other
lands six times the land revenue or rent payable immediately before the revision the assessment
shall be fixed at one and a half times such land revenue or rent in the case of agricultural land
and at six times such land revenue or rent in the case of other lands:

Provided that where an improvement has been effected at any time in any holding held for
the purpose of agriculture by or at the expense of the holder thereof, the assessment of such holding
shall be fixed as if the improvement had not been made.”.

24. In sub-section (1) of Section 119 of the principal Act, for the word “twenty-five”, the
words “one thousand” shall be substituted.

25. In sub-section (2) of Section 128 of the principal Act, for the words “one rupee”, the
words “one thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

26. In Section 130 of the principal Act, for the word “fifty”, the words “one thousand” shali
be substituted.

27. In Section 132 of the principal Act, for the word “one thousand”, the words “ten
thousand” shall be substituted.

28. For Section 133 of the principal Act, the following Section shall be substituted, namely :—

“133. If a Tahsildar finds that any obstacle impedes the free use of a recognised road, path
or common land of a village or impedes the road or water course or source of water which has
been the subject of a decision under section 131, he may order the person responsible for such
obstacle to remove it and if such person fails to comply with the order, may cause the obstacle
to be removed and may recover from such person the cost of removal thereof and such person
shall be liable, under the written order of a Tahsildar stating the facts and circumstances of the
case, to a penalty with may extend to ten thousand rupees.”.

1180 (13)
Amendment of
Section 81.
Deletion of
Section 97.
Substitution of
Section 98.

Fair assessment.

Deletion of
Section 99.

Substitution of
Section 100.

Fixation of fair
assessment at the
time of revision.

Amendment of
Section 119.

Amendment of
Section 128.

Amendment of
Section 130.

Amendment of
Section 132.

Substitution of
Section 133.

Removal of
obstruction.



1180 (14)

Ty TS, feai 30 fagmr 2011

Amendment of
Section 143.

Amendment of
Section 172.

Amendment of
Section 200.

Amendment of
Section 227,

Amendment of
Section 234,

Amendment of
Section 237.

29. In Section 143 of the Principal Act, for the word “ten”, the word “hundred” shall be
substituted.

30. In Section 172 of the Principal Act,—

(i) in sub-section (4), for the words “two thousand rupees”, the words “twenty per centum
of the market value of such diverted land” shall be substituted,

(i1) in sub-section (5), for the words “two thousand rupees”, the words “twenty per centum
of the market value of such diverted land” and for the words “one hundred rupees”,
the words “one thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

31. In Section 200 of the Principal Act, for the words “two hundred”, the words “two
thousand” shall be substituted.

32. In Section 227 of the Principal Act, for the word “twenty”, the words “one thousand”
shall be substituted.

33. In section 234 of the Principal Act,
(1) for sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely :—

“(2) A draft of the Nistar Patrak shall be published in the village and after ascertaining
the wishes of the Gram Sabha, it shall be finalised by Sub-Divisional Officer.”;

(ii) for sub-section (3), the following sub-section shalil be substituted, namely :—

“(3) A copy of the Nistar Patrak so finalised shall be kept in the office of the Gram
Panchayat.”;

(iii) after sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely :—

“(4) On a resolution passed by the Gram Sabha by a majority of not less than two
thirds of the members present and voting, the Sub-Divisional Officer with the
prior sanction of the Collector and also after making any such inquiry as he
deems fit, may,—

(a) inter se change the entries in the Nistar Patrak;

(b) record additional unoccupied land under any entry in the Nistar Patrak for
fulfillment of further Nistar rights of villagers.”.

34. In section 237 of the Principal Act,—
(i) sub-section (2) shall be deleted;
(i) for sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely :—

“(3) Subject to the rules made under this Code, the Collector after securing the land
mentioned in clause (b) of sub-section (1) to minimum two percent of the total
agriculture land of that village, may divert such unoccupied land as mentioned
in sub-section (1) into abadi or for construction of roads, state highways,
national highways, canals, tanks, hospitals, schools, colleges, Goshalas and any
other public utility projects as may be determined by the State Government:



[eygey U9, fearer 30 fogwr 2011

1180 (15)

Provided that the land set apart for the purposes mentioned in sub-section (1) shall
not be diverted and allotted to any person for agriculture purpose.;

(iii) after sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely :—

“(4) When it becomes indispensable to divert the land set apart for the purposes
mentioned in sub-section (1) for such development and infrastructural projects
which are owned or approved by the State Government but not covered under
sub-section (3), the Collector, after satisfying himself on alternatives available
and also on obtaining land of equivalent area for fulfilling the same Nistar
rights from the concerned project, may divert the land for such purposes by

passing a reasoned order to this effect.”.

35. In sub-section (4) of Section 241 of the Principal Act, for the words “five thousand”,
the words “fifty thousand“ shall be substituted.

36. In Section 247 of the Principal Act,—
(1) in sub-section (7), for the word “double”, the words “four times” shall be substituted;
(i1} proviso to sub-section (7) shall be omitted.

37. In Section 248 of the Principal Act,—

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words “five thousand rupees”, the words “twenty per centum
of the market value of such encroached land” and for the words “twenty rupees”,
the words “five hundred rupees in non urban area and two thousand rupees in urban
area” shall be substituted;

(11) sub-section (2) shall be omitted;

(iii) in sub-section (2-A), for the words “three months”, the words “six months” shall be
substituted.

38. In section 250 of the Principal Act,—

(i) in sub-section (6), for the words “two hundred and fifty”, the words “two thousand” shall
be substituted;

(i1) in sub-section (9), for the words “five thousand rupees”, the words “twenty per centum
of the market value of such land” shall be substituted;

(ii1) proviso to sub-section (9) shall be omitted.

39. In section 253 of the Principal Act, for the words “five thousand”, the words “fifty
thousand™ shall be substituted.

40. In section 257 of the Principal Act, clause (a) shall be renumbered as clause (a-1) and
before clause (a-1) as so renumbered, the following new clause shall be inserted, namely :—

“(a) any decision regarding any right under sub-section (1) of Section 57 between the State
Government and any person;”.

Amendment of
Section 241.

Amendment of
Section 247.

Amendment of
Section 248.

Amendment of
Section 250,

Amendment of
Section 253.

Amendment of
Section 257.

Freores, TTHERTT GEO1 @ SE O, TETRY G WY HS0a GEIer, e | i e geiie—2011.



