Y JIHES WWw.govtpressmp.nic.in ¥
ff TRA @re foran 1w €.

wHF 224 " oo, wfear, fedis 5 92 2012—99Rg 15, WE 1934

fafy ek faurdt = favm
a9, feaiw 5 @8 2012

. 2569-178-FFRG-3I(. ). —weayRy faum aw & frafafaa sifufem 59 = faiw 3 7€, 2012 =1 we™eq
TIUA T STTAN W B I T, TASEN TR B SIHER % fad gemifya e sm .

TAYRY & A & AW H qAl SRR,
TSAYT I1Ed, 3T |iaa,

Heageyt Afuf=m

HH% 3 G RoR

HeAUQYT (9T AT WS 9dq, Wl 9o Vo (99neT )
=, 2093

faer-g=h.

wfem =,

YN ¥ T HAEA
R ¥-@ HT G
g7 ¥~ T GIMEHA.
N 4 T FINEA
T 4-TF T GIEA.
R §-F H AN
W &% H HINEA.
R €~ T GIMEH.

ER N LU S

447



448

HegyRyl U9, f&ie 5 2 2012

YT ¢ HT WYL,

T ¥-W AT

BN
gRT ¥-T &
wyhe.
4R & AT EIiTer.

gRT %-" 6T

T9Ner.

gNT §-<h &7

gT &§-E& <7

TYTer.

T &-T AT

T

Hegest Tfafay

AR 33 T R02R

HAYQYT TaeMT 9T HEE e, Ul aer U9 (HIne)

arfafEd, 0%
[ feriier 3 W, R0%R WY oAUl it SrRT W g orfAf ‘ WeANReT T (ST )” § i« W, R0eR W
THAR WIS ht T |

ey fagm o wee I, W aen e eiffad, 2wk @l iR wuifud e o ifufe.

kA TORSE % fREsd af § wergly faum-ned g fr=fafes w9 & 9%
Aty § —

2. 3q afufqam =1 Wi - Aeggee faum 99 9e9 o9d, w1 9um UvH  (HueE)
afufy, 093 ®.

R, HEAURYT Torer ET W 3, W e Yo SifufEm, 91197 (RIS @ | 2]03 ) (STl
ok Uy WA fafem o | fAfde ) = o ¢ # v HietE TR % i W v e
TR Tenfua fed S,

3. 9 AU &l anr ¥-@ ¥, veg O TR o WM W OveE 'ed g nfud

¥. g fufem &t o ¥-7 °, v (Ui TR h e W veE e T wnfud
fwar <.

y. get i st o o H, visg ' uie W oh T W e ¢ Ueh s vt foRd T,

&, et Sl &t 4 «-& ¥, ITuT (R ) % oy Fetalea 15 s staswentia wt
. et —

“(3) W fufaa & Sussl wX ufage T T for, <igl @i v Heayest T
o iR Uk T W Y T dek aTgar 9 AT I €, | 9% U A o fag
A & e it wiqufd @1 gwer g

U] 39 SULT o e Qe amsit &t ot W wided widie 9 sifies i grh.

m.tgfa?&rﬁmﬁam&mﬁ,mv (%) ¥,—
(T ) wrifues TTE W e 9 TR R TIM W, VIS U UE e wenfud
TR ITd;
(Br) vuw Wge #, I VA Y o W W, v ute | wenfud ey T,
¢. A IMUFEH T aT £-9 H, I UiE TR F WM W, VK 'T9 R i
ferT <.
. g AT T amT §-T H, veg C'UiE g R WM W, e ' g’ wenfua
TR <,



HEYEY U, fei 5 g 2012 448 (1)

g, f&aren 5 W8 2012

. 2570-178-3H -3 (W.).—HRA & Gfa9M & T8 348 % WU (3) & STER0 H Heayey faum &
- GEE, o, Wal a1 UeH (Fee) sifufeam, 2012 (SREIE 23 T 2012) T S STAE TS % TSR | UG
BEINGRE RIS G

TYCY & T o H § a7 QUK
THYT Aq1ed, TR afa.

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 23 oF 2012

THE MADHYA PRADESH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA TATHA
PENSION (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 2012

TABLE OF CONTENTS
Sections

Short title.

Amendment of section 4.
Amendment of section 4-B.
Amendment of section 4-C.
Amendment of section 5.
Amendment of section 5-B
Amendment of section 6-A.
Amendment of section 6B.
Amendment of section 6-C.

S R N

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 23 oF 2012

THE MADHYA PRADESH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA TATHA
PENSION (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 2012

[Received the assent of the Governer on the 3rd may, 2012 assent first published in the “Madhya Pradesh Gazette
(Extra-ordinary)”, dated the 5th May, 2012.]

An Act further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha
Pension Adhiniyam, 1972.

Be it enacted by the Médhya Pradesh Legislature in the sixty-third year of the Republié of
India as follow:—

1. This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Short title.
Pension (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2012.

2. In section 4 of the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension Am?“d‘::em of
Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), for the words section 4.
“Sixteen thousand’’, the words “twenty five thousand’’ shall be substituted.

3. In section 4-B of the prinicipal Act, for the words “four thousand’, the words “ten Amendment of
thousand’” shall be substituted. section 4-B.

4. In section 4-C of the Principal Act, for the words “five thousand”’, the words “ten Amendment of
thousand’” shall be substituted. section 4-C.



448 (2)

Hegyeyl TN, faies 5 1 2012

Amendment of
section 5.

Amendment of
‘section 5-B

Amendment of
section 6-A.

Amendment of
section 6-B.

Amendment of
section 6-C.

5. In section 5 of the Principal Act, for the words “five hundred’’, the words “one thousand’
shall be substituted.

6. In section 5-B of the Principal Act, after sub-section (2), the following new sub-section
shall be inserted, namely:—

“(3) Without prejudice to the provisions of this Act, where a member travels by air
within the State of Madhya Pradesh from one place to another, he shall be

entitled to reimbursement of the air fare of such journey:

Provided that the total number of such journeys under this sub-section shall not be more
than thirty four per year.”.

7. In section 6-A of the principal Act, in sub-section (1),—

(1) in the opening paragraph, for the words “seven thousand’’, the words *‘fifteen
thousand’’ shall be substituted;

(ii) in the first proviso, for the words “three hundred’’, the words “five hundred”’
shall be substituted.

8. In section 6-B of the principal Act, for the words “five thousand’’, the words “ten
thousand’’ shall be substituted.

9. In section 6-C of the principal Act, for the words “five thousand’’, the words “ten
thousand™’ shall be substituted.

Frei=e, TS qEO1 a1 ET S, THyEy 51 IS R HEOned, e | qikd a7 TEia—2012.



