T Ja9RE www.govtpressmp.nic.in ¥
+ff =T we famar s weh 7.

HHE 11] AT, 9UaR, feie o SHadt 2013—9W 19, W6 1934

fafy otk faur =&t favm

g, e 9 Sed 2013

. 149-11-3FHIE-31 (1. )/ —weagey faum 9w w1 frafataa sfufrag g w e 8 s9ad, 2013 ==
HEMiEH T %1 STAR W= B g1 ¥, TGEN TAHIgRy B SHeh % fau yefva R sw .

[y & TSI F A0 ¥ qdl ARIMER,
%, . @M, T ufea,

21



22 [eayRy e, fEAiw 9 SHad 2013

Ty Afufrm
HHAE ¥ T R0%3.
TEAUQYT STferererTl shoanuT T (H9ner ) siffm, RogR.

[ femtien ¢ Salt, 03 WY TGUTe! i SFATT I gE, vyl ' neayer Toru ( swmror) !, # fetwm § S e,
30693 Y W S WeRITITd &t 7. ]

TeAYAYT Nferaer sheanor e stfufrm, fk¢R =Y SR wyiiftm & & afufEm
R TR ¥ forwed o # nenRy faym-wved gw frafafed w1 A ww sfufEia @ —

N N—— {. 59 srfufr w1 dftra T AR siftesan weamr Ty (deiem) stfufEm, 0% ®

- R. HeawRy fyerr Heart fafy sifufem, 9¢r (FFHE Q T 2’¢R) (St T9H $HH TER A

woirer, sAfafm & T ¥ ffde ®) ® Ui 2¢ #, S99 (R) & WA W, Frefafed Suumn wnfid w1 s,
31917?[:-—-

() T wER, Herwew fafuw ufteg 3Rt ME eremden W, U@ wew H oK Ud dfa #,
v o fafere uftag % womet 3 fafia foran S, sie wuw SR o T9¢ 7 3 TR
wE, B W o ey sifasa et fify wr' sifwea g9, qika Uit @
ke wra@tt ok 7 faaww ok fasra 3 fafuw fteg =6t wem 2o wihwm wHiem
¥ MER R fHa smom. '

gRT %] T 3. T oifufem &t um g] H,—
(T®) 399 () ¥, I Y8 v ¥ wE W, v i e’ iy fee S
@) SuEm () # v YA v F WH W), v Cqarg v’ e fe S,

W9, feqis 9 SHad 2013

. 150-11-3FRIG-31 (W)/31fY, —9Ra & Hiaum & ST{% 348 & WIS (3) & FATERY H, AWy sTfererrn
Feam Ty (Henee) sifufm, 2012 (FHT® 4 T 2013) T STISH STAR TSI9A & WIFUHR | TaggRI TR femn
S ®.

TEAYT & TSI F AH ¥ a1 SRR,
&*. 8. @M, @ 9fba.
MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 4 or 2013.

THE MADHYA PRADESH ADHIVAKTA KALYAN NIDHI (SANSHOCHAN)
ADHINIYAM, 2012.

[Received the assent of the Governor on the 8th January, 2013; assent first published in the "Madhya Pradesh
Gazette (Extra-ordinary)", dated the 9th January, 2013.]

An Act further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the Sixty-third year of the Republic of
India as follows :—

Short title. 1. This Act may be called Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi (Sanshodhan)
Adhiniyam, 2012.



Heqyey Tergd, feqie 9 e’ 2013

22 (1)

2. In Section 18 of the Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982 (No. 9 of
1982) (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act), for sub-section (1), the following sub-section
shall be substituted, namely:~—

“(D The State Government shall, on the requisition made by the Bar Council of
Madhya Pradesh, print or cause to be printed in such form and in such manner
as may be prescribed in consultation with the Bar Council, adhesive stamps bear-
ing the words “Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Stamp” of the value
of twenty rupees and fifty rupees for being supplied to the Bar Council for dis-
tribution and sale on 10 percent commission basis.".

3. In Section 19 of the Principal Act,—

(1) in sub-section (1), for the words “ten rupees”, the words “twenty rupees” shall
be substituted;

(i) in sub-section (2), for the words “twenty rupees”, the words “fifty rupees” shall
be substituted.

Amendment of
Section 18.

Amendment of
Section 19.

T, e RO A S T, WY B YRTEE HEE EOed, die § g 99 Teive—2013.



