T JAES www.govtpressmp.nic.in
J off TRA e frw s g ©.

IS 398 ] Iy, GYaR, fEAiw 18 oS 2018—3H1g 27, Wh 1940

fafy siix faurh s faam

ofrurer, & 18 S[AE 2018

. 11832-236-SFhIE-31 (WI,) A, —aeauey faum | &1 fr=fafea sitafem g w e
16 J[ETE 2018 T TIU WEIAT ht THA WK & IH T, TAGgN FAEERY B DR & ford
JRIfeE foran S ©.

TEAYRY & TSI & H § qAT QIR
TSIYT ITEd, 3T i,

Heauayr At

HHH 2R T 02¢
WA 9 (Hole ) sfufrem, 026

[ faieh 28 TETE R0%¢ Y TSI Y AT wIe gE; Al AeAuET U (rErener)”’ #  faAiw 2o e,
309¢ I WIHEAR YeRifSTd st TTE, ]

TeAyRYT A fufEm, 00 WY T WG wA ¥ AfufrEm.
IR TN % SAETRd ad # mewey favm-ved gw fefated vy A ¥w erfulatng € —
. () =W ifufem @1 dfra T AeAERY 92 (WeieE) sifufEm, R0%¢ € dfyg i
() ¥ gAYy U9 H 3OS UM B aRE ¥ WD BT e

795



796 HeEYSY TS, fEAi® 18 s 2018

URT ¥& WT R.  HEAYRY A< ST, Ro00) (A Ro T RooR) Fl YN ¥§ H,—

(TH) S (4) F gH H, Ieg ' iR srdielt mitepit S Folel 79 & ofiax ot 1
froera son’’ +1 A9 e S

(A) SR (¢) § TUg (&) ¥, T A6y welel T & WA W, T ¢ TSy
Foigl A’ wenfyg few S,

(A7) Suaw (R) H, wee et Feler AW WH W, wg ¢ orgareg weiel J’
Toifya fou <imd.

A, &6 18 @R 2018

. 11832-236-FFHIG-31 (W.)AMU.—9RA & W™ & ] 348 & WU (3) & S H, HEAUSY 92
(GEie) aifufrm, 2018 (AR 19 T 2018) i IS 3TEE T=IURl & WYSR § TASgRT Yafer ffan St &,

AEIYRY & TSIUIEl o AW 9 ql STRUHER,
TS Ired, AR [iad.

MADHYA PRADESHACT
NO. 19 OF 2018

THE MADHYA PRADESH VAT (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2018

[Received the assent of the Governor on the 16th July 2018; assent first published in the “Madhya Pradesh Gazette
(Extra-ordinary)’’, dated the 18th July, 2018.]

An Act further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Vat Act, 2002.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the sixty-ninth year of the Republic of
India as follows:—

Short title and 1. (1) This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Vat (Amendment) Act, 2018.

commencement.

(2)  Itshall come into force from the date of its publication in the Madhya Pradesh Gazette.

gmt‘fnd';lzﬂt of 2. In Section 46 of the Madhya Pradesh Vat Act, 2002 ( No. 20 of 2002 ),—
ection .

1) in proviso to sub-section (5), the words “and the Appellate Authority shall dispose of
the appeal within six calendar months” shall be omitted;

(i) - in sub-section (8), in clause (a), for the words “twenty four calendar months”, the
words “forty eight calendar months” shall be substituted;

(iii)  in sub-section (9), for the words “twenty four calendar months”the words “forty
eight calendar months” shall be substituted.

e, TR RO G OREA W, TEARY B0 YT T HRUTeH, et ¥ T cen yeidh—2018.



