TH JFEEE www.govtpressmp.nic.in
A +ff TR A v s w €.

IR 422 ] iure, wiHeR, fRAF 28 a8 2018—41€0 6, TF 1940

fafy iR faurh =rf faum
i, feAie 28 S[eE 2018
F. 12531-253-FR G- )iy, —geauey faum ww = Fafafeg stfufam 9w e
25 @ 2018 ! TSI HRIGAT St STTHIG T & Ih! &, TAGGNT FEHTERIT ht STTRR] o6 fordl wehtiv
R S 2. |

WY & TIIIA & A § qAT STRIMTHR,
YT ATEd, AR qfed.

843



844 negey TSI, i 28 S 2018

HeayeyTr ifutem

FHHIE 9 T 03¢

WeAYRYT WRUTAes fafir (Eoier ) rtufam, 20%¢

[ fertien R SEME, R0 ¢ Y TITUTeT Ft SR ITA g AR ¢ HeAwey To ( sramenr)” # R ve o,
R0%¢ W TUHER YR &t 7. ]

HeAUAST TRUTToer PR fufem, Qus WO Heawayr WRufeehT tfufmm, g8 @t 3t
dvifaa et ¥ afufrm.

qRd TORTSE F ITETRA g9 A "eayeyw faum-ded gy frmfafed €9 ® 9%
sfufafia & —

ifeea =, 3. 3O SfufEm @1 dfi M weEwRy Rdfaes oty (FeeA) afufrm, 0%¢

HIT T

uszru%w Jatferes Frm aifufram, ejus
(U 3 T QRUE) HT HHEA.

oy sfufEm 2. HEAYRY TR Frm sfafm, QRus (AR 33 T QRuE) H, 9 233-% H, SUHMM

®UEH W T () H—
L]YE HT U,

(tF) = ‘D IR F WA W, s A gfewa! v fee S

(}) v RS BRI W 39 YER WE e ool Yok b TR A ST e
faeprg &) ufESHIel 1 fFafeaa & & sreran WE el % frama % ol
Geift TRIfers FRM g 1orE 3T 3R ¥ fow sl @ gfaEe w6 A
i ST, ¥ M W, Uk '3 THR @ TN Sl Yk H A H ST
TT & ¥ TR s e, fewmed snam@ afEset, JE Y @
wftufaq #@ ¢ T ieaed @1 Tl o ufEseet % ol fon s @ . 59
YR I T H1 TR S Sfectiaa s F frarem vy fag e s
¥ gfaeier & fog o fean wn @, wenfam foeg smd,

O &

TEAYSIT TIRATIAHT MR, &%
(FHiF 39 T ¢REL) HT EIMEA.

e St 3. TEATY TR SR, 282 (FRHIE 3o T QR&Q) H, HW 9§ F, SWUR (R) H—
wAE 30 W

9]& 2 T HIer. (W) W S wher’ ¥ WE W, IR AW wfeva’’ et fea S

() v TRaifes aReg W TR 9N 1 3H YER W BN Al Yook w i #
I e faere w5 afEerel @ et we ® stear E aREsEet
¥ foparaad ¥ o deifua wwRrferRr afug o1 TR 9Rog gRT e IWH SN &
fore Tq o o e FW R S, % M W, 9 59 TER 9 g



Teyey ToaH, fEiw 28 e 2018 844 (1)

Tt Yok H AR w1 ST THE & H TR s o, e s
wfeisriel, B9 Y& i winfea wW gu e uieed o W o afEsEed %
‘ ferd fopan 1 WM. T YHR WG T B IT IWD Sfewtad ST &
y frarer ¥ fog e ol % uftEcE % fe off e s, vt fRe S

¥, (2) TRy TRUfAE fafy (deien) ISaRY 0%¢ (HHE & T R0%¢) W ffad e awn
foran s ®. =g,

() T STARY H P % B gC W, % WRY & A H T P A A K W I
FiaE, 30 Afufrm ¥ acur Iuedl F A it T 9@ W H T wiaR wHg S,

oo, &R 28 eI 2018

%. 12531-253- 39037 (T1.) 314 — 9IRA F G % STTIE 348 % WUE (3) F IITA H, ALY TRUIeTh
fafy (deiter) SIfufRIm, 08¢ (AT 9 T R0%¢) Wi 3fiSH TaR Toadrel % WiMEwR A TaggRT Fehim fean
ST R,

TEYRY % TSUE & AW A q7 ARAAR,

MADHYA PRADESHACT
NO. 27 OF 2018

THE MADHYA PRADESH NAGARPALIK VIDHI (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 2018

{Received the assent of the Governor on the 25th July, 2018; assent first published in the “Madhya Pradesh Gazette
(Extra-ordinary)’’, dated the 28th July, 2018.]

An Act further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1956 and the Madhya
Pradesh Municipalities Act, 1961. '

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the sixty-ninth year of the Republic of India
as follows :-

1. This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Nagarpalik Vidhi (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2018. Short title.

PART 1

AMENDMENT TO THE MADHYA PRADESH MUNICIPAL CORPORATION
ACT, 1956 (No. 23 OF 1956)

2. In the Madhya Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1956 (No. 23 of 1956), in section 133-A, in ﬁ::end$:3;1;;

sub-section (1),- Pradesh Act No.
23 of 1956.

) for the words “two per centum”, the words “ three per centum” shall be substituted;



844 (2) HeyRy U, T 28 (A 2018

(ii) for the words “The amount of duty so received to the Municipal Corporation shall be
used for implementation of infrastructure developments projects or for repayment of
loans taken for implementation of such projects by or on behalf of the concerned
Municipal Corporation.”, the words “The amount of duty so received may be used for
urban infrastructure development, affordable housing projects, urban transport in-
cluding metro rail or such other projects in urban areas. This amount so received may
also be used for repayment of loans taken for implementation of aforementioned
projects.” shall be substituted.

PART I
AMENDMENT TO THE MADHYA PRADESH MUNICIPALITIES ACT, 1961
(No. 37 OF 1961)

Amendment to 3. In the Madhya Pradesh Municipalities Act, 1961 (No. 37 of 1961), in section 161, in

the Madhya _ : .
Pradesh Act No. Su-section (1);

37 of 1961.
() for the words “two per centum”, the words “three per centum” shall be substituted;

(i) for the words “The amount of duty so received to the Municipal Council or Nagar
Parishad shall be used for implementation of infrastructure developments projects or
for repayment of loans taken for implementation of such projects by or behalf of the
concerned Municipal Council or Nagar Parishad:”, the words “The amount of duty so
received may be used for urban infrastructure development, affordable housing projects,
urban transport including metro rail or such other projects in urban areas. This amount
so received may also be used for repayment of loans taken for implementation of
aforementioned projects.” shall be substituted.

Repeal and 4.(1) The Madhya Pradesh Nagarpalik Vidhi (Sanshodhan) Adhyadesh,2018 (No. 6 of 2018)
saving. is hereby repealed. ‘

(2) Notwithstanding the repeal of the said Ordinance, anything done or any action taken under the
said Ordinance shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the corresponding provision of
this Act.

Freisrer, IO RO 9O SrE AR, HeAuRE S T e gRoner, el ¥ gfia qun weiria—2018.



