T ATUES www.govipressmp.nic.in q
off g+ &g ffan s wehan ®.

HHi% 30] Aiure, WHaR, feqis 27 SFE 2020—¥9 7 T 1941

fafy it faurht =6 faum
Gre, frise 27 S 2020

F. 1615-24-TFRT-31- (W1 ).—7eq9ey faum @ &1 Fr=fafea sifufem g w @i 27 swad 2020 aﬁv
TRTfEH TSIael H SIARN W & Yl ¥, Taag eEm F SHer ¥ fad g fear st €.

[EAYRY F ToII & AH U1 SRR,
YT g, TR Hfdd,

59



60 [eyey T, fedie 27 smad 2020
ey fufEm

Ficy zg T RoR0
HeAYRYT TWRUTerer fafer (Hvies ) afuf=m, 02R

[ fies e Wadt, RoR0 WY TAUTE I STHl WA g8, A * Heawawr v ( srarewor )" § feaisw qQaaaﬁ,
300 THT WUW HR WSHIVT i 8. ]

WUV TRt Frma sifufm, zaqammmaﬁﬁm, 2REQ ol 3R
wonfira et ¥ e,

- 9Rd ST ¥ Fed o # wenw faum-tea gri fefafea w9 F 7w afufEtie 8o
iy . g, 39 sIfufrm # dftra A weAnew TRufas fafy (deiem) sifufEm, Qo8] R

IRT-Teh
WYY TRATeT Frmm afuf@m, Lous (ThUieh 3 T QRUE ) T HINEH

weaRyr st | 3. HegeY WRufaws fm arfufam, Qjue (Wi 3 §F QRju&) H,—
®UH Y G
?g‘iﬁwm. (2) YT ﬁ,_

(F) 3wam (R) ¥, @ (%) ¥ WH |, fEfafed @ve e fea S,
ST —
“(%) TRafes ael § Fraifaa wid g it wed

(@) 3UEN (x)ﬁswm,ﬁmﬁ—rﬁaaswmwﬁaaﬁm i —

“e) afe e TRAfe & W 8 9, g # faled w0 § sewe @ R,
A TG a9 F WE B 9N F T o8 9% F o 7 Faten sriafea s
Y SITE S T qh 39 WM T 94 &I S, 39 enferen R wwen smem:

wig ereae, HeriR, Rl favrita afafell o wfafwl 4 @ fedt % Fafea ot st
U T w1 frarea dfea wa | 98 &t s

(k) R 2o H, I99W (¥) T, 999 W H, % ‘T8 A" F WA W, Ik ' A’
(3) U R H—
(tF) @Us (1) ¥ vEN, Fefafaa @ve siaafa e se, stefq—
“ew)  frelt dama e RO % RO &9 Q Geifta et Fratas T
# toediga T &'
() wHgH F 9N, frfofad . TR W W, sref—

* TOEYHTUT. {—39 YT % WAISH &g A 1 aEt a1ef grm St foR ey v
T T U et AU, 2313 (FhHIE { T R’%%) Tl U R F WUS (W)
% zus fau waRfm e o 2.



Hegqyey S9e, fediw 27 SHad 2020

60 (1)

“ TEAEHTOT. }—39 U % YA ¥ TR &' 1 et avd g S TR weawew
TR ifufEm, 9382 (HHF 39 T RRER) I U 3 F WIS (¢-%)
% gu¥ fau gl fen w2 '

(¥)  °W ¥ H—
(F) 39U () ¥, =< ‘‘qun wemR'' # g fwAr s
(@) 3UEA () H, WK qu HER' w1 od fRar S

(4)  UW ¥-F A, S9UW (2) ¥, g HETR” & WE W, WK Uiy’ Tenfya TR
WY,

(8) o - ¥, I “Hendit”’ & WM W, Uk 'ug’’ venfia feean ST
(9)  UR -7 H, W A WENR w1 W9 R S
(¢) oy H—
(%) W=k ‘'3 wETR w1 A g
(@) Wk F WA W, Frefafan wgw w@ifa e s, stefg—
‘e g oft st o ¥ Rl frate § e @ atfue AR HagE @ T
() 9/ & ¥, SR (¥) % A fFA S, |
(Ro) ©F gV H,—
() 39ER (R) ﬁ,;
(t) wied o, weg o wRTR @ g R g
(@) uﬁfwﬁnﬁ,w“mm"wéﬁqﬁmm;
() @ve (@ @) #, v A weR” @ fea S
(@) ST (R) H—
(wF) e Wi H, wes e TR W A R S
()  wife Yu # s A wRTUR @ @ e S
(@)  @ve (¥ ®, s 'u AR’ & ey feean S

(M S9YR(3) H, wee *urde 91w’ et el off 3 3y §, F TR W, wes e’
wepfaa e SITg,



60 (2) | Heayey Tod, feris 27 SFed 2020

(%) 91 R9-@ H,—
(%) ud WY ¥, v HER qer’’ & @ R S
(@) IwEm () ¥, wifw W F @A W, Frafafea $o e fe s, safe—

‘e g, Fenfeafs, P o v aftrer # steae (FE) & FAE H AT O 4
d o1 I U UEY F F @ T Fraten s gr Wik sifuwrdt %
iy frefafaa & § w9y a1 JEH | SR sen—"";

G  STEE () % WA W, Frefataa sauam wfa # oS, sig—

‘() afz urdg STURT (R) F e W R o €, O g% wwen s R T g
A W€ UeW T TR B

gig afg unfg, Guri st orqwfa & faema, su% fraffaa @ Tmffde el =t
i@ @ @ T F i) sy TE A § d Sue wE wEne g REa gen
quE S,
(’) WM ¢ H—

(%) wed 9 ¥ wF R Fratafen oed Wi wnfa fwn s, sei—
“arere qun ARTAR I A
(@) 3uEm (2) % WA W, Frafafea g wnfia s, saiq—

“(z) T Pt SR, Wm0 R F onfie FrateR @ siftgEm @t o @ TR
fe1 &% off, sreas qan Wk % Fraf=a % WA % foq fraifa anidl w1
wfter e’ ~

(M SwE (3) F A ), frafafea svem e wow, sreEig—

“3)  I9Em (R) ¥ orefin wfimer, T Gfa | e sem, S e vew fafea
ST g Jrauiia ) Sy, e sreaear s fafem smim gr wifusga
STl gRI BT ST, STeAsTal A art SRR A 7 i SRR &l
B 3R T SR B ot 5w # aiomy @e gr S Gfa | fafreea T s,
St o fafga =t sme .

()8R o H, Trderwr H, weg ‘ oremw’! % URAN, W e WeTR " 1 T2 fe
S,
(R¥) 9N R3-% H,—
(%)  ured v A qen SueR () H, v oty SiEi e o SR €, % UEn, v
‘o wedR" et Eenfra feRw wmd;

(@) 9UR () & @8 () A vt CmeiR’ F WA W, UK T, TR,
wonfym feg wid,



Hegyyl U9, feqias 27 SHet 2020 60 (3)

(W) 4T ¥ H < fwa S,

(28)  uRI ¥R H, 7R () ®, @vg (@) #, 3y@vs (dH) & @A R, Fefatad stavs
wnfaa fpan wmQ, steiq:—

“ () TeTdR ¥ Fratem Y g #, R Freffaa o grL
-2
HeAW29T TRATRAeRT AUFRW, LR82 (FHHG 30 T 2R&R ) HI TN

3. WEAYRW TRUIferET AfafaE, 268 (FHHiF 39 T 2’ER) H— e
TRUTfETRT
()  u¥eR H— ?;;mm%\:;z
RR&L ) W
(%) STHA (R) # e (F) F WA R, Ffafen e sy fF S,
31211?[:— ‘
“(%)  TRUITEER TR A R ufiwg ¥ faifed el gro fratfad sremar sreriq wvmfa
(AT ; '

(@) SUER (¥) ¥ @n W, Frefafaa sour i w S, sreid—

w(y) iz Fedt e &9 i ars, T #1 Fraten w0 § eraw wa §
@A T 9 F wE B A ¥ T 9% AR F i T Fate seafea iy
1 ST 3R S qe 3W TIH 1 90 AR S, 39 swehfenen R T smom:

wig sifufrm ¥ et srer @ sweay @ Rl wfuferl % fratem =1 el 89
A &1 frafem dfaa ®d ge wiE & =0 s

(k)  HR R0 H, I9uW () ¥, @vs (W) #, Iw@re () & WA R, Fefafea smave
' Tonfa fopan S, Sterfq:—

() orema ¥ Fratem W < |, faeslt g g

(3) R RR H, I9UW (¥) T vUH wogeh §, O 9% W F WA W, e Q we
Tefya e S,

(X) HRI 30 ﬁ)'—

() @ () ¥ TeEn, Frefafad @ve siawenfia fear s, sreiq:—
Yy fadt vame @ R TRafes FRm ¥ TRafas &9 § deta e fetee
Fmaet # Woied 7 €
(A) TGF F IEH, Frefatad srEwn sig S, seiq—

A RTT, §—3E YN % WESH Bq e 9@t ored grm St e Aeamew e
TS TE T ! AfufEE, 333 (SREIR { T 3’%%) i U R h TS (WAE)
A zow fou gz fen R



60 (4) uizzu%sr Toias, faAier 27 sHad 2020

WL, 379 U F TASH ¥ Rl &9 w0 9 e fm S
YRy R FITe oTfufm, tue (SFHIw 3 U LjuE) I URT 4 &
g (3¥-%) H 6% fore augefim fean mn .7

(4) 9 R H—
(F) IR (R) ¥, W ‘oreay A’ w1 @Y R g
(@) SWF () ¥, v ' oreaell qur’’ & A fear S

(8)  H R-F H, I9AW (2) H, = oty Wi e of o B, F WA W, v
‘aefe’! wenfae foear STg ‘

() oW R-W W, w= ‘faiw&r" F WA W, UK “mtf'q’;' i feman g,
(&) | U R-TH, WA axzix&a"_m & ﬁw wIT, | .
(R)  uW 3R H— |
- W‘W ¥g A, w=g ' ey’ w1 v e Wi
). ﬁmﬁq@%wmﬁﬂﬁmmmmmaﬁm—
‘e W o SR e % R et ¥ T QY ofuw R TeEH T T
(R0)  HRI 34 ﬁ,w“aﬁa%wﬁﬁaﬁqm"lwmmm.
(2%) ‘_émxs %— ‘ |
(%) WE ?ﬂﬂf H, Wvﬁ "Iy’ % qE, TR “ sy %r%n” ety fepu g,
(@) ww(z)%wm,ﬁwfaﬁqasqumwﬁaﬁmaﬁh:—'

“(ﬁ) wﬁwwmm@wm%mmtmm
steaey ao1 AT i frate, Qe Of #, Sl fop fafea =t S, e, aRwg
¥ fraffaa wew 0wy § aufaffide st vyom wftres A faifaa aqel
4, fafe f0 3 o sy aa ©F Sy w1 et w9

@ :-rcr%rm (2) ¥, w=g ‘SweE" & 16? = “31491&1‘3911” i zenfya fmq T,
() W e A— | o
(®) w9 g Wr: "o’ & g, WS ety W' ofaseenfid feu SG;

(@) S9um (%) #, wsg Iweas’’ el et ot A T E, & qd, =g ‘‘ereaey
sfq:xafia Ty SG; '



Yy WU, feis 27 SHad 2020 : 60 (5)

(m ITUN () §, @ () ¥ W Yoty F WM |, T oy, Uy’
wifya fepu SIMG,

(23) 4T ¥ & A4 R S,
(2¥) 91wy F A R, Frafafaa o wenfug ®5t S, stafq—

“uy, () 9 Tt o, um vy % ot fratem it aifuge &t 9 9y wwww Fate
fe & iy, sreaw e SweAs % Frafeq ¥ wiee & fou feifaa o &1 W vaw
RIS LA

(R)  SUuW (2) % orefie aftmem, Wt dfa § gamn smom, S fF o= fata
ST g SrEuifta w1 9, e sreawa g frafew srm g witea
AT gRT H ST, e FA el AER H T ¢ F1 AHR T
R S Ha aUeR B9 & g ¥ uferg are g o dfa | fafafea fen
e, S fop fafea =t S,

(R4) R ug #H, 3fF we’’ & @ fem S,

(28) 9 &R F I9uR (3) H, @vg () F W §, ves, i qu sreafanm A v,
+1 @ T e

() U €3 ¥, Toqw §, v Iwema A’ A e wg,

(3¢) oW 3¢ ¥, 39uR () ¥ @S (@) ¥, v 'Sy’ Sl w@ ot 3 e El, %
d, weg ‘' ereag qun’’ Sfd:wYa feRY ST,

¥, () HeAwey FRufaw fafy (dehem) ey, 028 (GFHIh © T R0%%) WER Frfgm  frew aen
o < R =t

() IH FARY F FREA F T TC o, IF FAARW & AdA F W FE TG A AR 39
afafam & aeert ITEY F oI w E wH ST, :

Wure, T 27 SHad 2020

/

F. 1615-24-3FHIG-A(.).—YRd F WEAYA F oIJ=DT 348 F WUS (3) & AT U, ALAYGY TRUIfelh
fafer (doie) sifufram, 2019 (sRHI® 11 §F 2020) 1 ST STIR TTA & WUHR ¥ TWEERT Wenitva feman
S %

HEAYRY % TSIUTE & A G a7 SRR,
YT A1gd, TR G,



60 (6) Hegyeyl NS, i 27 SHad 2020

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 11 oF 2020

THE MADHYA PRADESH NAGARPALIK VIDHI (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 2019

[Received the assent of the Governor on the 27* J anuary, 2020; assent first published in the “Madhya Pradesh Gazette
(Extra-ordinary)”, dated the 27 January, 2020.]

An Act further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1956 and the
Madhya Pradesh Municipalities Act, 1961.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the seventieth year of the Republic of
India as follows :(— ’

Short title. 1. This. Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Nagarpalik Vidhi (Sanshodhan)
: Adhiniyam, 2019. ,

PART 1
AMENDMENT TO THE MADHYA PRADESH MUNICIPAL CORPORATION ACT, 1956
(No. 23 of 1956)

Amendment to 2. In the Madhya Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1956 (No. 23 of 1956),—

the Madhya
Pradesh Act No. .
23 of 1956. (1) In Section 9,—

(a) in sub-section (1), for clause (a), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—
“(a) a Mayor elected by the elected Councillors from the municipal wards;”;
L)) for sub-section (4), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—
“(4) If any ward of any municipal area fails to elect a Councillor, fresh election
proceedings shall be commenced for such ward within six months to fill
the seat and until the seat is filled it shall be treated as casual vacancy:
Provided that proceedings of election of Speaker, Mayor, any departmental
Committees or any of the Committee shall not be stayed, pending the

election of such seat.”.

2) In Section 10, in sub-section (4), in the first proviso, for the words "six months”,
the words "two months" shall be substituted.

3) In Section 12,—
i) after clause (¢), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(d) is not registered in any electoral roll related to a Panchayat or municipal area
of a municipality,”;

(>ii) after the proviso, the following explanations shall be added, namely:—

“Explanation. 1—For the purpose of this section "Panchayat” shall have the same meaning as
assigned to it in clause (xvii) of section 2 of the Madhya Pradesh Panchayat
Raj Avam Gram Swaraj Adhiniyam, 1993 (No. 1 of 1994).

Explanation. 2—TFor the purpose of this section “municipal area” shall have the same meaning
as assigned t0 it in clause (18-a) of section 3 of the Madhya Pradesh
Municipalities Act, 1961 (No. 37 of 1961).”.



Heyey Tsiad, feqis 27 SHEd 2020

60 (7)

@ In Section 14,—

(a) in sub-section (1), the words "and Mayors" shall be omitted;
(b) in sub-section (2), the words "and Mayors" shall be omitted.
5) " In Section 14-A, in sub-section (1), for the word “Mayor”, the word “Councillor”

shall be substituted.

6) In Section; 14-B, for the word “Mayor”, the word “Councillor” shall be substituted.
@) In Section 14-C, the words “or a Mayor” shall be omitted.
(8) In Section 15,—

(a) the words “or Mayor” shall be omitted;

(b for the proviso, the following proviso shall be substituted, namely:—

“Provided that no person shall vote more than once in any election of the Councillors.”.

9 In Section 16, sub-section (4) shall be deleted.

(10) In Section 17,—

(a) in sub-section (1),—
@) in the marginal heading, the words “or Mayor” shall be omitted;
(i1) in the opening paragraph, the words “or Mayor” shall be omitted;
(iii) in clause (bb), the words “or Mayor” shall be omitted;

(b) in sub-section (2),—

@ in the marginal heading, the words “or Mayor” shall be omitted;
(ii) in the opening paragraph, the words “or Mayor” shall be omitted;
(iii) in clause (e), the words “or Mayor” shall be omitted;
©) in sub-section (3), for the words “Councillor or Mayor” wherever they occur,

the word “Councillor” shall be substituted.
(11 In Section 17-B,—
(a) in the marginal heading, the words “the Mayor and” shall be omitted;

- (b) in sub-section (1), for the opening paragraph, the following paragraph shall
be substituted, namely:—

“Every Councillor shall before taking part in the election of Speaker in the first
meeting of the Corporation or before entering upon his office, as the case
may be, shall make and subscribe in the presence of the officer authorised



60 (8) Hegyey USd, feAiw 27 SEEd 2020

by the State Election Commission an oath or affirmation in the following
form:—";

() for sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

“(2) If the Councillor does not take an oath under sub-section (1), it shall be
deemed that such Councillor has not assumed his office:

Provided that. except with the permission of the Divisional Commissioner, if any
Councillor does not take an oath within three months from the date of his
election or nomination, his seat shall be deemed to have been vacant ipso
facto.”.

(12) In Section 18,—

(a) for the marginal heading, the following marginal heading shall be substituted,
namely:—

“Election of Speaker and Mayor”;

(b) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

“1) The State Election Commission shall, within fifteen days of the notification
of election under section 22, call a meeting of the elected Councillors for
the purpose of electing a Speaker and Mayor.”;

©) for sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

“3) Meeting under sub-section (1) shall be called in such manner as may be
determined by the State Election Commission, which shall be presided over
by the officer authorised by the State Election Commission. The presiding
officer shall not have the right to vote and in case of equality of votes the
result shall be decided by lot in such manner as prescribed.”.

(13) In Section 20, in the Explanation, after the words "the Speaker”, the words “and
the Mayor” shall be inserted.

(14) In Section 23-A,—

(a) in the marginal heading and in sub-section (1), after the word “Speaker”
wherever it occurs, the words "or Mayor” shall be inserted;

(b) in clause (ii) of sub-section (2), for the word "Mayor", the words “Speaker,
Mayor”, shall be substituted. '

(13 Section 24 shall be deleted.

(16) In Section 441, in sub-section (2), in clause (b), for sub-clause (iii), the following
sub-clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(iii)  in the case of election of Mayor, by any elected Councillor.”.
PART 1I

AMENDMENT TO THE MADHYA PRADESH MUNICIPALITIES ACT, 1961
(No. 37 of 1961)

Amendment to 3. In the Madhya Pradesh Municipalities Act, 1961(No. 37 of 1961),—
the l\gadlga v

Pradesh Act No. _

3T of 1961, M In Section 19,—

(a) in sub-section (1), for clause (a), the following clause shall be substituted,



60 (9)

qeyey U9, s 27 SFEd 2020

namely:—

“(a) President, that is chairperson, elected by the elected Councillors of
Municipal Council or Nagar Parishad;

(b) for sub-section (4), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—
“4) If any ward of any municipal area fails to elect a Councillor, fresh
election proceedings shall be commenced for such ward within six

months to fill the seat and until the seat is filled, it shall be treated as
casual vacancy:

Provided that proceedings of election of President or Vice-President, or any of
the Committees under the Act shall not be stayed, pending the election
of such seat.”. ‘

2) In Section 20, in sub-section (2), in clause (b), for sub-clause (iii), the following
sub-clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(iii) in the case of election of President by any Councillor;”.

3) In Section 29, in sub-section (4), in the first proviso, for the words “six months”,
the words “two months” shall be substituted.

4) In Section 30,—
@) after clause (c), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

(d) is not registered in any electoral roll related to a Panchayat or municipal
area of a municipal corporation;”;

(ii) after the proviso, the following explanations shall be added, namely:—
"Explanation. 1—For the purpose of this section "Panchayat” shall have the same meaning as
assigned to it in clause (xvii) of section 2 of the Madhya Pradesh Panchayat
Raj Avam Gram Swaraj Adhiniyam, 1993 (No. 1 of 1994).
Explanation. 2—For the purpose of this Section "municipal area” shall have the same meaning
as assigned to it in clause (34-a) of Section 5 of the Madhya Pradesh
Municipal Corporation Act, 1956 (No. 23 of 1956).".

5 In Section 32,—

(a) in sub-section (1), the words "President and" shall be omitted;
(b) | in sub-section (2), the words "Presidents and" shall be omitted.
6) In Section 32-A, in sub-section (1), for the word "President” wherever it occurs,

the word "Councillor” shall be substituted.

)] In Section 32-B, for the word "President”, the word "Councillor" shall be
substituted.

8 In Section 32-C, the words "or President” shall be omitted.



60 (10) qeayey Yo, feaie 27 SFad 2020

9 In Section 33,—

(a) in the opening paragfaph, the words "or President” shall be omitted;
(b) for the existing proviso, the following proviso shall be substituted, namely:—

"Provided that no person shall vote more than once in any election of the
~Councillor.”.

(10) In Section 35, the words "election as a Pfesident or" shall be omitted.
11) In Section 43,—

(a) in the marginal heading, before the words “Vice President”, the words, “the
- President and” shall be inserted,

()] for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—
“1) The State Election Commission shall cause the election of President and
Vice President immediately after every election of Municipal Council and
Nagar Parishad in such manner as may be prescribed. The elected members
of the Council shall elect a President and a Vice-President in the prescribed -
manner, from elected members in its first meeting as specified in

Section 55.";

© in sub-section (3), before the words "Vice-President”, the words “the President
and” shall be inserted.

(12) In Section 43-A,—

(a) in the marginal heading, before the words "Vice-President", the words, "the
President or” shall be inserted;

b in sub-section (1), before the words "Vice-President" wherever they occur, the
words, "the President or” shall be inserted;

© in sub-section (2), in clause (ii), for the word "President”, the words "President,
Vice—Presiden_t" shall be substituted.

(13) Section 47 shall be deleted.

(14) For Section 55, the following Section shall be substituted, nzimely:—

f}{:; 'fg’:gg‘;gl “55.(1) The State Election Commission shall, within 15 days from the date of the notification
election. of election under Section 45, call a meeting of the elected Councillors for, the purpose of electing

a President and Vice-President.

(2) Meeting under sub-section (1) shall be called in such manner as may be determined by
the State Election Commission, which shall be presided over by the officer authorised by the State
Election Commission. The presiding officer shall not have the right to vote and in case of equality
of votes, the result shall be decided by lot in such manner as prescribed.

(15) In Section 56, the figure "47" shall be omitted.

(16) In Section 62, in sub-section (3), in the proviso to clause (iii), the word, figure
and comma "or 47," shall be omitted.



Heqyey oad, feid 27 SHadt 2020 60 (11)

a7n In Section 63, in the proviso, the words "Vice President, or", shall be omitted.

(18) In Section 328, in sub-section (1), in clause (b), before the word "Vice- President"
wherever they occur, the words "President and" shall be inserted.

4. (1) The Madhya Pradesh Nagarpalik Vidhi (Sanshodhan) Adhyadesh, 2019 (No. 7 of Repeal
2019) is hereby repealed. . saving.

(2) Notwithstanding the repeal of the said Ordinance, anything done or any action taken
under the said Ordinance shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the corresponding
provision of this Act.

and

iR, TR qEv a1 e W, AEINRY g WS i qRonerd, Wi § gk aen yeifi—2020.



