T AuTEe www.govtpressmp.nic. in
¥ oft e elre folan s T 3.

HHID 20] AT, AR, f&Ti6 17 7 2019991 27, Wb 1941
HMAT ¥
farg—ge
(@) (1) weayer fadrres @ TR '\‘iﬁﬁ'f P uﬁ'a?:‘«r () dag ¥ g?wrﬁﬂ s,
@ (1) ARy (2) weaeeT arfefam, (3) v @ JEAfYE,

<)

(2) arf~m e,

AT 8 (B)—HB ol

a0 3 (Q@)
ST
fafer siR ooy s fawrr

Bhopal, the 9th May 2019

No.-109-XXI-A(Dr.).- The following Act of the Parliament, Published in the Gazette of India
Extra-ordinary Part II Section 1 dated the 12th January 2019 is hereby, republished for general
information. The Bill as passed by the House of Parliament received the assent of the President on
12th January 2019. '

By order and in the name of the Governor of Madhya Pradesh,
RAJESH YADAY, Addl. Secy.

89



[4rT 4 (@)

90 Aeayer Yo, fasTie 17 w18 2019

THE CONSTITUTION (ONE HUNDRED AND THIRD AN[ENDMENT) ACT, 2019

An Act

further to amend the Constitution of India.
B it enacted by Parliament in the Sixty-ninth Year of the Republic of India as follows:—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Constitution (One Hundred and Third Amendment)
Act,2019.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Central Government may, by notlﬁcanon
_in the Official Gazette, appoint. :

2. In article 15 of the Constitution, after clause (5), the following clause shall be
mserted namely:—

*(6) Nothing in this article or sub-clause (g) of clause (1) of article 19 or clause (2)
of article 29 shall prevent the State from making,—

(@ any special provision for the advancement of any economically weaker
sections of citizens other than the classes mentioned in clauses (4) and (5); and

~ (b) any special provision for the advancement of any economically weaker
-sections of citizens other than the classes mentioned in clauses (4) and (5) in'so
‘far as such special provisions relate to their admission to educational institutions
including private educational institutions, whether aided or unaided by the State,
other than the minority educational institutions referred to in clause (1) of
article 30, which in the case of reservation would be in addition to the existing
reservations and subject to a maximum of ten per cent. of the total seats m each
category.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this article and article 16,
"economically weaker sections” shall be such as may be notified by the State
from time to time on the basis of family income and other indjcators of economic

_ disadvantage.’.
Amendment of 3. In article 16 of the Consututlon, after clause (5), the followmg clause shall be
article 16. ’ lnserted name]y -

“(6) Nothing in this article shall prevent the State from making any provision »

for the reservation of appointments or posts in favour of any economically weaker
sections of citizens other than the classes mentioned in clause (4), in addition to the

o existing reservation and subject to a ' maximum of ten per cent. of the posts in each

A category

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment of
article 15.



AT 4 ()] AEIYAYT O9F, f&Hid 17 Ag 2019

91

Bhopal, the 9th May 2019

No.-109-XXI-A(Dr.).- The following Act of the Parliament, Published in the Gazette of India
Extra-ordinary Part IT Section 1 dated the 29th December 2018 is hereby, republished for general
information. The Bill as passed by the House of Parliament received the assent of the President on

29th December 2018.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Madhya Pradesh,
RAJESH YADAVY, Addl. Secy.

THE NATIONAL TRUST FOR WELFARE OF PERSONS WITH AUTISM, CEREBRAL PALSY,
MENTAL RETARDATION AND MULTIPLE DISABILITIES (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2018

An Act

to amend the National Trust for Welfére of Persons with Autism, Cerebral Palsy,
Mental Retardation and Multiple Disabilities Act, 1999.

Bk it enacted by Parhament in the Sixty-ninth Year of the Repubhc of India as

follows e

1. This Act may be called the National Trust for Welfare of Persons with Autism,
Cerebral Palsy, Mental Retardation and Multiple Disabilities (Amendment) Act, 2018.

) 2. In the National Trust for Welfare of Persons with A(xtism, Cerebral Palsy, Mental
44 0£ 1999. Retardation and Multiple Disabilities Act, 1999 (bereinafter referred toas the principal
Act), in section 4,— ‘

(@) in sub-section (1), the words “or uriﬁl his successor shail have been
duly appointed whichever is longer” shall be omitted; '

() after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely:— - :

“(14) The Central Government shall initiate the process for
appointment of the Chairperson or Member, as the case may be, at least six
months prior to the expxry of the term of office of such Chalrperson or
Member.”; . .

(c) in sub-section (3), the foilowing proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided thaf the Central Government may, in case of a casual vacancy
in the office of the Chairperson, by order in writing, direct an officer of
appropnate level, to perform the functions of the Chaxrperson unul such
vacancy is filled in.”.

Amendment of - 3. ln section 5 of the prmcxpal Act, in sub-section (/), in the prov1so for the

section §. ‘ * words “until the appointment of his successor is made by the Central Government”,

~ the words “until his resxgnatwn is accepted by the Central Government” shall be
subsmuted

Shon title.

Amiendment of
section 4,



92 Hqeyyeer oE, & 17 43 2019 [T 4 (@)

Bhopal, the 9th May 2019

No.-109-XXI-A(Dr.).- The following Act of the Parliament, Published in the Gazette of India
Extra-ordinary Part II Section 1 dated the 11th January 2019 is hereby, republished for general
information. The Bill as passed by the House of Parliament received the assent of the President on
10th January 2019. '

By order and in the name of the Governor of Madhya Pradesh,
RAJESH YADAY, Addl. Secy.

THE RIGHT OF CHILDREN TO FREE AND COMPULSORY EDUCATION
(AMENDMENT) ACT, 2019
An Act

Sfurther to amend the l§ight of Children to Free and Compulsory Edr:catr‘on Act, 2009,
. Beitenacted by Parliament inthe Sixty-ninth Year of the Republic of India as follows:— .

L (I) This Act may be called the Right of Chlldren toFree and Compulsory Educatron Short title and
(Amendment) Act, 2019, A A - Commencement

{(2) 1tshall come into force on such date asthe Central Govemment may, by notification
in the Official Gazette, appoint. ‘

35 of 2009.. 2 Inthe Right of Children to Free and Compulsory Education Act, 2009 hereinafter Substitution .
‘ referred to as the prmclpal Act), for section 16, the followmg section shall be substltuted, of new -

nam section for
ely section 16.

- “16. (1 ) There shall be a regular exarnmatxon in the fifth class and in the erghth Examination -

- class at the € cad : and holding
s at end of every academic year. back in

(Z) Ifa chlld fails in the examination referred to in sub-section (1), he shall be  certain cases.
. given additional instruction and granted opportunity for re-éxamination within a perrod : T
of two months from the date of decl aration of the result. :

_ (3) The appmpnate Govemmmt may allow schools to hold back a child in the _
" . fifth class or in the eighth class or in both classes, in such manner and subject to such
“conditions as may be prescrlbed 1f he faxls in the re-exammanon referred to in-

sub-sectlon 2):

: " Provided that the appropnate Govemment may decrde not to hold back a child in
‘ any class till the oompleﬂon of elementary education.

- (4)No chrld shall be expelled from a school till the compleuon of elementary

_ Aeducatron '
Amg‘ndment of .3 In section 38 of the pnnc\pal Act, in sub-secnon (2), after clause (f), the following
section 38. " - clause. shall be inserted, namely:— "~ . -

“(fa) the manner and the conditions subject to which a chrld may be held back
under sub-section (3) of" sectlon 16", ’



91T 4 ()] strém o9, fasis 17 | 2019 93

Bhopal, the 9th May 2019

No. 109-XXI-A(Dr.).- The following Act of the Parliament, Published in the Gazette of India
Extra-ordinary Part II Section 1 dated the 11th January 2019 is hereby, republished for general infor-
mation. The Bill as passed by the House of Parliament received the assent of the President on 10th

January 2019.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Madhya Pradesh,
RAJESH YADAY, Addl. Secy.

THE NATIONAL COUNCIL FOR TEACHER EDUCATION (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2019
An Act

further to amend the National Council for Teacher Education Act, 1993.
- BE xt enacted by Parhament in the S:xty—nmth Year of the Republic of India as

follows:—
1.(I) Th:s Actmay be called the Natxonal Councll for Teacher Education (Amendment)  Short title and -
Act, 2019, ] commencenient.

(2) 1t shall be deemed to have come into force on the 17th day of August, 1995.

73 of 1993. 2. In the National Council for Teacher Education Act, 1993 (hereinafter referred to as Amendment
the principal Act), in section 14, in sub-section (1), after the provxso, the fol]owmg proviso °f section 14
shall be inserted, namely:— _

“Provided further that such institutions, as may be spemﬁed by the Central
Government by notification in the Official Gazette, which—

\ (i) are funded by the Central Government or the State Government or the
Union territory Admmxstratlon -

(i) have offered a course or training i in teacher educatlon on or aﬁer the
appointed day till the academic year 201 7-20 18;and

i) fulfil the conditions speclﬁed under clause (a) of sub-secnon (3)
shall be deemed to have been recogmsed by the Regional Committes.”.
Amendment 3. In section 15 of the principal Act, in sub-section (7), the following proviso shall be

925“’““ 15. ipserted, namely:—

“Provnded that the course or training in teacher education offered on or aﬁer
* the appointed day till the academic year 2017-2018 by such institutions, as may be
specified by the Central Government by notification in the Official Gazette, which--

(i) are funded by the Central Government or the State Government or the
Union territory Administration; and .

(i) fulfil the conditions specxﬁed under clause (a) of sub-section (3), .

shall be deemed to have been granted permission by the Regional Committee.”.



94 qeayer XoTud, &6 17 7§ 2019 [T 4 (@)
Bhopal, the 9th May 2019

No.-109-XXI-A(Dr.).- The following Act of the Parliament, Published in the Gazette of India
Extra-ordinary Part II Section 1 dated the 21st February 2019 is hereby, republished for general
information. The Bill as passed by the House of Parliament received the assent of the President on
21st February 2019. '

By order and in the name of the Governor of Madhya Pradesh,
RAJESH YADAVY, Addl. Secy.

THE PERSONAL LAWS (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2019
An Act

ﬁmher to amend the Divorce Act, 1869, the Dissolution of Muslim Marriages Act, 1939 the
Special Marriage Act, 1954, the Hindu Marriage Act, 19 55 and the Hindu Adaptions _
_and Maintenance Act, 1956. :

BEit enacted by Partiament in the Seventieth Year of the Republic of Indla as follows —
CHAPTER I
PRELIMINARY A , ‘
1. (1 ) This Act may be called the Personal Laws (Amendment) Act 2019 : " Short title and
) commencement.
(2) it shall come into force on such date as the Central Govemment may, by notxﬁcahon :
m the Official Gazette, appoint.

_ CHAPTERK.
AMENDMENT TO THEDIVORCE Act, 1869

2. In the Divorce Act 1869, in section 10, in sub-section (1) clause (w) shall be Amendment
of section 10

omitted. ' : ' : ' “of Act No. 4
- ' : ' of 1869,
CHAPTER Il
AMENDMENT 10 THE DISSOLUTION OF MUSLIM MARRIAGES Acr, 1939
' Amendment 3. In the Dissolution of Muslim Marriages Act, 1939 in semon 2,in ground (vi) the
of section 2 words "leprosy or" shall be omitted:
of Act No. 8 s
of 1939, ‘ CHAPTER IV
AMENDMENT TO. THE SPECIAL Marriace Act, 1954
‘Amendment - 4, Inthe Spec1al Mamage Act, 1954, in section 27, in sub-section (I ), clause (g) shall :
of section 27 |, omitted. .
of Act No. 43 :
of 1954, . - " CHAPTERV
' . AMENDMENT 10 THE HINDU MarRiaGe AcT, 1955
“Amendment . 5.In the Hindu Marriage Act, 1955 in secnon 13 in sub-section (1), clause (iv) shall be
“of section 13 . omitted.
of Act No. 25 : - )
of 1955. E . CHAPTERVI
- AMENDMENT 10 THE HINDU ADOPTIONS AND MAINTENANCE ACT, 1956
An;encgmcnt 6. In the Hindu Adoptions and Maintenance Act, 1956 in section 18, in
Og if;“,;}g 1';;8 . sub-section (2), clause (¢) shall be omitted. '
0! 3 .

of 1956.



R 4 (@)

. YRl NIy, feqie 17 A 2019 95

Bhopal, the 9th May 2019

No.-109-XXI-A(Dr.).- The following Act of the Parliament, Published in the Gazette of India
Extra-ordinary Part II Section 1 dated the 21st February 2019 is hereby, republished for general
information. The Bill as passed by the House of Parliament received the assent of the President on
21st February, 2019.

13 of 2018,

By order and in the name of the Governor of Madhya Pradesh,
RAJESH YADAY, Addl. Secy.

THE FINANCE ACT, 2019
An Act

to continue the existing rates of income-tax for the financial year 2019-2020 and to
pravide for certam relief to taxpayers and to make amendments in certain
: . enactments.

" Be it enacted by Parlxament in the Seventieth Year of the Republic of Indxa as

follows:—
| CHAPTERI -
o ~ PRELIMINARY : :
1. (7) This Act Amay be called the Finance Act, 2019. , ’ "Short ﬁ;le and

ommencement.
(2) Save as otherwise provided in this Act, sectxons 2 to 10 shall come into force eomeme

onthe Ist day of Aprll 20 19
CHAPTER1I
RATES OF INCOME-TAX

2.The provisions of section 2 of, and the First Schedule to, the Finance Act, 2018, Income-tax,
shall apply in relation to income-tax for the assessment year or, as the case may be, the ‘ '

financial year commencing on the 1st day of April; 2019, as they apply in relation to . =
income-tax for the assessment year, or as the case may be, the financial year commencing

on the 1st day of April, 2018, with the following modifications, namely:—

(a)in sectlon 20—

OF in sub-section (l), for the figures “2018" the ﬁgures "2019" shall
be substituted;

(i) in sub-section (3), for the first proviso, the following proviso shall
be substituted, namely:—

"Provided that the amount of income-tax computed in accordance
with the provisions of section 111A or section 112 or section 112A of the .
Income-tax Act shall be increased by a surcharge, for the purposes of the
Union, as provided in Paragraph A, B, C, D or E, as the case may be, of Part1
of the First Schedule:"; .

, (m) for sub- section (77) and sub-section (]2) the followmg
sub-section shall be substxtuted namely:—-

“(11) The amount of income-tax as specified in sub-sections (/)
to (3) and as increased by the applicable surcharge, for the purposes
of the Union, calculated in the manner provided therein, shall be further
increased by an additional surcharge, for the purposes of the Union,
to be called the "Health and Education Cess on income-tax", calculated
at the rate of four per cent. of such income-tax and surcharge so as to
fulfil the commitment of the Government to provide and finance quality
health services and universalised quality basic education and
secondarv and higher education.":



96

qeyeer WoE, fRsiie 17 W 2019

[¢17 4 (@)

(iv) sub-section (/3) and sub-section (14) shall be renumbered as
sub-section (12) and sub-section (13), respectively; -

(v)in sub-section (13) as so renumbered, in clause (a), for the figures
“2018”, the figures “2019” shall be substituted;

(b) in the First Schedule,~

() for Part ], the following Part | shall be substituted, namely:—

"PART ]
INCOME-TAX

" Paragraph A

(D) In the case of every individual other than the individual referred to in items (i)
and (iif) of this Paragraph or Hindu undivided family or association of persons or body of
individuals, whether incorporated or not, or every artificial juridical person referred to in

any other Paragraph of this Part applies,—

- sub-clause (vii) of clause (31) of section 2 of the Income-tax Act, not being a case to whxch -

Rates of income-tax

(1) where the total income does not

exceed Rs. 2,50,000
(2) where the total income exceeds

Rs. 2,50,000 but does not exceed

Rs. 5,00,000

16} where the total income exceeds
Rs. 5,00,000 but does not exceed
Rs. 10,00,000

(4) where the total income exceeds
Rs. 10,00,000

Nil;

5 per cent. of the amount by which the total

income exceeds Rs. 2,50,000;

Rs. 12,500 plus 20 per cent. of the amount
by which the total income exceeds-:

" Rs. 5,00,000;

Rs. 1,12,500 plus 30 per cent. of the amount
by which the total income exceeds
Rs. 10,00,000.

(II) In the case of every individual, being a resident in India, who is of the age of sixty

years or more but less than eighty years at any time durmg the prev1ous year,—

Rates of i income-tax

(1) where the total income does not
exceed Rs. 3,00,000

(2) where the total income exceeds
Rs. 3,00,000 but does not exceed
Rs. 5,00,000 o '

| (3) where the total income exceeds
Rs. 5,00,000-but does not exceed
Rs. 10,00,000

(4) where the total income exceeds

Rs. 10,00,000

Nil;-

5 per cent. of the amount by which the total
income exceeds Rs. 3,00,000;

Rs. 10,000 plus 20 per cent. of the amount
by which the total income exceeds
Rs. 5,00,000;

Rs. 1,10,000 plus 30 per cent. of the amount
by which the total income exceeds -
Rs. 10,00,000.

¢11)) Inthe case of every mdmdual bemg aresident in India, who is of the age of eighty
years or more at any {ime during the previous year,—

Rates of income-tax

(1) where the total income does not
exceed Rs. 5,00,000

_{2) where the total income exceeds

Rs. 5,00,000 but does not exceed -

+ Rs.10,00,000

(3) where the total income exceeds
Rs 10,00, 000

Nil;

20 per cent. of the amount by which the
total income exceeds Rs. 5,00,000;

" "Rs. 1,00,000 plus 30 per cent. of the amount

by which the total income exceeds
Rs. 10,00,000. '



AT 4 ()]

Ayl WoTus, festid 17 A8 2019

97

Surcharge on income-tax

The amount of income-tax computed in accordance with the preceding provisions of -

this Paragraph, or the provisions of section 111A or section 112 or section 112A of the
Income-tax Act, shall be increased by a surcharge for the purposes of the Union, calculated,
in the case of every individual of Hindu undivided family or association of persons or body
ofindividuals, whether incorporated or not, or every artificial juridical person referred to in

sub-clause (vii) of clause (37) of section 2 of the Income-tax Act,—

(a) having a total income exceeding fifty lakh rupees but not exceeding one crore
rupees, at the rate of ten per cent. of such income-tax; and ‘

(b) having a total income exceeding one crore rupees, at the rate of fifteen
per cent. of such income-tax: ) IR

Provided that in the case of persons mentioned above having total income
exceeding— .

(a) fifty lakh rupees but not exceeding one crore rupees, the total amount

payable as income-tax and surcharge on such income shall not exceed the total -

amount payable as income-tax on a total income of fifty lakh rupees by more than
the amount of income that exceeds fifty lakh rupees;

(B) one crore rupees, the total amount payable as income-tax and surcharge |

on such income shall not exceed the total amount payable as income-tax and
surcharge on a total income of one crore rupees by more than the amount of
income that €xceeds one crore rupees. '

» Paragraph B
- In the case of every co-operative society,—
Rates of income-tax

() where the total income does not 10 per cent. of the total income;
exceed Rs. 10,000 - '

@ where the total income exceeds ~ Rs. 1,000 plus 20 per cent. of the amountby
Rs. 10,000 but does not exceed which the total income exceeds Rs. 10,000, v

Rs. 20,000

€)) where the total income exceeds " Rs. 3,000 plus 30 per cent. of the arﬁount by
" Rs.20,000 _ v which the total income exceeds Rs. 20,000.

Surcharge on income-tax

The.amount of income-tax computed in accordance with the preceding provisibns of

‘this Paragraph, or the provisions of section 11 1A or section 112 or section 112A of the
Income~tax Act, shall, in the case of every co-operative society, having a total income exceeding
one crore rupees, be increased by a surcharge for the purposes of the Union calculated at the

rate of twelve per cent. of such income-tax:

Provided that in the case of every co-operative society mentioned above having total
income exceeding one crore rupees, the total amount payable as income-tax and surcharge

on such income shall not exceed the total amount payable as income-tax on a total income of

" one crore rupees by more than the amount of income that exceeds one crore rupees.



98

HegYeeT XoTud, feAie 17 98 2019

[T 4 (@)

» - Paragraph C
In the case of every firm,-— o
' Rate of income-tax
‘On the whole of the total income © 30 percent.

Surcharge on income-tax

The amount of income-tax computed in accordance with the preceding provisions of
this Paragraph, or the provisions of section 111A or section 112 or section 112A of the
Income-tax Act, shall, in the case of every firm, having a total income exceeding one crore

- rupees, be increased by a surcharge for the purposes of the Union calculated at the rate of

twelve per cent. of such income-tax:

Provxdcd that in the case of every firm mentioned' above having total income exceeding
one crore rupees, the total amount payable as income-tax and surcharge on such income
shall not exceed the total amount payable as income-tax on a total income of one Trore rupees
by more than the amount of i income that exceeds one crore rupees.

Paragraph D
~ In the case of every local authority,—
' Rate of income-tax _
On the whole of the total income 30 percent. -

Surcharge on income-tax

The amount of income-tax computed in accordance with the preceding provisions of .

this Paragraph, or the provisions of section 111A or section 112 or section 112A of the
Income-tax Act, shall, in the case of every local authority, having a total income exceeding

oone crore rupees, be increased by a surcharge for the purposes of the Union calculated at. the
‘rate of twelve per cent. of such income-tax:

'Provided that in the case of every local authority mentioned above having total income
exceeding one crore rupees, the total amount payable as income-tax and surcharge on such

income shall not exceed the total amount payable as income-tax on a total income of one
crore rupees by more than the amount of income that exceeds one crore rupees.

' . Paragraph E
In the case of a-company,— ' A
o Rates of income-tax
I. In the case of a domestic company,— oo _
() where-its total turnover or the  25'per cent. of the total income; -
gross receipt in the previous -
year2016-2017 does not exceed

- two hunidred and fifty crore
. Tupees - '

(ii) other than that referred to in 30 per cent, of the total income.
item (), - |

1L In the case of a company other than a domestic company,—
(/) on so much of the total income as consists of,~—

(a) royalties received from

- Government or an Indian concern in
pursuance of an agreement made by it .
with the Government or the Indian -

- concern after the 31st day of March, '
-~ 1961 but before the Ist day of April,
1976; or



HeyRer Xoiud, faAid 17 w8 2019

. (b} fees for rendering technical
services received from Government or
an Indian concern in pursuance of an
agreement made by it with the
Government or the Indian concern after
the 29th day of February, 1964 but
before the 1st day of April; 1976,

and where such agreement has, in eithe;' 50 per cent,;
case, been approved by the Central - :
Government -

(n) on the balance, if any, of the -40 per cent.
total income '

_ Surcharge on income-tax

The amount of income-tax computed in accordance with the preceding provisions of
this Paragraph, or the provisions of section 111A or section 112 or section 112A of the
Income-tax Act, shall be increased by a surcharge for the purposes of the Umon calculated,—

(i) in the case of every domestlc company,—

" (@) having a total income exceeding one crore rupees but not exceeding
ten crore rupees, at the rate of seven per cent. of such income-tax; and

(b) having a total income exceedmg ten crore rupees, at the rate of twelve
per cent. of such Income-tax;

" (i) in the case of every company other than a domestic company,—

(a) having a total income exceeding one crore rupees but not exceeding
ten crore rupees, at the rate of two per cent. of such income-tax; and

() having a total income exceeding ten crore rupees, at the rate of ﬂve per
-cent. of such income-tax:

"Provided that in the case of every company having a total income exceeding one
crore rupees but not exceeding ten crore.rupees, the total amount payable as income-
tax and surcharge on such income shall not exceed the total amount payable as income-
tax on a total income of one crore rupees by more than the amount of income that
exceeds one crore rupees: '

Provided further that in the case of every company havmg a total income

exceeding ten crore rupees, the toal amount payable as income-tax and surcharge on

" such income shall not exceed the total amount payable as income-tax and surcharge on

atotal i mcome of ten crore rupees by more thap the amount of income that exceeds ten
crore rupees.”; <

- (#f) in Part 111, ini Paragraph E, in sub-paragraph I,in ciause (D, for the words and
- figures "previous year 2016-2017", the words and ﬁgures "previous year 2017-2018"
shall be substxmted

(iif)in Part IV, in Rule 8,—
(A) for sub-rules (/) and (2), the following sub-rules shall be substxtuted, namely —

") Where the assessee has, in the previous year relevant 1o the assessment
year commencing on the 1st day of April, 20 19, any agricultural income and the net
result of the computation of the agricultural income of the assessee for any one or

_more of the previous years relevant to the assesstent years commencing on the 1st .
day of April, 2011 or the 1st day of April, 2012 or the 1st day of April, 2013 or the Istday
of April, 2014 or the 1st day of April, 2015 or the 1st day of April, 2016 or the 1st day of

“April, 2017 or the-1st day of April, 2018, xs a loss, then, for the purposes of
sub-section (2) of section 2 of this Act,—



100

Ay e XoTud, =i 17 98 2019

[T 4 (@)

(i) the loss so computed for the previous year relevant to the asséssment

year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2011, to the extent, if any, such loss has

not been set off against the agricultural income for the previous year relevant to

the assessment year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2012 or the 1st day of

- April, 2013 or the 1st day of April, 2014 or the st day of April, 2015 or the 1stday
of April, 2016 or the 1st day of April, 2017 or the 1st day of April, 2018, '

“(ii) the loss so computed for the pre\}ious year relevant to the assessment |

year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2012, to the extent, if any, such loss
has not been set off against the agricultural income for the previous year relevant
to the assessment year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2013 or the 1st day

of April, 2014 or the 1st day of April, 2015 or the 1st day of April, 2016 or-the

1st day of April, 2017 or the 1st day of April, 2018,

(iif) the loss so:.computed for the previous year relevant to the assessment

year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2013, to the extent, if any, such loss has .

not been set off against the agricultural income for the previous year relevant to
the assessment year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2014 or the 1st day of
April, 2015 or the 1st day of April, 2016 or the Ist day of April, 2017 or the ist day
of April, 2018, ; . ' '

(iv) the loss so computed for the previous year relevant to the assessment
. year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2014, to the extent, if any, such loss has
not been set off against the agricultural income for the previous year rélevant to

_ the assessment year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2015 or thie 1st day of

April, 20 16 or the 1st day of April, 2017 or the Ist day of April, 2018,

(v) the loss so computed for the previous year relevant to the assessment '

year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2015, to the extent, if any, such loss has
not been set off against the agricultural income for the previous year relevant to
the assessment year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2016 or the Ist day of
April, 2017 or the Ist day of April, 2018, '

- (vi) the loss so computed for the previous year relevant to the assessment
year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2016, to the extent, ifany, such loss has
‘not been set off against the agricultural income for the previous year relevant to
the assessment year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2017 or the 1st day of
_April, 2018, o . ' ‘

(vii) the loss so computed for the previous year relevant to the assessment

year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2017, to the extent, if any, such loss has
not been.set off against the agricultural income for the previous year relevant to
the assessment year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2018,

(viii) the loss so computed for the previous year relevant to the assessment
year commencing on the Ist day of April, 2018,

shall be set off against the agricultural income of the assessee for the previous year
- relevant to the assessment year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2019. '

(2) Where the assessee has, in the previous year relevant to the assessment
year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2020, or, if by virtue of any provision of the
Income-tax Act, income-tax is to be charged in respect of the income of a period other

than the previous year, in such other period, any agricultural income and the netresult

of the computation of the agricultural income of the assessee for any one or more of
the previous years relevant to the assessment years commencing on the 1st day of
April, 2012 or the 1st day of April, 2013 or the 1st day of April, 2014 or the 1st day of
April, 2015 or the 1st day of April, 2016 or the 1st day of April, 2017 or the Ist day of
April, 2018 or the 1st day of April, 2019, is a loss, then, for the purposes of
sub-section (/0) of section 2 of this Act,— : .



AT 4 (@)

HeAyReT Iy, e 17 A 2019

101

shall be set off'against the agricultural income of the assessee for the previous year relevant

() the loss so computed for the previous year relevant to the assessment
year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2012, to the extent, ifany, suchlosshas

not been set off against the agricultural income for the previous year relevant to

the assessment year commencing on the 1st day of. April, 2013 or the 1st day of -

April, 2014 or the Ist day of April, 2015 orthe 1st day of April, 2016 or the 1stday

_ of April, 2017 or the 1st day of April, 2018 or the 1st day of April, 2019,

(i) the loss so computed for the previous year relevant to the assessment
year commencing on the 1stday of April, 2013, to the extent, if any, such loss has
not been set off against the agricultural income for the previous year relevant to
the assessment year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2014 or the 1st day of
April, 2015 or the 1st day of April, 2016 orthe 1st day of April, 20 17 or the 1stday
of April; 2018 or the 1st day of April, 2019,

' (i#i) the loss so computed for the previous year relevant to the assessment
year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2014, to the extent, if any, such losshas
not been set off against the agricultural income for the previous year relevant to
the assessment year commencing on the 1st day'of April, 2015 or the 1st day of

April, 2016 or the 1stday of April, 2017 orthe 1st day of April, 2018 or the Istday

of April, 2019,

() the loss so computed for the previous year relevant to the assessment
 year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2015, to the extent, if any, such loss has

. not been set off against the agricultural income for the previous year relevant to
the assessment year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2016 or the 1st day of .

April, 2017 or the 1st day of April, 2018 or the 1st day of April, 2019,

(v) the loss so computed for the previous year relevant to the assessment
year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2016, to the extent, if any, such loss has

not been set off against the agricultural income for the previous year relevantto .

the assessment year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2017 or the 1st day of
April, 2018 or the 1st day of April, 2019, : o

(vi) the loss so computed for the previous year relevant to the assessment

year commencing on the 1st d:«iy of April, 2017, to the extent, if any,such losshas

not been set off against the agricultural income for the previous year relevant to
the assessment year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2018 or the 1st day of
April, 2019, - 2

. (viiythe loss so computed for the previous year relevant to the assessment

year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2018, to the extent; ifany, such loss has
not been set off against the agricultural income for the previous year relevantto

the assessment year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2019,

(viii) the loss so computed for the previous year relevant to the assessment
year commencing on the 1st day of April, 2019, S :

to the assessment year commencing on the Ist day of April, 2020.”;

(B) for sub-rule (4), the following sub-rule shall be substituted, naniély:———_
- "(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in this rule, no loss which has

_ not been determined by the assessing officer under the provisions of these rules
or the rules contained in the First Schedule to the Finance Act, 2011 (8 0f2011) )

or the First Schedule to the Finance Act, 2012 (23 0f2012) or the First Schedule

* to the Finance Act, 2013 (17 0f2013) or the First Schedule to the Finance (No. 2)

Act, 2014 (25 of 2014) or the First Schedule to the Finance Act, 2015 (20 0f2015)
or the First Schedule to the Finance Act, 2016 (28 0f 2016) or the First Schedule

to the Finance Act, 2017 (7 0f2017) or the First Schedule to the Finance Act, 2018

(13 of 2018) shall be set off under sub-rule (I) or, as the case may be,
sub-rule (2).". e o -



102 qeAYeT NoTyF, &A@ 17 #E 2019 '[9 4 (@)
_CHAPTERII
: DIRECT TAXES
e ' - Income-tax _
Amendment 3. Insection 16 of the lncome—taxAct, 1961 (hereafier in this Chapter referred toasthe 43 of 1961;
of section 16.  Income-tax Act), in clause (ia) [as inserted by section 7 of the Finance Act, 2018}, for the

words "forty thousand", the words "fifty thousand" shall be substituted with effect from the
1st day of April, 2020:
Afme_nd'menzt?‘ 4. Insection 23 of the Income-tax Act w1th effect from the 1st day of April, 2020,—
of section 23.
(a)i in sub-section (4),—

_ (i) in the opening portion, for the words "one house”, the 'words "two
houses" shall be substituted; : '

(i} in clause (a), for the word "one", the word “two" shall be substituted;

- (#ii) in clause (b), for the words “other than the house", the words "other
than the house or houses" shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (5), for the words "one year", the words "two years" shall be
substituted.

Amendment - 5 In section 24 of the Income-tax Act, thh effect ﬁ'om the 1st day of April, 2020 —
of section 24. ’

(@) in the first proviso, after the words "the amounts of deduction”, the words

"or, as the case may be, the aggregate of the amount of deduction” shall be inserted;

(&) in'the second proviso, after the words "the amount of deduction”, the words
. "or, as the case may be, the aggregate of the amounts of deduction” shall be inserted;

(c) after the Explanauon to the third proviso, the following proviso shall be
inserted, namely:—

“Provnded also that the aggregate of the amounts of deducnon under the
first and second prov:sos shall not exceed two lakh rupees.”.

13 of 2018.

6. In section 54 of the lncome-taxAct, in sub-section (1), after clause (u'), the following ~ Amendment
pravisos shall be inserted with effect from the '1st day of April, 2020, namely:— - of section 54. _

- Provided that where the amount of the capital gain does not exceed two crore
rupees, the assessee may, at his optior, purchase or construct two. residential houses
in Ind:a, and where such option has Been exercised,—

. (a) the provxsmns of this sub-section shall have effect as if for the words .
"one residential house in India", the words "two res1dennal houses in India"
had been substmxted .

(b) any reference in this sub-section and sub-section (2) to “new asset”
shall be construed as a reference to the two residential houses in India:

Provided further that where during any assessment year, the assessee has
exercised the option referred to inthe first proviso, he shall not be subsequently
entitled to exercise the option for the same or any other assessment yea:

7. In section 80-IBA of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (2), in clause (a), forthe  Amendment
" figures "2019", the figures "2020" shall ‘be substituted with effect from the 1st day of of section

April, 2020,

80-1BA.

8. In section 87A of the Income—tax Act, with effect from the lst day of April, 2020,— " Amendment
of section

(a) for the words "three hundred fi fty thousand", the words “five hundred  g7a.

thousand" shall be -substituted;

(b) for the words, "two thousand and five hundred", the words "twelve thousand :
and five hundred" shall be substituted.

9. In section 194A of the Income-tax Act, in sub-sectlon (3)in clause (i), for the words Amendment

- “ten thousand” wherever they. occur, the words "forty thousand" shall be substituted. ' ‘l’gzﬁ“‘m :

10. In section 194-1 of the Income-tax Act, in the ﬁrst provnso, for the words "one . Aine:i&lmcnt
hundred and eighty thousand rupees"”, the words "two hundred and forty thousand mpees of section

shall be substituted.

1941



9T 4 (@)]

Ty woad, fasid 17 78 2019

103

2 of 1899.

© 2200199

CHAPTERIV
- MISCELLANEOUS
PART}
Mmmnms To THE INDIAN STAMP ACT, 1899

ll The provisions of this Part shall come into force on such date as the Central
'Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette, appoint.

12. Jn section 2 of the Indain Stamp Act, 1899 (hereafter in this Part refcn'ed toas the

pnncxpalAct),
' * (a) for clause (1), the following clauses shall be subsututed, namely —_
. "allotment list" means a list containing details of allotment of the

 section 8 of the Depositories, Act, 1996;
. (JA) “banker" includes a bank and any person acting as a banker, H
(®) in clause (5), the following long line shall be added at thc end, namely —
_ “but does not include a debenmre, ;
(c) after clause (7), the fo]lowmg clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

'(7A) “clearance list" means a list of transactions of sale and purchase -
relating to contracts traded on the stock exchanges submitted to.a clcaring v

corporation in accordance with the law for the time being i in force in thls
behalf;

(7B) clearmg corporatxon" means an entity estabhshed to undertake the
activity of clearing and settlement of transactions in securities or other instruments
and includes a clearing house of a recognised stock exchange;';

(d) after clause (10), the followmg clauses shall be inserted, namely e
(104) “debenturc" includes—

(7) debenture stock, bonds or any other instrument of a company
“evidencing a debt, whether constltutmg a charge on the assets of the -
company of nof;,

(i) bonds in the nature of dc’oenture issued by any mcorporated :

company or body corporate;

(iid) certificate of deposit, commerclal usance bxll, commercial paper
and such other debt instrument of original or initial maturity upto one year
- asthe Reserve Bank of India may specxfy from time to time; -

(iv) securltls_ed debt mstmments, and

" (v) any other debt instuments specified by the Securities and
Exchange Board of India from time to tlme,

[¢] OB) “depository" includes—

(a) a depository as defined in clause (¢) of sub-sectxon (1) of section 2 of
" the Depositories Act, 1996; and'

(b) any other entity declared by the Central Govemment, by notification in
the Official Gazette, to be a depository for the purposes of this Act;';

- (e) in clause (12), the words and figures "and includes attribution of electronic
record within the meaning of section 11 of the Informanon T cchnologyAct, 2000" shall
_ be inserted at the cnd o .

" securities intimated by the issuer to the depository under sub—sectxon (2) of

Commeniccrnent

~ of this Part.

Amendment
of section 2.

22 of 1996.

21 of 2000.



104 - ARYEE o, fastia 17 18 2019

[T 4 (@)

() for clause (/4), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—
'(/4) "instrament” includes—

() every document, by which any right or liability is, or purports.to
be, created, transferred, limited, extended, extinguished or recorded;

(b)a documexit electronic or otherwise, created for a transaction in
a stock exchange or depository by which any right or liability is, or purports
to be, created, transferred, limited, extended, extinguished or recorded; and

«© any other document menuoned in Schedule I

but does not include such instruments as may be specified by the Government
"by notification in the Ofﬁcial Gazettc 3 :

® after clause { 5) the followmg clause shall be inserted, namely —_
| - Y(154) "issuer" means any person makmg an issue of securmes, 3
h) for clause (164), the followmg ¢lauses shall be substituted, namely —

U 6A) “marketable security" means a secunty capable of bemg traded in
any stock exchange in India;

(I 68) "market value", in relation to an instrument through which— .

(a) any security is traded in a stock exchange, means the pnce at’
which it is so traded;

(&) any security which is transferred through a depos1tory but riet
traded in the stock exchange means the price or the conmderatxon
mentioned in such instrument;

~ (¢) any security is dealt otherwise than in the stock exchange or-

deposntory, means the price or consideration mentioned in such mstrument
(9) afier clause (23), the followmg clause shall be mserted namely:—"
'(234) "securities” includes— '

(i) securities as defined in'clause (%) of séction 2 of the Securities

42 of 1956. - _'Comracts (Regulation) Act, 1956;
. " (zi) a "derivative" as-defined i in clause (a) of sectxon 45U of the
2 of 1934. ~.° Reserve Bank of India Act, 1934; :

(m) acertificate of deposit, commercial usance blll commerclal paper,

repo on corporate bonds and such other debt instrument of original or

- initial maturity upto one year asthe Reserve Bank of India may specxfy
- from time to time; and

(iv) any other instrument declared by the Central Govemment, by

notification in the Official Gazeite, to be sécurities for the purposes of this

Act;
(7) after clause (26), the followmg clause shall be inserted, namely o
" (27) "stock exchange" includes—

. () a recognised stock exchange as defined i in clause (/) of section 2
42 of 1956. of the Secuntles Contracts.(Regulation) Act, 1956; and

(u’) such other platform for trading or reporting a deal in securities,
as may be specified by the Central Government, by notification in the
Official Gazette, for the purposes of this Act.".



AT 4 ()] qeAySeT XoT9d, & 17 7§ 2019 105
‘ 13, In section 4 of the principal Act, after sub-section (2), the followmg sub-sectnon Amendment
- shall be inserted, namely:— . of section 4.
' "3 Noththstandmg anything contamed in sub-sections (1) and (2), in the
case of any issue, sale or transfer of securities, the instrument on which stamp-duty is
chargeable under section 9A shall be the principal instrument for the purpose of this -
section and no stamp-duty shall be charged on any other msn'uments relating to any .
such transaction.”.
_ 14. For section 8A of the prmmpal Act, the fouowmg section shall be subsututed * Substitution
namely:— of few
section for
" section 8A.
'8A. Notwnthstandmg anythlng contamed in, this Act or any other law for the -~ Securities
tlme being in force,— . dealt in
depository
(@) an issuer, by the issue of securities to one or more deposxtones, shall,  not liable 1
stamp-duty.

22 of 1996.

Insertion of
~new Part AA.

-Instruments
chargeable
_with duty for
transactions
in stock
exchanges
and

depositories. -

in respect of such issue, be chargeable with duty on the total amount of securities

issued by it and such securities. need not be stamped; -

)] the transfer of registered ownership of securities from a person to a
depository or from a depository to a beneficial owner shall not be liable to duty. .

Explananon.-——For the purposes of this section, the expression "beneficial
ownership" shall have the same meaning as assigned to it in clause (a) of
sub-section (1) of section 2 of the Depositories Act, 1996.",

15.In Chapter Hofthe principal Act, after PanAreIanngto ‘Of the habxhty ofmsmﬂnenw
- to duty the following Part shall be inserted, ‘namely:— :

'AA—Of the liability of mstruments of transaction in stock exchanges and

depostlorzes to duty-
9A (1) Notwithstanding anything contamed in this Act,—

(a) when the sale of any securities, whether delivery based or -
otherwise, is made through a stock exchange, the stamp-duty on each _.
such sale in the clearance list shall be collected on behalf of the State
Government by the stock exchange or a clearing corporation authorised
by it, from its buyer on the market value of such securities at the time of
seitlement of transactions in securities of such buyer, in such manner as

~ the Central Government may, by rules, provide;

(b) when any transfer of securities for a conslderatlon, whether
delivery based or otherwise, is made by a depository otherwise than on
the basis of any transaction referred to in clause (a), the stamp-duty on

- such transfer shall be collected on behalf of the State Government by the
depository from the transferor of such securities on the consideration

~ amount specified therein, in such manner as the Central Government may,
by rules, provide;

(c) when pursuant to issue of securmes, any creatlon or change in -
the records of a depository is made, the stamp-duty on the allotment list
shall be collected on behalf of the State Government by the depository

‘from the issuer of securities on the total market value of the securities as

_ contained in such list, in such manner as the Central Government may, by
 rules, provide. '



106

wegyeer Yorvs, e 17 #E 2019

[T 4 (%)

16. In section 21 of the principal Act,— -

_ (a) for the words “the value of such stock or security according to the averaée
price or the value thereof on the day of the date of the instrument.", the words "the
_market value of such stock or security:" shall be substituted; .

 (b) the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, the instruments

(3) From the date of commencement of this Part, no stamp-duty shall be
charged or collected by the State Government on any note or memorandum or
any other document, electronic or otherwise, -associated with the transactions

mentioned in sub-section (/).

(4) The stock exchange or a clearing corporation authorised by it or the

referred to in sub-section (/) shall be chargeable with duty as provided therein
at the fate specified in Schedule I and such instruments need not be stamped.

depository, as the case may be, shall, within three weeks of the end of each '

month and in accordance with the rules made in this behalf by the Central

_Government, in consultation with the State Government, transfer the stamp-duty -

collected under this section to the State Government where the residence of the

- buyer-is located and in case the buyer is located outside India, to the State

Government having the registered office of the trading member or broker of such
buyer and in case where there is no such trading member of the buyer, to the
State Government having the registered office of the participant:

~ Provided that before such transfer, the stock exchange or the deaﬁng
corporation authorised by it or the depository shall be entitled to deduct such

percentage of stamp-duty towards facilitation charges as may be specified in -

such rules.

: 'Explanatioh.—,'l’he term "participant" shall have the same mezining as
assigned to it in clause (g) of section 2 of the Depositories Act, 1996. '

(5) Bvery stock ‘exchange‘or the clearihg corporation authorised by it and

* depository shall submit to the Government details of the transactions referred to
_ in sub-section (/) in such maoner as the'Central Government may, by rules,

provide.

22 of 1996.

9B. Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act,— - - 'Ir;lstwni.e‘ints
P L , e 5 : . chargeable -
() when any issue of securities is made by an issuer otherwise than  with duty for -

through a stock exchange or. depository, the stamp-duty on each such transactions

H ' ; e regic otherwise -
issue shall be payable by the issuer, at the place where its registered office | " - *) -

is located, on the total market value of the securities o issued at the rate  gyocx

specified in Schedule I;

(&) when any sale or transfer or reissue of securities for consideration
is made otherwise than through a stock exchange or depository, the stamp-
duty on each such sale or transfer or reissue shall be payable by the seller
‘or transferor or issuer, asthe case may be, on the consideration amount
specified in such instrument at the rate specified in Schedule L.".

"Provided that the market value for calculating the stamp-duty shall be, in E

~ the case of—

(i) options in any securities, the premium paid by the buyer;
(i) repo on corporate bonds, interest paid by the borrower; and
- (iif) swap, only the first leg of the cash flow.".

. exchanges
and .
depositories. .

Amendfnent
of section 21.



AT 4 (@)

AeAYRYT o1, &t 17 w5 2019

107

Insertion of
new section
62A.

Penalty for
failure to
comply with
provisions. of
section 9A.

17. Insection 29 of the principal Act,—

(:) in: clause (a), _
[C) the words figures and brackets "No. 27 (Debcnwte)" shall be omitted;

{b) the words, figures, brackets and letter "No. 62 (a) (Transfer of shares in
an incorporated Company or other body corporate)” shall be omitted;

() the words, figures, brackets and letter "No. 62 (b) (Transfer of

debentures, being marketable securities, whether the debenture is liable to duty
~ or not, except debenwres provided for by section 8)" shall be omitted;

(i) in clause (e), after the word "exchange", the words "mcludmg swap” shall be

inserted;-

(i) in clause (f), the word "and" shall be omltted

(iv) after clause (g), the following clauses shall be mserted namely:—
"(k) in the case of sale of secumy through stock exchange, by the buyer of

~ such secumy,

(?) in the case of sale of security otherwise than through a stock exchange,
by the seller of such security;

() inthe case of transfer. of secunty througha deposrtory, by the u'ansferor

~oof such security;

“(k) in the case of transfer of secunty otherwise than through a stock

exchange or depositiory, by the transferor of such security;
()) in the case of issue of security, whether through a stock exchange ora

deposxtory or otherwise, by the issuer of such security; and

(m) in the case of any other instrament not specnf ied herem, by the person' :

makmg, drawmg or executing such mstrumen

18. After section 62 of the prmctpal Act, the followmg section shall be mserted ‘
© pamely:— -

"62A ) Any person who,—

(a) being requlred under sub-section (I ) of section 9A to collect duty, fails
to collect the same; or - : .

(b) being required under: sub-secnon (4 of section 9A to transfcr the duty
to the State Government within fifteen days of the expuy of the txme specified

: therein, fails to transfer within such tirme,

A'-shall be pumshablc with fine which shall not bc less than one lakh rupees, but

- which may extend upto one per cent. of the collection or tmnsfer so defaulted.

. shall be punishable with fine of one lakh rupees for each day durmg which such :

(2) Any person who,—

(a) being required under sul»sectxon (5) of section 9A to subtmt details of -
transactions to the Govemment, fails to submit the same;.or '

()] "submits a document ot makes a declaration which is false or whlch
such person knows or believes to be false, :

failure contmues or one crore rupees, whichever is less.".

- . Amendment

of section 29.



108

[T 4 (@)

Insertion of
new section
73A.

" Power of
Central

Government
to make rules.

Amendment

of section 76.

qeaye Yl XoTaa, faAiw 17 A4 2019
19, After section 73 of the: prmcxpal Act, the followmg section shall be msened,
namely:— .

*73A. () The Central Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette
make rules for carrymg out the provisions of Part AA of Chapter IL

@ Without prejudice to the generality of the provisions of sub—sectxon (I), the
Central Government may make rules for all or any of the following matters, namely —

(a) the manner of collection of stamp-duty on behalf of the State

Governinent by the stock exchange or the clearing corporation authorised by it, -

- from its buyer under clause () of sub-section (7) of section 9A; ,
(b) the manner of collection of stamp-duty on behalf of the State

deernment by the depository from the transferor under clause (b) of

sub-section (/) of section 9A;

(c) the manner of collection of stamp-duty on behalf of the State
Government by the deposntory from the issuer under clause (c) of sub-section 0))
of section 9A; :

(d) the’ tnanner of n-ansfer of stamp-duty to the State Govemment under
sub-section (4) of section 9A; .

" (e) any other maiter which has to be, or may be prov1ded by rules "

20.In sectlon 76 of the prmcxpal Act, after sub-sectlon (2), the following sub-sectnon
shall be inserted, namely:—

"(ZA) Every mle made by the Central Government under tlns Act shalibe lald, as -

soon as may be after it is made, before each House of Parliament, while it is in session,
© for a total period of thirty days which may be comprised in one session or in two or
more successive sessions, and if, before the expiry of the session immediately following
the session or the successive sessions aforesaid, both Houses agree in making any

| _modification in the rule or both Houses agree that the rule should not be made, therule
" shall-thereafter have effect only in such modified form or be of no effect, as the case -
may be; s0, however, that any such modification or ahnulment shall be without prejudlce

to the vahd1ty of anything previously done under that rule

21;'-In Schedule I of the principal Act,— -
(?) inArticle 19; in column (1),—
(a) after the words "CERTIFICATE OR OTHER DOCUMENT", the brackets,

Amendmcnt :
of Schedule 1.

‘words, figures and letter "(except the certificate or other document covered

under Articles 27 and 56A)" shall be inserted;

~ OF SHARES (No. 36)" shall be omitted;

' (i) for Article 27 and the entries relating thereto the following Article and entries
shall be subﬁmtuted namely:— .

| [0 - T
"27. DEBENTURE—{as defined by section 2 (10A)) '
(see sections 9A and 9B)
(a) in case of issue of debenture; - ~ 0.005%

(b) in case of transfer and re-issue of debenture. 0.0001%";

(b) the words, brackets and figures "See a.lso LETTER OFALLOTMENT



109

arT 4 (@)] HeyeeT X7y, f3Ai® 17 98 2019
" (#if) in Article 28, for the entry in column (1), after the words "DELIVERY ORDER
IN RESPECT OF GOODS,", the brackets and words “(excluding delivery order in
respect of settlement of transacnons in securities in stock exchange)" shall be inserted;
(iv) in Article. 36, for the entry in column (1), the following entry shall be
substituted, namely:—
"36. LETTER OF ALLOTMENT inrespect ofany loan tobe ralsed by any
company ¢ or proposed company '
(v) aﬁer Amde 56 and the entry relating thereto the followmgArhcle and entries
shall be mscrted, namely:— .
0 . - )
"56A. SECURITY OTHER THAN DEBENTURES
' (see sections 9A and 9B)—
(a) issue of security other than debenture; ‘ 0.005%
(®) transfer of security other than debenture on delivery basis;  0.015%
(c) transfer of security other than debenture on non-delivéry basis; 0.003%
(d) derivatives— ' ' _ ,
() futures (equlty and commodlty) : o 0.002%
(i) options (eqmty and commodity) 0.003%
(#if) currency and interest rate derivatives’ . - 0.0001%
(iv) other derivatives ' 0.002% . .
() Government securities ) . %
» repo on corporate bonds ‘ 0.00001%";
(w’) inArticle 62, items _(a) and (b) and the entries relating thereto shall be omitted.
PART I L
AMENDMENT TO THE PREVENTION OF MONEY-LAUNDERING Acr, 2002 .
22. In section 8 of the Prevention of Money-laundering Act, 2002, in sub- section 3, Amendment -
th effect from such date as the Central Government may, by not:ﬁcanon in the Official g§ Z“;“;’; :f

zette, appoint,—
- () in clause (a), for the words "ninety days" the words "three hundred and
smty~ﬁve days shall be substituted;

(i) after clause (b), the fouowmg Explanatton shall be inserted, namely:—

" Explanation—For the purposes of computing the period of three hundred
.and sixty-five days under clause (a), the period during which the investigation is
.~ stayed by any court \mder any law for the time being in force shall be excluded "

2003.

ﬁ'ﬂ’)l’cﬁ,WWWWW,WWWWW,W@&@HWW—ZO&



a1 4 ()] qeaye e o, fasid 17 |75 2019 375

ART 8 ()
aifer fram
S ~ATTeR, HEAYQYl Seelqy

No.-A-1 146 Jabalpur, the 3rd May 2019

The following drafl of amendments in regard to “The Madhya Pradesh
Case Flow Management in the Trial Courts and First Appellate Subordinate
Courts (Civil) Rules, 2006, which the High Court of Madhya Pradesh proposes
to make in cxercise of the power conferred by Scction 122 read with Scction 128
of the Code of Civil Proccdure, 1908 (5 of 1908) with the previous approvél of
the State Government is, hercby. published as required by Section 122 of the said
Codc for information of all person likely to be affected thereby and notice is
hereby given that the said draft shall be taken into consideration on the expiry df
30 days from the date of pttblication of this notice in the Madhya Pradesh
Garctte.

Any objection or suggestion. which may be reccived from any person with
tespcct to the said draft of amcndmenté before the expiry of the period specified
above shall be considered by the Registrar General of the High Court of Madhya

Pradcsh, namely:-

AMENDMENT
In the said Rulcs, in Rules 3, in ltem I -- Original Suit:-
1. For sub-rule 1(a), linc no. 1, word “in” shall be substituted by “is”
2. For sub-rule 3, the following sub-rule shall be substituted, namely:-
“3. The calling out round shall commence at 11:00 A.M. and if

the advocate/litigant is not present at the time, the Court
shall procecd ahead as per law and the matter may be
dismissed or 'appropriatc action may'be taken to ensure their -
prescnce’”. |
3. For sub-rule 6, the following sub—rulé shall be substituted, namely:-
“6.  In casc of failure ?t‘ mediation, conciliation or settlement the
casc shall be posted before the Court within a period of 7

days for further proceedings.” -



376

HEAYRYT TOTUH, fris 17 g 2019 [|rT 4 ()

In exercise of powers conferred by Section 477 of the Code of Criminal
Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1994) and in consultation with the High Court of Madhya
Pradesh. the State Government, hereby, makes following amendments in the
Madhya Pradesh Case Flow Management in the Trial Courts and First Appellate
Subordinate Courts (Crirsinal) Rules, 2006, namely:-

AMENDMENT
In the said Rules,
1. In rule 1, for sub-rule (I). the following sub-rule shall be substiluted,
namely:- _
“(1) These rules may be ca;llcd thc’ Madhya Pradesh Case Flow
Management in the Trial Courts and First Appeliate Subordinate

Courts (Criminal) Rules, 2006™.

]

In rules 3, tor clause (a), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-
“(a) Criminal Trials.- Criminal Trials should be classified bascd on offence,
sentence and whether the accused is on bail or in jail. Capital punishment
rapc and cascs involving scxual offences or dowry deaths should be kept in
Track-1.
Track-I (A) -~ Cases under Scheduled Castes and Scheduled Tribes
(Prevention of Adrocities Amcndmenl) Act. 2015, Protection of Children
from Sexual Offences Act. 2012, Juvenile Justice (Care and Protection of
Children). Act 2000 and Juvenile Justice (Care and Protection of Children)
Act, 2015, Scction 138 of Negotiable Instrument Act, 1881, Protection of
Women from Domestic Violencé Act. 2005, Gram Nyayalayas Act, 2008,
Madhya Pradesh Vishesh Nayayalaya Adhiniyam, 2011, Section 125(1) of
Codc of Criminal Procedurc, 1973 and those mentioned in proviso to Section
309(1) of Code of Criminal Procedure shall be disposed of, as far as may be,
within the time prescribed thereunder. A

~An cndeavour shall be made to disposc of the cases under any other
starute expressly providing specific time for disposal, within such time.

Other casces where the accused is not granted bail and is in jail, should-
be kept in Track-11. Cases which affect a large number of persons such as
cascs of mass cheating. cconomic offences, illicit liquor tragedy and food
adulteration cascs, cte. should kept in Track-111. Offences which are tried by
special court such as POTA. TADA, NDPS, Prevention of Corruption Act,
cte. should be kept in Track~1V, Track-V all other offences.

An endeavour should be made to dispose of Track-1 cases within a
period of nine months, Track tl and ‘I'rack Til Casc&within twelve/rr‘onths

and track 1V within fifleen months™.

R. K. VANI, Registrar General.

forziorep, IR R ST S A, TeERe] g AT SR JRONer, S § g qor seiiie-2019.



T 4 ()] eqyRy TN, feiw 17 7E 2019 | | 377

faarm faam

i, feiw 10 w8 2019

F. TF 9-1-2019-Jarchts. —To0 IEH, TAqey wed &% ol fammsdisiet & #a-fawa &g Fremger
fram s ¥ —

1. wifere m, faam oii stva—(1) o fadl o dftm T wewey e F ol faar/schieie & wa-
fosea M, 2019 ®.

(z)amﬁwsﬁwww%mﬁmﬁ?ﬁﬁm%mﬁmﬁmaﬁﬁmﬁami

2. qaien fafeen @ ifew w0 T m— (1)maﬁﬁmmﬁm@m%mﬁm%
ARl Hgguel w1 fulg femn s —

1. s fomrm L
2. e AfirayefiEm (Aefrante) - W\
3. R T fomrrRefieeX ’ - W=
4. Tl YU - W&
5. JUTRE AR/ - wEE e

(2) 39 WENE ¥ ol or dmiten Geasll iUl WEA % 3 SUHA & akelh! MRl w1 o WEAR
fern sn =&

3. % ¥ Fom AeliRiet & deh-itet Weguel ot Frefvor —osa e & Tl fomr/Refiaier & s
¥ I AFeuEl 1 i, T5T WA % fad Swfi, wRw % weE sgei/afeedl i fefa # gfoa w@a g
3T dEART GEEEl qor onfde dueAl % ufdem A HER R SRM. s g P @ sifveafw
{(Expression of Interest (EOI)} smqs fommm g swifa # sma, fgen webrar fawria deemge aon <@
¥ wfafa R o fem s, sifvefa &t sfeafa (EOI) & Wi srfien 1 g w&d ge %9 6 s
T fomm/Aeiwied @t faaforr (SivR), ST qean e et Qu # dem, It g, sifar/enaws el
T SR YU, SMYfd B -, ST Sfua SAEr/HYR0 /Y MEvEE qeh-ichl I SIS o oS
e HT aeht AFRUEl (technical specifications) #1 sifed &9 fear stam.

4. forra g famAclieier & wreel & Fafon—(1) T T & farRdeed & faea '
iyl ae-ftent YA G g0 FaR R SR, $9 ¥ SifRdE oA w1 S fasha fRd W At fomry
efmier & ffar g Fuife org, SE% ST &t T srafy, aeR # yeiad e SN asl W g @l g
T afafd g R S

(2) aFrenr witfa g aereid RFP 1 9eq sFmT S



378 HeyeH UST9H, T 17 |8 2019 (w4 (1)

s.mmmmw.—m)'g@zﬁaﬁawamﬁn%avﬁwﬁrmﬁﬁm%mm'
TG TR SR —

1 qeA wfaa - G|
2. yq@ af=a, fom - , 3«’1
3. yq@ afua, fafy — B2
4 @ dfad, foarm — e gfea.

(2) HemerTer BN e et @ ffor s {(Request for Proposal (RFP)} & AT 9§ TRl
T fadia v e foed Sa.

(3) SureEerd W aeE G RFP @ W ff st &1 wem e e % wem ¥ e
afea #) sreagar § nfea wfifa =i g&ga wO.

(4) afbfa g faxita yea ) ST i S

(5) favmr g eivew ¥ Wight ¥ s wafE TR W R, ived ¥ R & w9
F1 IHRT W B WM % SUUW o faurA g wafta deen @ 3% wRa e sifta feskavafafify & wny
fafaer waf & orgew famRAsiiet & %9 &t FREE & &N,

6. T /EeftenieT &1 fama—(1) fifag v (RFP) % wed 1 7&r 9fag &t sreaear ® 7ifsa |fifa
B STgHte fean s — _

1 & gfad — Y
2. i afa, faw - W
3. @ dfea, fafy — e
4 YE |i|d, famm — wew ufua.

(2) U=mere™ w1 aw-iet wfafa um fafeer st Proposal (RFP) &1 wligwr & oged, famme &
merH § g wiag Y e | Wfed wikfa @l wegd wOi.

(3) wm faxita sl w0 wfafa g srEEn &t Seeh. fawm g weidew @ Wil v weitieda dafe
y&a B SR, Wi @ fomr/teiwier & faha 1 oHed WH B 9N ¥ IW IgE famre gR st
Gey/sae aiafity & @y ffa waf & ogey faamReiwiet & farg # sriar! #t s,

7. e @ sgfa—(1) SWew &9y § @ § yE@ WW@@%%W
e 1 e, 2000 TaggRT fed @t SR R.

(2) Sw fuga & Frfoa ) g o, ST IftRET & o w W fRe AW @ fed wlaE ¥ dey |
%maﬁmﬁ%wﬁwbﬁ_mm%ﬁ%aﬁqaﬁﬂﬁi ,

TEAYRY ¥ TSI F 9 ¥ a1 SSUER,
: TAFhTd HYad, R |idd,

forisres, W HROT qA oREe GRRR, HEYeT G N KT HEUIeH, Wi 9 gfKd a1 yehifa—2019



